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Foreword 
 
Over the past three decades, Africa's preoccupation with development has had 
only marginal success. Most Africans are worse off than they were, health and 
nutrition problems are widespread, and infrastructure is eroding. Many studies 
have suggested causes for these problems: colonialism, corruption, insufficient 
technical assistance, unfavorable terms of trade, inadequate entrepreneurial 
skills, and incompetent management, among others. But Claude Ake believes 
that political conditions are the greatest obstacle to development.  

In most of Africa, colonial rule left a legacy of intense commitment to 
independence but few ideas regarding appropriate economic policies. 
Immediately after the new nations achieved independence, the political 
environment was hostile to development. The internal struggle for power was 
the absolute focus of attention. But the new leaders soon realized that they 
needed some new legitimizing theme to replace liberation ideology, and they 
settled on economic development as a natural alternative. With sparse 
resources of their own to work with, however, they looked to foreign powers to 
finance their aspirations and thereby reintroduced in the economic context 
some of the issues of dependence that they had settled in the political context. 

Ake gives an overview of the development policies that have ensued and 
documents the pattern of failure. He examines the alternatives that can be 
considered: economic development based on traditional agriculture, political 
development based on decentralization of power, and reliance on indigenous 
communities to provide some refuge from the centralized state. His purpose is 
to outline the fundamental redesign he believes will be necessary. 

Claude Ake is director of the Centre for Advanced Social Science in Port 
Harcourt, Nigeria. He completed this manuscript during his fellowship term as 
a visiting scholar with the Africa Project at the Brookings 
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1 
 

The Development  
Paradigm and Its  
Politics 

Three decades of preoccupation with development in Africa have yielded 
meager returns. African economies have been stagnating or regressing. For 
most Africans, real incomes are lower than they were two decades ago, health 
prospects are poorer, malnourishment is widespread, and infrastructure is 
breaking down, as are some social institutions. 

Many factors have been offered to explain the apparent failure of the 
development enterprise in Africa: the colonial legacy, social pluralism and its 
centrifugal tendencies, the corruption of leaders, poor labor discipline, the lack 
of entrepreneurial skills, poor planning and incompetent management, 
inappropriate policies, the stifling of market mechanisms, low levels of 
technical assistance, the limited inflow of foreign capital, failing commodity 
prices and unfavorable terms of trade, and low levels of saving and investment. 
These factors are not irrelevant to the problem. Alone or in combination they 
could be serious impediments to development. 

However, the assumption so readily made that there has been a failure of 
development is misleading. The problem is not so much that development has 
failed as that it was never really on the agenda in the first place, By all 
indications, political conditions in Africa are the greatest impediment to 
development. In what follows I consider how African politics has been 
constituted to prevent the pursuit of development and the emergence of 
relevant and effective development paradigms and programs. 
 

The Political Legacy of Colonialism 
To understand this phenomenon, one must begin with colonialism and its 

political legacy. Colonialism in Africa was markedly different from the  
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colonial experiences of the Americas, Europe, and Asia. To begin with, it was 
unusually statist, The colonial state redistributed land and determined who 
should produce what and how. It attended to the supply of labor, sometimes 
resorting to forced labor; it churned out administrative instruments and 
legislated taxes to induce the breakup of traditional social relations of 
production, the atomization of society, and the process of proletarianization. It 
went into the business of education to ensure that workers could do the jobs 
they were required to perform and would remain steadfast in the performance 
of their often tedious and disagreeable tasks. It built roads, railways, and ports 
to facilitate the collection and export of commodities as well as the import of 
manufactured goods. It sold commodities through commodity boards. Indeed, 
it controlled every aspect of the colonial economy tightly to maintain its power 
and domination and to realize the economic objectives of colonization. 

Since the colonial state was called upon by the peculiar circumstances of 
the colonial situation to carry out so many functions -indeed to do everything-it 
was all powerful. It needed to be all powerful not only to carry out its mission 
but also to survive along with the colonial order in the face of the resentment 
and the hostility of the colonized, a hostility that occasionally broke out into 
rebellions such as the Mau Mau insurrection in Kenya. 

The power of the colonial state was not only absolute but arbitrary. For 
instance, the colonial governments made the colonies produce the commodities 
they needed. When the Gold Coast (now Ghana) was colonized, it did not farm 
cocoa. The colonial government decided that the country would be suitable 
ground for farming cocoa and duly introduced the crop. In 1865 the country 
started exporting cocoa, and by 1901 it was the leading producer of the 
commodity in the world. It quickly became a monocultural cocoa economy; by 
1939 cocoa accounted for 80 percent of the value of its exports. In Kenya, the 
Coffee Plantation Registration Ordinance of 1918 forbade the growing of 
coffee, the country's most profitable commodity, by Africans. The purpose was 
to make Africans available for wage labor by keeping them from becoming 
independent producers as well as to prevent them from stealing coffee from 
European farms by ensuring they could not legally possess coffee. Other 
examples of arbitrariness include the reservation of the White Highlands in 
Kenya for European farmers and the Marketing of Native Produce Ordinance 
of 1935, which restricted wholesale marketing to Europeans and barred 
Africans. 
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These two features of state power, its absolutism and its arbitrariness, 
framed colonial politics. As if to underscore the arbitrariness of the power of 
the colonial state, its officials showed hardly any interest in transforming 
domination into hegemony, beyond the notion that their domination was also a 
civilizing mission. The colonial situation was not unlike Hobbes's prepolitical 
state, in which all claims are arbitrary and all rights are only powers. In the 
essentially military situation of imposing and maintaining colonial domination, 
the colonizers had no choice but to reject in principle any restrictions on their 
use of power. There may have been circumstances in which the use of state 
power was not arbitrary in practice, but it was always arbitrary in principle. 

Since the colonial state was for its subjects, at any rate, an arbitrary power, 
it could not engender any legitimacy even though it made rules and laws 
profusely and propagated values. Accordingly, in struggling to advance their 
interests, the colonial subjects did not worry about conforming to legality or 
legitimacy norms. Colonial politics was thus reduced to the crude mechanics of 
opposing forces driven by the calculus of power. For everyone in this political 
arena, security lay only in the accumulation of power. The result was an 
unprecedented drive for power; power was made the top priority in all 
circumstances and sought by all means. As the rulers and subordinates 
extended their rights to their powers, the idea of lawful political competition 
became impossible, and politics was inevitably reduced to a single issue: the 
determination of two exclusive claims to rulership. This politics hardly 
encouraged moderation and compromise. 
 

The Postcolonial Situation 
Although political independence brought some change to the composition 

of the state managers, the character of the state remained much as it was in the 
colonial era. It continued to be totalistic in scope, constituting a statist 
economy. It presented itself as an apparatus of violence, had a narrow social 
base, and relied for compliance on coercion rather than authority. 

With few exceptions, the gaining of independence was not a matter of the 
nationalists' marshaling forces to defeat colonial regimes. More often than not, 
it was a matter of the colonizers' accepting the inevitable and orchestrating a 
handover of government to their chosen African successors, successors who 
could be trusted to share their values and be attentive to their interests. This 
approach did not succeed in all places 



where the decolonization was peaceful, much less where it was occasioned by 
revolutionary struggle. But on the whole, political independence in Africa was 
rarely the heroic achievement it was made out to be; it was often a convenience 
of deradicalization by accommodation, a mere racial integration of the political 
elite. 

The tendency to reproduce the past was reinforced by the dispositions of 
the dominant social forces in the postcolonial era. None of them apparently had 
any serious interest in transformation, and all of them were only too aware that 
they could not afford to broaden the social base of state power. What changed 
over time was the proliferation and intensification of conflict within the 
nationalist coalition. Class conflict became more salient with the indigenization 
of the political elite and matured rapidly. It was deepened by the inevitable 
depoliticization of the nationalist movement to contain frustrations arising from 
the failure to effect the societal transformation that many had hoped for and 
fought for. As is clear from many speeches and writings of nationalist leaders, 
such as Kwame Nkrumah's "I Speak for Freedom," A. A. Nwafor Orizu's 
"Renascent Africa," and Jomo Kenyatta's "Facing Mount Kenya," the language 
of nationalism had been radical, propounding distributive, egalitarian, and 
democratic values. 

The nationalist movement was essentially a coalition of disparate groups 
united by their common grievances against colonial oppression. It was 
typically a network of nationalities, ethnic groups, religious organizations, 
syncretistic movements, secondary organizations, and professional interest 
groups.1 But even though they cooperated against the colonial regime, their 
relationship was never free from tension and conflict. 

As the prospects for political independence improved, the solidarity of the 
movement grew weaker and competition between its component units became 
more intense. Although the members of the coalition fought against the 
colonial power, they worried about the enormous power they were trying to 
wrestle from it, power they could not entrust to any one of them or even share 
in a way that could reduce political anxiety, The normative, institutional, and 
ideological mechanisms that would have made this power subject to 
constitutional constraints and accountability did not yet exist. So while 
agitating to overthrow the colonial regime, the constituent elements of the 
coalition were also trying to block one another from appropriating it. 
Increasingly their attention turned from the colonial regime to one another, and 
eventually the competition among these  
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groups came to dominate Political life, while the colonial power, now resigned 
to the demise Of colonialism, became a referee rather than the opponent. 

By the time independence was achieved in the early 1960s, the centrifugal 
tendencies had grown strong enough in many countries (for instance ,Nigeria, 
Kenya, Ghana, Ivory Coast, Sierra Leone, Zambia, Uganda, Cameroon, and 
Zaire) threaten not Only the transition to independence but, more important, 
the political viability of the new governments in trying to deal with these forces 
of disunity, some African countries, like Nigeria, came to independence with 
such complex constitutions that systemic breakdown was inevitable. 

But for the Purpose here, which is to understand the Postcolonial state and 
the politics associated with it, what is pertinent is not so much centrifugalism 
as the political competition arising from the mutual alienation of the coalition 
partners. As they Pulled apart, they placed more value on capturing Political 
power for themselves and grew increased fearful about what seemed to them to 
be the grave consequences of losing to their rivals in the competition for the 
control of state Power. Thus the premium on Political Power rose higher and 
higher and with it the intensity of political competition and its domination by 
efficiency norms. 

The Political leaders, too, were exposed to new conflicts. The increasing 
competition and conflict among nationalities, ethnic groups, and communal 
and interest groups was reflected in their ranks. They also tended to separate 
along those lines; indeed, many of them had sought Power by Politicizing 
national, ethnic, and communal formations. Now in office, some of them 
manipulated ethnic and communal loyalties as a way to deradicalize their 
followers and contain the emerging class division of political society, which 
could isolate and destroy them. So they began to place emphasis on vertical 
solidarities across class lines. In particular, they tried to establish mutual 
identity and common cause by appealing to national, ethnic, communal, and 
even religious loyalties. 

In doing so, they weakened the solidarity of the people, at a great cost. 
They created not only strong divisions within their own ranks but strong 
antipathies and exclusivity in society. As always, the exclusivity of the 
competing political formations increased the premium on Political power and 
the intensity of political competition. 

Political intensity was further reinforced by the tendency to use state power 
for accumulation. This practice was associated with the weak material base of 
the new political leaders, who had be, economically 
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marginalized by the discriminatory economic policies of the colonial regime. 
Even when they came to power, they had little experience of entrepreneurial 
activity and little or no capital. Invariably they were obliged to explore the one 
leverage they had: control of state power to strengthen their material base. 

The need for a more secure material base drove the indigenous elite to 
increase the statism of the economy. An increasing range of economic 
activities was brought under the control of the state, notably by nationalization, 
to facilitate the appropriation of wealth by means of state power, The use of 
state power for accumulation, associated as it is with statism, monopoly power, 
and the interposition of coercion in the labor process, raised to new heights the 
premium on the capture of state power. 

Finally, political intensity received additional impetus from the alienation 
of leaders from followers in the postcolonial era. Basically the political elite 
dealt with the tide of popular discontent arising from the deradicalization of the 
nationalist movement by enforcing political conformity through coercion. 
Coercion was used to constrain the political expression of the masses, now 
disillusioned with the performance of their leaders. Coercion was also used to 
impose "political unity" in the midst of considerable social pluralism, which 
had become very divisive for being politicized and exploited by competing 
elites. 

The dominant faction of the political elite found itself utterly isolated, 
increasingly relying on violence, at war with the rest of society and with rival 
factions among its own ranks. Political competition now assumed the character 
of warfare and paved the way for the ascendancy of the specialists of violence, 
the military. The rash of military coups that came later essentially formalized a 
reality that was already firmly established. It was not the military that caused 
military rule in Africa by intervening in politics; rather, it was the character of 
politics that engendered military rule by degenerating into warfare, inevitably 
propelling the specialists of warfare to the lead role. 

To recapitulate, at independence the form and function of the state in 
Africa did not change much for most countries in Africa. State power remained 
essentially the same: immense, arbitrary, often violent, always threatening. 
Except for a few countries such as Botswana, politics remained a zero-sum 
game; power was sought by all means and maintained by all means. Colonial 
rule left most of Africa a legacy of intense and lawless political competition 
amidst an ideological void and a rising tide of disenchantment with the 
expectation of a better life. 
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The Implications of Politics 
It is easy to see that the political environment at independence was 

profoundly hostile to development. The struggle for power was so absorbing 
that everything else, including development, was marginalized. Those who 
were out of power constantly worried about their exposure to every kind of 
assault by a state that was hardly subject to any constitutional or institutional 
restraints. Since what mattered in this type of politics was the calculus of force, 
the out-of-power elites strove constantly to put together a credible force to 
challenge those in power, or, at any rate, to limit their own vulnerability to 
harassment and abuse. In a highly statist postcolonial polity, they did not even 
have the option of channeling their ambitions into economic success, which 
was primarily a matter of state patronage. To become wealthy without the 
patronage of the state was likely to invite the unpleasant attention of those in 
control of state power. Political power was everything; it was not only the 
access to wealth but also the means to security and the only guarantor of 
general well-being. For anyone outside the hegemonic faction of the political 
elite, it was generally futile to harbor any illusions of becoming wealthy by 
entrepreneurial activity or to even take personal safety for granted. For anyone 
who was part of the ruling faction, entrepreneurial activity was unnecessary, 
for one could appropriate surplus with less risk and less trouble by means of 
state power. 

Besieged by a multitude of hostile forces that their authoritarianism and 
exploitative practices had engendered, those in power were so involved in the 
struggle for survival that they could not address the problem of development. 
Nor could they abandon it. For one thing, development was an attractive idea 
for forging a sense of common cause and for bringing some coherence to the 
fragmented political system. More important, it could not be abandoned 
because it was the ideology by which the political elite hoped to survive and to 
reproduce its domination. Since development was the justification for rallying 
behind the current leadership, for criminalizing political dissent, and for 
institutionalizing the single-party structure, to abandon it would undermine the 
power strategy of the elite. 

The elite responded to this dilemma by making token gestures to 
development while trying to pass on the responsibility for development to 
foreign patrons. Thus while African leaders talked about the fragility of 
political independence and the need to buttress it by self-reliant development,  
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they eagerly embraced economic dependence. in time, this frame of mind led to 
the conception of development as something to be achieved through changes in 
the vertical relations between Africa and the wealthy countries: a greater flow 
of technical assistance to Africa, more loans on better terms, more foreign 
investment in Africa, accelerated transfer of technology, better prices for 
primary commodities, greater access to Western markets, and so forth. 

In this spirit, African governments expected a large portion of their 
development budget to be financed externally. That was true even for those 
countries such as Tanzania whose leaders seemed conscious of the need for 
self-reliance. For instance, Tanzania's first post independence plan of 1964, the 
first phase of an ambitious fifteen-year development plan, projected an 
expenditure of $285.7 million for the plan period, of which $222.7 million, or 
78 percent, was to come from external sources. 
 

The Development Paradigm 
The new leaders of independent Africa knew that to hold on to their power 

and to divert their people from demands for redistribution and for the structural 
transformation of the colonial economy, they had to find something to replace 
the nationalist ideology of self-government, something that would, they hoped, 
create a sense of common purpose. In the end, they settled for the ideology of 
development. How did that come about? 

Commitment to development, however vaguely conceived, was already 
implicit in the ideology of the nationalist movement. Without exception, all the 
nationalist leaders believed that one important lesson to be learned from the 
humiliation of colonization was the need to overcome not only political 
weaknesses but also military, economic, and technological ones. The writings 
of such leaders as Leopold Senghor of Senegal, Nnamdi Azikiwe of Nigeria, 
Julius Nyerere of Tanzania, Amilcar Cabral of GuineaBissau, and Jomo 
Kenyatta of Kenya expressed the urgent need for African societies to become 
more competitive in the modern state system, a need often crudely expressed as 
"catching up with the West." 

At the same time, the former colonial masters were also promoting the idea 
of development. For when the rising tide of nationalism showed that 
colonialism could not survive, they had contrived the concept of partnership in 
development to maintain a presence and some leverage in the colonies and to 
gain allies in the battle against communism. 

In this supportive international environment, African leaders adopted 
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the ideology of development to replace that of independence. But as it turned 
out, what was adopted was not so much an ideology of development as a 
strategy of power that merely capitalized on the objective need for 
development. African leaders, such as Kenyatta and Nyerere, argued that now 
that independence had been won, the overriding task was development, without 
which political independence could not be consolidated and African countries 
would not be able to eradicate the humiliation of colonization. Against the 
pressure for redistribution, they argued that what was needed was hard work to 
further development, because the surplus had to be produced before it could be 
shared. The emphasis was shifted to a dedication to hard work; East African 
leaders changed the nationalist slogan from Uhuru (freedom) to Uhuru na Kaze 
(freedom means hard work). 

The hard work was to be done literally in silence; the overriding necessity 
of development was coupled with the overriding necessity for obedience and 
conformity. African leaders insisted that development needs unity of purpose 
and the utmost discipline, that the common interest is not served by 
oppositional attitudes. It was easy to move from there. To the criminalization 
of political opposition and the establishment of single party systems. 

The ideology of development was exploited as a means for reproducing 
political hegemony; it got limited attention and served hardly any purpose as a 
framework for economic transformation. Of course, development plans were 
written and proclaimed. But what passed for development plans were 
aggregations of projects and objectives informed by the latest fads of the 
international development community such as import substitution and export 
promotion. As these fads changed in the larger world, so they were abandoned 
in Africa. 

The ideology of development itself became a problem for development 
because of the conflict between its manifest and latent functions. The conflict 
is apparent in the actions of African leaders who proclaimed the need for 
development and made development the new ideology without necessarily 
translating it into a program of societal transformation. They did so not because 
they were uninterested in societal transformation but because their minds were 
absorbed in the struggle for power and survival. 

In the end it fell to the West to supply a development paradigm. What was 
supplied was a more specific form of a broader Western model of social 
transformation; namely, modernization theory.2 Modernization 
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theory was a complex unity of diversities. Some theorists looked at mod-
ernization in broad social terms,3 and some from a political standpoint.4 Others 
looked at it from an economic perspective, in which case the periodicity and 
the evolutionary approach that are a conspicuous element of modernization 
theory were less so.5 

In its most common form, modernization theory posits an original state of 
backwardness or underdevelopment characterized by, among other things, a 
low rate of economic growth that is at least potentially amenable to alteration 
through the normal processes of capital. This original state of backwardness is 
initially universal. According to the theory, the industrialized countries have 
managed to overcome it. All the other countries could conceivably overcome 
backwardness too if they adopted appropriate strategies. Modernization 
theory-for instance, Rustow's theory of stages-assumes that progress tends to 
be spatially diffused, a process by which more and more countries evolve from 
the state of backwardness, capitalizing on the experience of those that 
developed before them. The spatial distribution of progress, however skewed at 
any time, is not static but dynamic. By proximity and interaction, progress is 
diffused through space. Progress, or modernity, by its very nature is apt to 
strain beyond its locus, overflowing into the adjacent space and transforming it. 
Thus uneven development is a transitional phenomenon that can be removed 
sooner or later by creating certain favorable conditions within the underde-
veloped regions and by ensuring the appropriate interactions between them and 
the developed regions. 

Without exception, modernization theory used an evolutionary schema that 
regarded the ideal characteristics of the West as the end of social evolution. 
This meant that, reduced to essentials, the development of the backward parts 
of the world was also implicitly a matter of becoming Western. But since the 
theorists viewed development, not westernization (that was only implicit), as a 
state of being that is objectively good and universally desirable, they did not 
seem culturally biased. When modernization theory came in conflict with the 
divergent social structures in the third world, the modernization theorists talked 
simply of making the structure of the backward country identical to Western 
ones. When the theorists encountered cultural resistance, they proclaimed the 
need for the modernization of attitudes. As a result, the theory did not come to 
terms with the historical specificities of backward countries. 
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In the version of modernization theory applied to Africa, such as W. W. 
Rustow's Stages of Economic Growth (1960), development replaces 
modernization, the state of backwardness is regarded as preindustrial, the 
movement to overcome it becomes the process of economic growth to be 
engineered by neoclassical tools; and the end of social evolution-that is, 
modernity-means industrialization and high mass consumption. In the postwar 
period, when the development of the third world came into vogue, 
development thinking leaned more toward John Maynard Keynes than toward 
the classical tradition. By the late 1950s the orientations and assumptions of 
development thinking had become more structuralist. 

The development paradigm was initially characterized by a distrust of the 
price mechanism and an interest in aggregate variables and the interventionist 
role of the state. The general concern was how the growth of national income 
could be facilitated by the state and how aggregate variables could be 
manipulated, especially in the manner of the Harrod Domar model. Influential 
economists such as Ragnar Nurske saw development and growth largely as a 
matter of industrialization. Some could not quite distinguish between 
industrialization and development; others such as Rustow confused both with 
westernization. Attention was focused on increasing the wealth of the nation 
rather than on the welfare of people, a focus shared by most African leaders, 
such as Nkrumah and Kenyatta, who were concerned about catching up with 
the West. 

One might talk of a second phase in development thinking beginning in the 
1970s, when structuralism came under pressure for emphasizing 
industrialization to the neglect of agriculture, and national wealth to the neglect 
of welfare. In the light of the criticisms, more attention was paid to such social 
issues as employment, income distribution, and rural development. This 
change was officially recognized by the United Nations when it proclaimed the 
1970s as the second United Nations development decade. However, the change 
was only superficial. Behind the veneer of a new critical awareness, the 
reduction of development to economic growth and a decidedly neoclassical 
notion of economic growth continued. 

Strangely, the neoclassical paradigm prevailed and was not seriously 
questioned even as African economies continued to deteriorate. The growth 
rate in the manufacturing sector, which was 8.5 percent in 1960-65, declined to 
3.6 percent in 1980-81 and to 0.4 percent in 1982-83, The growth rate of the 
mining sector, which was 18.5 percent in 1965, fell to - 13.2 percent in 
1981-82 and to - 24.6 percent in 1982-83. In agriculture, the growth rate 
declined from 1.4 percent in 1960-65 to 0.4 percent in 1982-83. In the food 
sector, the growth rate declined from 
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1.6 percent in 1960-65 to 0.2 percent in 1982-83. Food self-sufficiency ratios 
dropped from 98 percent in the 1960s to 86 percent in 1980.6 

One would have expected the poor performance of African economies to 
have undermined confidence in the received neoclassical paradigm. But far 
from being undermined, the validity of the paradigm was asserted so 
aggressively that the prospect of using another paradigm could no longer be 
seriously entertained. For as African economies declined, they became more 
vulnerable and more dependent on the international development agencies, 
whose response to Africa's worsening crisis was to affirm the old paradigm in a 
more doctrinaire form. 
 

Implications of the Paradigm 
The development paradigm was severely limited by the political interests 

that produced it, interests that were often in conflict with the quest for 
development. One significant limitation was that the paradigm conceives 
development as an autonomous process, independent of politics, culture, and 
institutional framework. Conceiving development in this way allowed the 
African leadership unrestricted liberties. They could appropriate selectively 
from African traditional institutions and culture, using what served them best 
to maintain and exploit power and discarding the rest thus they used traditional 
institutions and notions of consensus to justify one party system without 
drawing attention to the traditional processes of consultation and participation 
that produced this consensus. 

For the foreign patrons of Africa, this conception of development offered 
the advantage of dehistoricizing development, so that it was easier to represent 
their values and experience as objectively desirable and inevitable. 
Furthermore, their power and legitimacy as agents of development are 
associated with their scientific knowledge of the development process, 
knowledge that is less prone to being questioned when the development 
process is regarded as autonomous. 

In trying to protect their knowledge of the development process from being 
questioned or made relative, the theorists and agents of development greatly 
compromised its scientific value. For by regarding development as an 
autonomous process, they became indifferent to important issues of scientific, 
epistemological, and ontological significance, issues arising from 
development's historical origins as a body of knowledge. They could 



no longer be sensitive to the questions of why development lore made certain 
assumptions, used certain concepts, valued certain aspects of experience and 
not others, focused on certain issues and ignored others, and how it adopted a 
particular discursive practice and particular strategies for ordering experience. 
In effect, they committed themselves to an abstract science of development 
rather than to an applied science. If they had posited the necessity of an applied 
science, they would have had a markedly different scientific tool from the one 
employed with such indifferent results. 

Because the development paradigm largely ignored the specificity and 
historicity of African countries, it put them in a position in which everything 
was relevant to them and nothing was uniquely significant for understanding 
them. Hence the mounting anarchy of development studies and development 
practice in Africa. Bits and pieces borrowed from theories and paradigms 
constructed for other purposes and other kinds of experience, meaningless for 
being incomplete and out of context, were applied in ways and for purposes 
that are not always clear and to realities that defy comparability. 
 

Paradigm and Institutional Framework 
The development paradigm suffered greatly from being indifferent to the 

institutional framework of development. There was little concern about how 
the political structures and practices, the administrative system, or even the 
social institutions of a country might affect its possibility of development. 

But how could one assume that the development process was independent 
of the institutional framework? On closer examination it appears that what was 
assumed was not so much that the institutional framework did not matter as 
that there was no need to pay close attention to it. For the importance of the 
institutional framework is clearly evident in the development paradigm. The 
paradigm acknowledges the significance of the state, the market, the rule of 
law, the financial system, employers and employees, associations, and so on. 
Why then is the paradigm largely indifferent to the institutional framework in 
Africa? One reason might be the teleological nature of the paradigm. It is so 
focused on the state of development and the possibility of development that it 
fails to pay sufficient attention to the realities on the ground. 

Another reason for the indifference might be that it is taken for granted 
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that these African institutions do not vary significantly from their Western 
forms. This misleading assumption could arise from subtle distortions of the 
relationship among language, consciousness, and experience, distortions that 
often arise from ethnocentrism, to which development studies have been prone. 
People so often mistake the word for the thing. When we use phrases such as 
the "state in Africa," we immediately give it the content of our own historical 
experience. Indeed, having named it and given it this content, we feel we have 
already settled the question of what it is, beforehand. We conflate experience 
and reality, form and content, because our knowledge is so tied to our 
language. 

This outlook is a particularly serious obstacle to development in Africa. 
The development paradigm and African development strategies have assumed 
that the so-called modem sector-the state and its apparatus-is not much 
different from what it is in the West. The differences are purely subjective 
factors such as the inefficiency, corruption, and parochialism of officials and 
the authoritarianism of leaders, differences that could be reconciled eventually 
by the logic of capitalism. 

The similarities are more apparent than real, however. The state in Africa 
has been a maze of antimonies of form and content: the person who holds 
office may not exercise its powers, the person who exercises the powers of a 
given office may not be its holder, informal relations often override formal 
relations, the formal hierarchies of bureaucratic structure and political power 
are not always the clue to decision making power. Positions that seem to be 
held by persons are in fact held by kinship groups; at one point the public is 
privatized and at another the private is "publicized," and two or more political 
systems and political cultures in conflict may coexist in the same social 
formation. 

The state-building project and the articulation of the former colonial state 
with indigenous society have given rise to complex institutional forms. 
Indigenous society and the modern structures that the state-building project has 
tried to introduce have been changed, fragmented, and reconstituted in hybrid 
and unique configurations. Often people do not know whether they are dealing 
with transitional phenomena or new complex totalities. The feasibility of 
development strategies and much else besides depends on understanding these 
changes. Because of them the institutional environment in Africa has become 
so complicated and so important in determining how people behave that any 
development paradigm that takes this environment for granted will not be a 
useful tool for the pursuit of development. 
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The Cultural Context 
Culture, like the institutional framework, has been largely ignored as if it, 

too, had no serious implications for the success of development strategies. It is 
easy enough theoretically to discount the cultural factor in the development 
paradigm. But that has been a costly error. African culture has fiercely resisted 
and threatened every project that fails to come to terms with it, even as it is 
acted upon and changed. In the face of this resistance, concerns arose about the 
need to modernize attitudes and culture, a posture that suggests that the way to 
deal with cultural resistance is to abolish traditional culture. Instead of looking 
at traditional culture as something that the development paradigm has to come 
to terms with and even build on positively, many disdained it. 

The more the resistance of African culture became evident, the more the 
agents of development treated it with hostility; and soon enough, they 
construed anything traditional, including the rural people, negatively. They 
castigated peasants for being bound to tradition, for being conservative and 
suspicious of change, for being irrational, unenterprising, superstitious, and too 
subjective and emotional in their attitudes. The impression was given that 
Africans, particularly the rural people, are, by virtue of being themselves, 
enemies of progress, including their own progress, for it is their own peculiar 
characteristics that sustain their underdevelopment. 

Unfortunately, taking this position makes the people and their culture 
problematic rather than the process of development itself. By failing to 
question the development process and the development goal, the development 
paradigm undermines the scientific value of the concept of development and 
produces only tautologies and circularities. For the task of scientific 
investigation is now mainly to assess the possibility of development, a process 
whose end is already determined in a way that also determines the questions 
and answers about the inquiry. The country that is developing or developed has 
the qualities needed for development, and the country that is not developing 
lacks them; this is what is repeated implicitly over and over again. Everything 
is true by definition. One never really knows why and how a country is 
developing or why a country is not developing. 

Because the development paradigm tends to have a negative view of the 
people and their culture, it cannot accept them on their own terms. Its point of 
departure is not what is but what ought to be. The paradigm focuses on the 
possibility of Africa's becoming what it is not and probably 
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can never be. Inadvertently perhaps, it discourages any belief in the integrity 
and the validity of African societies and offers the notion that African societies 
can find validity only in their total transformation, that is, in their total 
self-alienation. 

On a practical level, the result has been demoralizing. To all appearances 
some Africans, especially the acculturated, have internalized the paradigm's 
negative image of themselves as well as notions of the superiority of developed 
societies. Thus it is often assumed in these circles that foreign-made goods are 
better, that foreign experts know better, and that the major business of Africa, 
indeed the only business, is catching up with the industrialized nations. And 
catching up depends heavily on maintaining relations with these nations and 
increasing the resource flows from them to Africa. The lack of self-confidence 
has been obvious in the behavior of many African leaders: Idi Amin's longing 
for white aides; the submissive behavior of senior officials and even heads of 
state to relatively minor officials of foreign governments and development 
agencies; the longing of African leaders for approval in the West; Emperor 
Jean Badel Bokassa's longing for long-forgotten and better-forgotten French 
monarchs; and the decision of some African governments to disallow the 
speaking of African languages and the wearing of African traditional clothes in 
parliament. 

The states of mind that produce such behavior and attitudes cannot be 
conducive to development. Development requires changes on a revolutionary 
scale; it is in every sense a heroic enterprise calling for consummate 
confidence. It is not for people who do not know who they are and where they 
are coming from, for such people are unlikely to know where they are going. 
 

Conclusion 
The political context of the development project has rendered it im-

probable. In postcolonial Africa the premium on power is exceptionally high, 
and the institutional mechanisms for moderating political competition are 
lacking. As a result, political competition tends to assume the character of 
warfare. So absorbing is the struggle for power that everything else, including 
the quest for development, is marginalized. 

The politics that rendered development improbable has made the adoption 
of an ideology of development inevitable. For the political elites struggling to 
maintain their power and to reproduce their domination amid the problems of 
the postcolonial. Era, the ideology of development has been an effective 
strategy of power that addresses the objective neccessity 
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for development. The former rulers of Africa eagerly endorsed this ideology, 
seeing in it the opportunity of a partnership that would allow them to maintain 
influence in the former colonies and promote their interests in the context of 
the cold war. 

As an ideology, development served a dual function. It represented the 
interests of the African political elites and their patrons. At the same time, it 
was an ideology of economic transformation. But the latter was secondary. As 
a basis for economic change, the ideology was shaped decisively by the 
essentially political interests of its proponents; hence it’s many ambiguities and 
contradictions. Development was regarded as an autonomous process, used to 
justify whatever powers and liberties the managers of development wanted to 
give themselves. 

When the ideology was eventually formulated as a paradigm of develop-
ment, a task that the African leaders left to the international development 
community, the paradigm was conveniently abstract. It paid little heed to 
historical specificity and treated the development process as something in no 
way connected to its cultural, institutional, and political context. Again, this 
position was self serving. For the external patrons of the development 
paradigm, its abstract universalism allowed them to package their experience 
as universal and objectively necessary. For African leaders, it secured the 
liberty to use African culture selectively and opportunistically and to adopt 
whatever political institutions and practices suited their convenience. The 
problem was that the qualities that made the development paradigm so 
functional for those purposes also limited its usefulness as a tool of societal 
transformation and economic development. 
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7.2 
A Confusion  
of Agendas 

In the preceding chapter, I argued that the main obstacle to development in 
Africa is political, that the point is not so much that the development project 
has failed as that it never got started in the first place. In what follows, I want 
to elaborate on that point with reference to the conflict over development 
agendas between Africa's rulers and the international development agencies. 

This conflict has stalled the development project by leaving African. 
leaders trapped in the dilemma of choosing between an endogenous agenda 
that they cannot find the means to implement and an exogenous agenda that 
they cannot bring themselves to accept, between what they want to do and 
what they must do. 
 

Problems of Controlling the Development Agenda 
 
As noted, with independence African leaders were in no position to pursue 

development; they were too engrossed in the struggle for survival and the need 
to cope with the many problems threatening their countries and their power. At 
the same time they could not afford to ignore development, since the quest for 
it had become their strategy of power as well as the raison d'être of their 
regimes. Most of them tried to escape from this dilemma by foisting the burden 
of development on other countries and therefore fell into what has become 
known as dependent development. It would have been difficult to avoid 
dependent development in any case because of the integration of African 
economies into the metropolitan economies during the colonial era. Indeed, the 
colonies largely derived their structural coherence, limited as it was, from this 
integration. In themselves, they were structurally disarticulated because they 
had been 

 18



developed as aggregations of enclaves, each linked to the metropolitan 
economy but not necessarily to one another. 

That is not to say that dependent development was predetermined by 
colonialism. The incorporation of African economies into the world capitalist 
system and the structural constraints associated with it did not entirely preclude 
the option of self-reliant development. In the final analysis, dependent 
development was a politically driven decision hinging on considerations of 
political survival, considerations that impelled African leaders to marginalize 
development and even their role in its pursuit. It is indicative of their limited 
commitment to development that with few exceptions, African countries came 
to independence with hardly any discernible vision of development and no 
agenda for its realization. Most of the newly independent countries relied 
heavily on expatriates for their development plans, which were usually 
collections of policy targets and programs that took for granted the validity of 
the inherited economic structure. 

Manpower shortages, especially the dearth of economists, were part of the 
problem. Few African countries had a pool of economists to support public 
policy. Some countries had no universities. In Zambia, where per capita 
income had been one of the highest at independence, the ratio of expatriates 
(mostly macroeconomists) to Zambians on the National Commission for 
Development Planning in 1975 (a decade after independence) was 21 to 4. The 
Zambians were largely junior, both in qualifications and position. In this 
respect Zambia was typical. The dearth of native economists and planners led 
to a reliance on expatriate staff, which in turn caused the reproduction of 
neocolonial notions of development, Not surprisingly, the first-generation 
development plans in Africa, such as Kenya's Development Plan, 1964 (the 
Red Plan), its Development Plan, 1966 (the Green Plan), Tanzania's First 
Five-Year Development Plan, 1964, and Nigeria's First National Development 
Plan, 1962 - 68, simply followed the rhythm of the colonial economy. It would 
appear, however, that manpower constraints were a minor problem compared 
with the dearth of ideas and a weak political will. 

The poverty of ideas was remarkable. Several countries, such as Ghana, 
Angola, and Guinea-Bissau, came to independence with an economic agenda, 
but even there the agenda was largely political. In the end, the international 
development community provided the development paradigm and agenda for 
Africa. For the vast majority of African countries, the one thing new in the 
early years of independence was some concern for indigenizing the public 
service and giving the local middle class better 
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opportunities to participate in the economy. Even then this concern was more 
of a reflex action than a doctrine. It was not until 1965 (two years after 
independence) that the Kenyatta government brought out a paper expressing 
some rudimentary ideas of development.1 But this merely rationalized the 
mixed economy of Kenya. 

In Tanzania a vision of development was evident in the Arusha Declaration 
(1967), which proclaimed African socialism. In Zambia, a vision was evident 
in President Kenneth Kaunda's philosophy of humanism in his Mulungushi 
Declaration of 1968. In both instances, these departures, relatively bold by 
prevailing standards, were essentially reactions to disappointments with the 
West's lukewarm support. As Zambia's White Paper of 1964 and Tanzania's 
First Five-Year Development Plan, 1964 indicate, both countries had chosen 
the capitalist road to development with expectations of massive financial and 
technical assistance from the West. But those expectations did not materialize. 

Zambia and Tanzania, as well as one or two other countries, attempted to 
regain control of the development agenda but did not succeed. The case of 
Zambia illustrates the fate of such attempts. Initially Zambia had followed the 
old-style colonial management of the economy in what has been described as 
Zambia's "classical neocolonial phase.”2 In the wake of President Kaunda's 
disillusion with the multinationals, especially the mining companies and 
Western governments, he made the Mulungushi speech and embarked on 
indigenization, nationalization, and a "basic needs strategy" that he called 
humanism. He soon found that the Zambian economy was so dependent that 
pushing for full control of it by Zambians would be unrealistic. In the end he 
settled for 51 percent government control of the major corporations. 

The mining companies were nationalized under the Zambia Consolidated 
Copper Mines, later known as the Zambia Industrial and Mining Corporation. 
In doing so, Zambia incurred a huge debt in compensation payments to foreign 
shareholders and the hostility of the expatriates who controlled the 
management, technology, and production in the mines. This hostility forced 
Zambia to retreat from its ambitious goals to the point that by 1982 the 
program of indigenization was largely reversed. In the 1970s these problems, 
along with external shocks and the decline of grade ore reserves, pushed the 
country to a course of increasing indebtedness and dependence on the World 
Bank and the international Monetary Fund (IMF). Subsequently Zambia 
acknowledged the limits of controlling 
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its economy and negotiated a series of stabilization programs and standby 
arrangements with these Bretton Woods institutions: July 1976, April 1978, 
July 1982, March 1984, January 1985, June 1986, December, 1986. 

Unlike Zambia and Tanzania, the vast majority of African countries did not 
have the political will to attempt to regain control of the development agenda. 
Most African leaders concentrated on survival and followed the line of least 
resistance in development strategy. This meant relying on the technical 
assistance, foreign mission reports, project analyses, and blueprints of 
international development agencies.3 

But the complacency of African leaders was short lived; they were soon 
having problems with leaving policy management to others. In time they 
recognized emerging differences between their own interests and the concerns 
of the external development agents. Eventually they began to develop their 
own ideas about how to proceed, thus paving the way for a conflict of agendas. 
 

Competing Agendas 
Nowhere is the conflict more evident than in the rift between the Bretton 

Woods institutions and African governments over approaches to African 
development. Even though individual African states seemed content to 
surrender the development agenda to external development agencies, they did 
grope collectively, under the auspices of the Organization of African Unity 
(OAU), toward a vision of how to proceed. The first conference of the heads of 
state of independent Africa in May 22-25, 1963, adopted a resolution called 
Areas of Cooperation in Economic Problems. A committee was then set up to 
study the ideas of a common tariff system to protect Africa's infant industries, a 
commodities stabilization fund, the freeing of African currencies from external 
attachments, the restructuring of international trade in Africa's favor, and the 
harmonization of African development strategies. The view of African 
development implicit in these concerns is clear enough, and African 
governments have continued to maintain this view with only minor 
modifications in emphasis and detail. 

The continuity of this perspective on the problems of African economies is 
evident in subsequent resolutions and position papers of the African states: 
Africa's Strategy for Development in the 1970's, which was adopted by the 
United Nations Economic Commission for Africa (UNECA, or ECA) 
Conference of Ministers in Tunisia, February 1971; 
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African Declaration on Cooperation, Development, and Economic Inde-
pendence, which is also called the Addis Ababa Declaration, a document 
adopted by the OAU Assembly of Heads of States and Governments in 1973; 
The Revised Framework of Principles for the Implementation of the New 
International Economic Order in Africa, adopted at Kinshasa in December 
1976 by the OAU Council of Ministers and in July 1977 by the OAU heads of 
states in Libreville; Monrovia Declaration of Commitment of the Heads of 
States and Governments of the Organization of African Unity on Guidelines 
and Measures for National and Collective Self-Reliance in Social and 
Economic Development for the Establishment of a New International 
Economic Order, adopted in July 1979 by the OAU heads of states and 
governments in Monrovia (the results of a colloquium organized by the OAU 
and UNECA in February 1979 on the Perspectives of Development and 
Economic Growth in Africa up to the Year 2000). 

Such was the course of the OAU's thinking that culminated in The Lagos 
Plan of Action for the Implementation of the Monrovia Strategy for the 
Economic Development of Africa, the most comprehensive and systematic 
statement of the vision of Africa's leaders on the development of Africa. The 
plan resulted from a decision of the sixteenth assembly of the heads of states 
and governments of the OAU to hold a special economic summit to find a 
suitable response to the deepening economic crisis in Africa. The summit, held 
in April 1980 in Lagos, adopted the plan, the clash between The Lagos Plan of 
Action, which became the classic work on African development strategy, and 
the World Bank's Accelerated Development in Sub-Saharan Africa: An Agenda 
for Action (1981), which became the classic perspective of the Bretton Woods 
institutions on African development, is highly significant. 

The Lagos Plan of Action stemmed from the disappointment of African 
leaders with the continent's economic progress and their conviction that the 
inadequacy of exogenous development strategies contributed importantly to 
Africa's poor development record, a view succinctly expressed in the preamble: 

 

The effect of unfulfilled promises of global development strategies has 
been more sharply felt in Africa than in the other continents of the world. 
Indeed, rather than result in an improvement in the economic situation of 
the continent, successive strategies have made it stagnate and become more 
susceptible than other regions to the economic and social crisis suffered by 
the industrialized countries. Thus Africa is unable to point to any 
significant growth rate, or satisfactory index of 

 22



general well-being, in the past 20 years. Faced with this situation, and 
determined to undertake measures for the basic restructuring of the 
economic base of our continent, we resolved to adopt a far-reaching 
regional approach based primarily on collective self-reliance.4 
 

To the irritation of Africa's foreign patrons, The Lagos Plan of Action 
argued that Africa's economic problems were partly caused by Africa's 
dependence and openness to exploitation; hence the necessity of self-reliance: 

 

Africa is susceptible to the disastrous effects of natural and endemic 
diseases of the cruelest type and is a victim of settler exploitation arising 
from colonialism, racism and apartheid. Indeed, Africa was directly 
exploited during the colonial period and for the past two decades; this 
exploitation has been carried out through neo-colonialist external forces 
which seek to influence the economic policies and directions of African 
States.5 

 

The Lagos Plan and the World Bank Study 
 
The Lagos plan was a design for restructuring African economies on two 

principles: self-reliance (national and collective) and self-sustaining 
development. Restructuring for self-reliance was to entail, among other things, 
changing Africa's location in the existing international division of labor, 
changing the pattern of production from primary commodities to manufactured 
goods, and relying more on internal sources of raw materials, spare parts, 
management, finance, and technology. The pursuit of national self-reliance was 
to be a matter of depending more on internal demand to stimulate production 
and less on imported inputs. Collective self-reliance would entail collective 
action to reduce Africa's vulnerability to external forces, a pooling of 
resources, and greater inter-African trade and cooperation. 

The Lagos plan leans toward participative development. It takes a holistic 
approach in several ways: in treating agriculture and industrial development 
together and being methodically attentive to the effects of the one on the other, 
in recognizing the integral relation of the internal and external causes of the 
African crisis, and in seeing development as a  
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task that must involve everyone and every sector, private and public, 
agriculture and industry, labor, capital, and peasantry. 

Accelerated Development grew out of a request made by the African 
governors of the World Bank and the IMF to prepare a study of the economic 
problems of Sub-Saharan Africa and suggest ways of solving them. The 
governors were reacting to the World Development Report, 1972, which 
presented a bleak picture of Africa's development prospects. Accelerated 
Development was duly prepared and published in 1981. 

The study sees the African crisis as a production crisis in agriculture, 
particularly in food production. It acknowledges that external factors, 
especially stagflation in the industrialized countries, high energy costs, and the 
slow growth of trade in primary commodities, are problems for Africa. 
However, the emphasis is overwhelmingly on the internal causes of 
underdevelopment of human resources, climatic conditions and over-
production, and policy failures. According to the study,  the remedy for 
Africa's ailing economies ties in giving market forces freer play to bring about 
dynamism and efficiency. It singles out three areas for attention: 

Trade and exchange rate policies, mainly the reduction of import and 
export duties, subsidies, overvalued exchange rates, and marketing costs. 

Reform of input supply and marketing services for agricultural producers. 
This refers mainly to parastatals, which are to be managed better and made 
competitive and more in tune with market forces. 

More effective use of resources in the public sector. While attention is to 
be paid to small holders, it is to be selective, with focus on those areas where 
physical and human resources promise a higher payoff.6 

Merely to summarize Accelerated Development is to see immediately why 
it was perceived by Africans to be against their interests. For instance, the 
study wanted Africa to concentrate on primary production, particularly 
agricultural products. African leaders, however, felt that a fundamental cause 
of Africa's problems was precisely its specialization in primary production. In 
emphasizing production for export, the report was perceived to be reinforcing 
Africa's dependence on markets that were becoming increasingly hostile and 
protectionist. African leaders felt that the Bank study glossed over problems 
that the international economy poses for Africa, problems that are fundamental, 
though by no means the only cause of Africa's predicament. These include low 
commodity prices, high interest rates in the West, and the debt burden. But in 
fairness to the authors of the study and the World Bank itself, it is not so much 
that they 

 24



dismiss those problems but that they take them as part of the realities on the 
ground, which need to be minimized and if possible overcome by appropriate 
policies. 

Accelerated Development came to be regarded by some African leaders as 
a political and ideological document masked as economics that attempts to 
induce its readers to accept largely false or misleading issues, irrelevant 
solutions, and a wrong agenda. When the document appeared, a working group 
from the secretariats of the OAU and the African Development Bank (ADB) 
and UNECA was set up to examine it. A paper was duly produced and tabled 
before the African governors of the bank. After studying the paper, the 
governors decided that the report needed to be further examined and discussed 
at a meeting to be organized by the ADB, the OAU, and UNECA. The working 
group of the three organizations resumed work on the report and prepared 
another paper in January 1982. The paper argued that Accelerated 
Development was analytically defective, disingenuous, and contradictory to 
African interests that "the goals, objectives and characteristics of the strategy 
contained in the report are in many ways inconsistent with those of The Lagos 
Plan of Action." 

A more pointed clash of the two viewpoints took place at the eighth 
meeting of ministers (responsible for economic development and planning) of 
UNECA at its seventh session in Tripoli in April 1982. The African ministers 
expressed their evaluation of the report in a document called Declaration of 
Tripoli on the World Bank Report Entitled "Accelerated Development in 
Sub-Saharan Africa: An Agenda for Action.” They argued that "the strategy 
recommended in the World Bank report, which emphasizes export orientation 
in general, and primary commodity export in particular, regards 
industrialization and economic cooperation and integration in Africa as 
long-term issues and completely disregards external factors as being major 
constraints on Africa's development and economic growth, that it adopts 
approaches, concepts and objectives which are divergent from those of The 
Lagos Plan of Action and The Final Act of Lagos and opposed to the political, 
economic and social aspirations of Africa." They went on to "affirm that the 
goals and objectives defined by African countries for themselves in The 
Monrovia Strategy, the Lagos Plan of Action, and The Final Acts of Lagos 
remain the authentic and authoritative goals and objectives for Africa." 

The struggle for the development agenda had begun in earnest. The Breton 
Woods institutions and the West would not accept the approach of the Lagos 
Plan, although they refrained from opposing it openly. Instead, they expressed 
their rejection of the plan by ignoring it and refusing to 
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reorient their economic relations with Africa so as to connect with and address 
the programs and policies of the plan. That was enough to render the plan 
inoperable. In the end, African leaders found that they were too dependent and 
too weak to have their way, and they started to retreat. They talked less about 
the Lagos plan, they tried to signal their willingness to reform their economics 
along the lines suggested by the World Bank study and, most significant, and 
they increasingly adopted structural adjustment programs. But the formal 
surrender did not occur until July 1985, five years after the launching of the 
plan, when the Assembly of the Heads of States and Governments of the OAU 
collectively signaled their defeat. 

The clash of agendas again became prominent in the attempt to deal with 
the economic crisis that had become acute in the early 1980s. The depth of the 
crisis was documented in the World Development Report, 1984: rising infant 
mortality; food dependence; malnutrition, threatening as many as 100 million 
people; and so forth.7 

The report suggested that even with some fundamental improvements in 
economic management, per capita income would continue its downward trend 
for the decade 1985-95. In an alternative scenario, which was less optimistic in 
its assumptions, the report projected GDP growth at 2.8 percent a year, 
compared with a population growth rate of 3.5 percent a year, for an annual 
GDP fall of 0.7 percent a year. This meant that 65 to 80 percent of Africa's 
population would be living below the poverty line by 1995. By 1984 African 
leaders had recognized that the economic decline of Africa was so deep that it 
had created a real emergency that had to be addressed urgently and vigorously. 
Consultations were held among African leaders in the context of organizations 
such as UNECA, the Economic Community of West African States, the OAU, 
and the African Development Bank (ADB). At the same time, pressure started 
to mount for a special session of the UN General Assembly on the African 
crisis. In Resolution 39/29 of December 3, 1984, the General Assembly drew 
attention to the "critical economic situation" existing in Africa, -and in 
Resolution 40/40, of December 2, 1985, it agreed to convene a special session 
to "focus in a comprehensive and integrated manner, on the rehabilitation and 
medium-term and long-term development problems and challenges facing 
African countries."8 

In anticipation of the special session, the African countries prepared a 
comprehensive document called Africa's Submission to the Special 
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Session of the United Nations General Assembly on Africa's Economic and 
Social Crisis.9 This submission contained an analysis of the African crisis as 
well as a program of action for getting out of it. It was adopted at the first 
extraordinary meeting of the UNECA Conference of Ministers on March 
28-29, 1986, and the fifteenth extraordinary session of the OAU Council of 
Ministers in Addis Ababa, March 30-31, 1986. The program of action in the 
submission, known as Africa's Priority Program for Economic Recovery, 
1986-90 (APPER), had been approved by the Assembly of African Heads of 
States and Governments of the OAU meeting at its twenty first ordinary 
sessions in Addis Ababa, July 18-20, 1985. 

According to the submission, APPER was rooted in the Lagos plan, which, 
it was claimed, had become even more relevant in view of the deepening crisis. 
Thus the aims of achieving a radical change in the patterns of production and 
consumption, social and economic structural transformation, and accelerated 
economic growth and development as well as the integration of the economies 
of the region, remained of critical importance. APPER translated such broad 
principles into a sharply focused, practical, and operational set of activities and 
policies to be implemented during 1986-90 to lay the basis for durable 
structural change and an improved general level of productivity."10 

But this claim was misleading, for APPER largely embraces the critical 
assumptions and the strategies of Accelerated Development while discarding 
those of the Lagos plan. In their struggle to implement the Lagos plan, African 
leaders had learned the futility of trying to determine the development agenda 
and trying to carry it out without the cooperation of the West. They saw in 
clearer relief how weak and dependent they were. The African countries 
tailored APPER to the World Bank study in order to avoid another clash that 
they were bound to lose, with perhaps even more disastrous consequences. 
APPER's concern was much narrower than the structural transformation that it 
proclaimed. Like Accelerated Development, it placed emphasis on Africa's 
traditional areas of "comparative advantage," especially agriculture, which was 
now to get 20 percent of total investment. The agricultural sector was now seen 
as the source of the dynamics of economic development as well as of 
self-reliance: 

 

In putting special emphasis on the agricultural economy, the Priority 
Program seeks to revitalize the more dynamic and internally based Forces 
for growth and development. The Program recognizes the crucial 
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fact that the satisfaction of food requirements for the African people hinges 
on the rapid reversal of the declining trends of productivity in the rural 
areas. The alleviation of the problem of growing mass poverty and the 
subsequent dynamization of internal demand forces also depend largely on 
the rapid improvement of rural incomes.11 

 

Like the World Bank study, APPER was preoccupied with identifying and 
correcting the policy errors of the past and considered that good policies and 
good economic management were those that encouraged market forces. Thus, 
like the study, APPER focused on removing the on strains that make the 
economy uncompetitive and inefficient as well as on correcting structural 
defects, including price distortions, unrealistic exchange rates, trade 
imbalances, and disincentives to investment. Recovery was to be furthered by a 
system of supportive incentives ranging from better prices for agricultural 
products to extension services to improved infrastructure and marketing. 
Exports were to be supported by incentives, including the removal of 
bureaucratic constraints and easier access to foreign exchange. Like the Bank 
study and the structural adjustment programs, APPER advocated privatization, 
better cost recovery, and more resource Mobilization and the curtailing of 
consumption. 

In 1986 the United Nations prepared its own African recovery program, the 
United Nations Program of Action for African Economic Recovery and 
Development, 1986-90 (UNPAAERD). It is not clear why the UN had its own 
program, since it was very similar to APPER. UNPAAERD placed the same 
emphasis on agriculture and the same emphasis on policy reform of the IMF 
kind. The program was based on mutual cooperation and revolved around two 
concerns: (a) the determination and commitment of the African countries to 
launch other national and regional programs of economic development; and (b) 
the response of the international community and its commitment to support and 
complement the African development efforts.12 The estimated cost of the 
program was $57.4 billion, or 44.8 percent of the projected cost of APPER. 
The estimated cost of UNPAAERD was $128.1 billion, of which $82.46 billion 
was to be raised from domestic sources and $45.6 billion from external 
sources.13 

Both APPER and UNPAAERD emphasized Africa's responsibility for its 
plight and for finding a solution. It is not difficult to understand why the 
leaders of the world community as well as African leaders emphasized this 
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point. For Western leaders, who were increasingly irritated by Africans, 
blaming them for the effects of colonialism and imperialism, it vindicated not 
only their past relations to Africa but also their present perspective on African 
development. They could thus play down the structural deformities of African 
economies constituted under colonialism and gloss over the incorporation of 
Africa into the world capitalist system. 

One reason why the Lagos plan was so resented was that it drew attention 
to these deformities, both their origins and their persistence. So it was highly 
significant that in APPER African leaders surrendered their position and 
became silent about those defects, blaming themselves for the continuation of 
underdevelopment. Apparently, the document prepared for the UN special 
session in 1986, popularly called Africa's Submission, was just that, a 
submission. The relish with which UNPAAERD has repeatedly drawn 
attention to Africa's culpability is palpable. 

As far as African leaders were concerned, the emphasis on Africa's 
responsibility for its woes and the depiction of APPER as the embodiment of 
the Lagos plan was a face-saving device. But Africa's Submission was also 
born of a utilitarian calculation, to the effect that the West would be 
magnanimous to a humiliated African leadership ready and even eager to play 
the game the Western way. 

Five years after the UN special session, UNECA carried out a survey to 
determine the extent to which African governments were implementing 
APPER and UNPAAERD. The survey showed that considerable effort was 
going into implementation. As regards investment in agriculture, 61 percent of 
the respondents said they had reached the target of 20 - 2 5 percent of total 
investment. The rate of compliance was higher in the area of macroeconomic 
management, in which 69 percent reported having embarked on structural 
adjustment programs and another 39 percent had undertaken stabilization 
measures. Among the macroeconomic reforms in place were exchange rate 
adjustment, public sector reduction, removal of subsidies, and freezing of 
wages. For example, 72 percent of the countries had embarked on the reduction 
of subsidies; 67 percent had initiated an employment freeze; 50 percent were 
carrying out exchange rate adjustments. As for the short-and medium-term 
measures for the support of agriculture, 67 percent were carrying out 
mechanization, 89 percent were engaged in the use of modern inputs, and 75 
percent were developing agricultural research stations. 

Unfortunately those who had set the agenda were not much interested in 
the question of compliance. The expected financial contribution from the 
industrialized countries did not come: 
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Nineteen months have now elapsed since the adoption by consensus of the 
Action program on July 1, 1986, and this is perhaps a sufficiently long 
enough time to monitor actions and assess the outcome of the joint efforts. 
A major success has been the resolve of Africans themselves to put their 
house in order, recognizing that primary responsibility for the development 
of their region rests first and foremost with them. This has amply been 
reflected in the actions taken at various national levels by the African 
governments. While African governments have showed the extent to which 
they are willing to go in order to get out of the economic crisis and in 
meeting the conditions that have been repeatedly emphasized by the major 
donors, it is regrettable that the efforts of the international community have 
not been up to expectations. Available statistics indicate that resource 
flows to Africa have declined further in real terms in 1987, and have been 
grossly inadequate to compensate for the fall in export earnings. This 
disappointing development in 1987, in terms of the response of the donor 
community, was reported by the Secretary-General of the United Nations 
in his first progress report in the 42nd Session of the General Assembly to 
assess the implementation of UNPAAERD, namely, that the African 
countries have done their utmost and have admirably honored their 
commitment so far, but that further deterioration in the external economic 
environment and the lack of adequate support from the international 
community have put the chances for the successful implementation of the 
program at serious risk. 14 

 

The UN secretary general's 1991 report on UNPAAERD praised the 
African countries for their determination to tread the path of reform: 

 

A majority of African countries have carried out policy reforms aimed at 
improving efficiency and the allocation of resources. These measures 
continued to be pursued, despite their often high political, social and 
economic costs, and have shown some positive results. By 1990, declines 
in economic output and in the delivery of social services had been slowed 
in many countries and even partially reversed in some. The ability to 
deploy additional resources effectively is stronger now than when the 
United Nations Program of Action began.15 
 

Despite this effort, there was no chance that either APPER or UNPAAERD 
could take off; much less succeed, without the expected financial support 
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of the industrialized countries, In particular, an annual resource gap of $9.1 
billion had to be filled if the program were to have any hope for success. Even 
if that money had been provided, the chances of success would still have been 
poor because of the $25 billion required annually for debt servicing. In the end 
the international support for UNPAAERD did not materialize, a point that the 
report dwells on repeatedly. For example, "Net resource flows to Africa, in real 
terms, actually declined from $25.0 billion in 1986 to $23.3 billion in 1990. 
Official development assistance (ODA) stagnated, in real terms, at around $16 
billion annually during 1986-1989, while private flows fell sharply. 16 

Referring to the areas of trade and commodities, the report says that "in 
spite of the crucial importance of a favorable international economic 
environment to the success of African efforts towards recovery and devel-
opment, little significant progress was registered.... Instead of reducing 
dependency on earnings from commodity exports, developments during the 
period of the United Nations Programme of Action reinforced the 
commodity-dependent trend of the 1980s, a decade that many think of as a 
period of stagnation and reversal for most African countries. 17 
 

Structural Adjustment and the Conflict of Agendas 
 
One might think that the retreat of African leaders into APPER, 

UNPAAERD, and structural adjustment programs might have settled the 
controversy over the development agenda in Africa. But far from winding 
down, the controversy has been intensified. Africans have become increasingly 
frustrated with having to accept an exogenous agenda without even the 
compensation of a markedly improved performance or significant support from 
the metropolitan patrons that sponsored the agenda. This is painfully obvious 
in the case of UNPAAERD. African leaders are beginning to feel that there is 
little to be lost and much to be gained by adopting an African agenda, At the 
same time, African countries are more conscious of their weaknesses and the 
problems of resisting external pressure. Nonetheless, a declining confidence in 
the feasibility of the exogenous agendas, the worsening crisis, and Africa's 
increasing economic marginalization in the global system have all built 
momentum for an endogenous development agenda. 

The contest over development agendas became especially intense and bitter 
with the introduction of structural adjustment programs. Structural 
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adjustment, based on the model of financial programming developed by 
Jacques J. Polak in 1957, is controversial, especially in regard to the 

relevance of its mix of theoretical assumptions to African conditions. Just 
how controversial it is among economists was highlighted by the Marshall 
lectures of 1987 given by Lance Taylor, an economist long associated with the 
World Bank. In insisting on austerity measures and the contraction of demands, 
the IMF maintains that the economy will not slacken but will simply reduce 
prices, especially those of nontraded goods; cut down the demand for imports; 
and expand exports to the benefit of the balance of payments. But Taylor 
showed that the IMF theory strings together a set of theoretical constructs- 
supply-determined output, substitution response, constant velocity, and the law 
of one price-any number of which may not be applicable in a particular 
historical context. If so, austerity measures will reduce output and bypass the 
reserve reallocation, hence reinforcing one of their major structural 
weaknesses. Apart from these theoretical problems, Africans fear that emphasis 
on market forces will perpetuate their location in the international division of 
labor in which they are relegated to the role of primary producers and mere 
consumers of manufactured goods. 

In Nigeria, a political leadership torn between the fear of alienating the 
IMF and its patrons and the political repercussions of adjustment initiated a 
public debate over adjustment. Despite the government's effort to influence the 
debate, structural adjustment was overwhelmingly rejected. But the 
government went along with adjustment all the same. The economy had been 
so badly managed and was in such a poor state that the government feared that 
hostility from the Bretton Woods institutions and the West might lead to 
economic collapse and political chaos. The huge revenues from the oil boom 
had been so badly managed that after the peak of the boom in 1980 Nigeria 
went into continually increasing deficit. Its external debt, which had been no 
more than $4,284 million between 1960 and 1980, rose to $12,181 million in 
1983. By 1986, when foreign exchange receipts had fallen to $6.8 billion from 
$26 billion in 1980, the external debt stood at an estimated $19.5 billion.18 By 
1985 there were grave doubts about Nigeria's creditworthiness, and it was 
becoming more difficult for Nigerian importers to open letters of credit. 
Imports dropped dramatically, from $15 billion in 1980 to $5.5 million in 
1986. There were shortages of essential goods, manufacturing inputs, and spare 
parts. In June 1986 the government reluctantly embarked on a structural 
adjustment Program. 
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It is at the pan-African rather than at the national level that the opposition 
of African leaders is most vocal. Their concern about structural adjustment, 
especially its social dimensions, has come out in many speeches at OAU 
ministerial and governmental meetings. The opposition to adjustment was most 
notably expressed in the pan-African meeting that produced The Khartoum 
Declaration on the "Human Dimension of Africa's Economic Recovery and 
Development." The meeting was held in Khartoum, Sudan, March 5-8, 1988, 
under the auspices of the United Nations as part of the follow-up to 
UNPAAERD and APPER and also as a sequel to the UNECA-sponsored 
international conference on Africa, The Challenge of Economic Recovery and 
Accelerated Development, held in Abuja, Nigeria, June 15-19, 1987, which 
produced the Abuja Declaration. 

The Khartoum meeting, which brought together senior officials from 
African governments and UN agencies, including the IMF and the World 
Bank, showed that African opposition to structural adjustment had hardened. 
The declaration pointedly attacked the structural adjustment programs for 
aggravating the human condition in Africa, because they are "incomplete, 
mechanistic and of too short a time perspective." They are "incomplete because 
they are often implemented as if fiscal, trade and price balances are ends in 
themselves and are virtually complete sets of means to production increases. 
Human condition imbalances as related to employment, incomes, nutrition, 
health and education do not receive equal priority in attention to 
macro-economic imbalances." They are "mechanistic in being inadequately 
grounded in, or sensitive to, specific national economic, human and cultural 
realities. This is aggravated by an incomplete articulation which allows the 
gaps between macro models and contextual realities to remain largely 
unobserved." Finally, structural adjustment programs are affected "in too short 
a time perspective. Africa cannot wait for the attainment of external 
equilibrium and fiscal balances before seeking to improve the human condition 
nor can a long-term investment to strengthen the institutional, scientific, 
technical and productive capacity operating in environmental balance be 
postponed."19 

Strangely, as the opposition to the Breton Woods institutions' agenda 
spread in Africa and became more vehement, more African countries were 
adopting structural adjustment. They were worried about their deteriorating 
economies and feared that to invite the hostility of the West by rejecting 
structural adjustment might plunge their economics deeper into crisis. Thus 
while insisting that the IMF was "a mad doctor" to be avoided, 
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President Kaunda of Zambia was submitting to a structural adjustment 
package. At the same time the IMF and the Bank, forever confusing compli-
ance with consent, were insisting on an emerging consensus on the need for 
structural adjustment in Africa. Meanwhile the debate over what to do about 
the crisis and about development in general was getting more strident in tone 
and more ideological in thrust, with the Bank and the Fund insisting that 
adjustment was the only way out and African leaders insisting with equal vigor 
that the only. Way out were to find an alternative to adjustment and the policies 
of the Breton Woods institutions. 

The problems and confusion of a situation in which African leaders are 
running their economies with a program they condemn have been compounded 
by the rift between the main UN agency responsible for economic development 
in Africa, UNECA, and the Breton Woods institutions. After years of 
demurring politely, UNECA has now joined the African governments in 
criticizing structural adjustment programs; it is now the leader and the 
coordinator as well as the leading ideologue of this opposition. By joining the 
opposition, UNECA is undermining the scientific authority of the Bank and the 
IMF, an important part of their influence in Africa. UNECA's objections to 
structural adjustment, which, like those of other agencies such as UNICEF 
(United Nations Children's Fund), were usually restrained and polite, were 
sharpened when the agency felt that far from acknowledging the tragic 
problems of structural adjustment in Africa, the Breton Woods institutions 
were deliberately distorting facts to buttress the legitimacy of the program. 

The indictment largely stemmed from Africa's Adjustment and Growth in 
the 1980s, a publication that the World Bank had put out in 1989 to 
demonstrate the soundness of structural adjustment as a program of recovery. 
Its allegedly careless and insensitive attempt to justify the policy prescriptions 
of the Breton Woods institutions appears to have deeply offended the African 
intelligentsia and policy makers. Having compared this World Bank report 
with their own practical experience and the midterm review of UNPAAERD, 
they felt that it was openly and crudely manipulative, and that it misrepresented 
the African crisis by focusing on disingenuous explanations and statistical 
analysis. 

Subsequently, the twenty-fourth session of UNECA and the fifteenth 
meeting of the UNECA Conference of Ministers in Addis Ababa, April 610, 
1989, passed a resolution expressing concern about this report. Not only was 
the report at variance with the midterm review of UNPAAERD and the 
consensus report of the forty-third session of the General Assembly on the 
same subject; it was even at variance with another study by the 
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World Bank: Beyond Adjustment: Toward Sustainable Growth with Equity in 
Sub-Saharan Africa (1988). The resolution called on the executive secretary of 
UNECA "to publish a paper highlighting the technical and statistical variances 
contained in the World Bank/UNDP report for an objective evaluation of the 
economic situation on the continent," and requested "that the ECA paper 
should be widely disseminated so as to put the record straight." The result was 
a new study by UNECA called Statistics and Policies: ECA Preliminary 
Observations on the World Bank Report, 'Africa's Adjustment and Growth in 
the 1980's." 

This study challenged the three major conclusions of the Bank-UNDP 
report: 

That external condition including export earnings and terms of trade and 
export prices were more favorable to Africa than usually assumed; 

That internal conditions, including institutional weaknesses and structural 
rigidities, "have limited the ability to adjust from the exceptionally good years 
of the late 1970s and the early 1980s"; and 

That the prospects for recovery are better than usually assumed. The 
UNECA analysis focused on the claim that structural adjustment was working 
as expected but that the performance of African economies improved with their 
commitment to adjustment reform. 

Reviewing the evidence, UNECA argued that the Bank-UNDP report was 
manipulative in its use of statistics to confirm unfounded preconceptions and 
that it misrepresented the success of structural adjustment programs by failing 
to take account of the social costs of adjustment, its adverse long-term effects, 
its arbitrary classifications, and the distortions caused by the greater flow of 
external funds to adjusting countries. For its statistical calculations, the World 
Bank had used outweighed averages and 1985, an exceptionally good year, as 
its base year, whereas UNECA used weighted averages and 1980 as the base 
year. 

UNECA argued that, contrary to the Bank's claims, the no adjusting 
countries were outperforming the adjusting countries. According to UNECA, 
for the period 1980-87 "the performance of Sub-Saharan African countries 
with strong SAPs [structural adjustment programs] was the worst of any group; 
a negative annual average growth rate of 0.53 percent contrasted with a 
positive 2.0 percent for countries with weak structural adjustment programs 
and a relatively strong 3.5 percent for non-adjusting countries in sub-Saharan 
Africa. 20 

This was more than a debate about the implications of policy for growth 
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rates. Part of the reason why this debate has become a public issue everywhere 
in Africa is the question of the social cost of adjustment, raised initially by 
such groups in Africa as trade unions and professional organizations like the 
Council for the Development of Economic and Social Research in Africa but, 
as mentioned, later taken up by international organizations like UNICEF and 
UNECA. UNECA, which was then led by Professor Adebayo Adedeji and was 
seen as being close to African aspirations, has been particularly sensitive to this 
issue. For instance, in its 1989 report it reiterated this concern: "There is 
mounting evidence that stabilization and structural adjustment programs are 
rending the fabric of the African society. Worse still, their severest impact is on 
the vulnerable groups in the society-children, women and the aged-who 
constitute two-thirds of the population."21 

Steps have been taken to redress this problem by the Fund and the Bank, 
especially the latter, which now has a small unit on the Social Dimensions of 
Adjustment, but people outside the Breton Woods institutions who are 
concerned with the social cost of adjustment worry that not enough is being 
done. 

Opposition to the structural adjustment program eventually went beyond 
criticism to the search for an alternative program. The meeting of African 
finance ministers and other government officials that convened in Blantyre, 
Malawi, in March 1989 under the auspices of UNECA adopted an alternative 
program for economic recovery and development, published as African 
Alternative Frame work for Structural Adjustment Programs for 
Socio-Economic Recovery and Transformation. 

Alternative Framework is not simply a critique of the IMF-World Bank 
structural adjustment programs but potentially an alternative development 
agenda. Unlike the structural adjustment programs, it is dealing not merely 
with a crisis but with what it considers the root causes of underdevelopment in 
Africa. The report begins with an analysis of the colonial origins and structural 
deformities of African economies. It notes the arbitrary geography of the 
African countries, a veritable legacy of colonialism: 14 countries are 
landlocked, 23 countries have a population of fewer than 5 million, and 13 
have a landmass of fewer than 50,000 hectares each. It shows how these and 
other factors have created a dependency syndrome, structural imbalance, and 
monoculture economies .22 

The point is that the problems of Africa are not short term or ones that can 
be solved by monetarism but problems that need a comprehensive 
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agenda and a long-term perspective. The difference between the two agendas 
can be seen not only in these broader concerns but also in the extent to which 
Alternative Framework rejects the main policy measures of structural 
adjustment. Excessive budgetary reductions through the removal of subsidies, 
the curtailment of social programs, and so forth, are rejected for causing too 
much suffering and social strife and the depreciation of human resources to the 
detriment of future development. 

The general emphasis of structural adjustment on drastic devaluation is 
decried for having too many negative effects, including inflation, the high cost 
of imported inputs, capital flight, and the entrenchment of traditional exports. 
Import liberalization is said to endanger endogenous industrialization and to 
perpetuate dependence. Relying on market forces tends to distort national 
priorities and to fuel inflation. By opposing these policy options, Alternative 
Framework underlines UNECA's distrust of the neoclassical assumptions of 
the development paradigm. 

Important differences between the Alternative Framework agenda and the 
IMF-World Bank structural adjustment programs are evident not only in what 
the former rejects but also in the policy commitments it makes for 
strengthening and diversifying productive capacity in Africa, improving the 
level and distribution of income, satisfying basic human needs, and giving 
institutional support for adjustment with transformation. For instance, in its 
pattern of expenditure for the satisfaction of human needs, Alternative 
Framework suggests selective subsidies and price incentives to increase the 
supply of essential commodities to support welfare and create an enabling 
environment for development. It also suggests more government expenditure 
on the social sectors like health and education to improve human capital and to 
meet essential social needs. Thus it affirms the rationality of the welfares that 
adjustment policies decry. 

Whether these policies are feasible in the light of resource constraints is 
another matter. In the area of institutional support for adjustment with 
transformation, Alternative Framework suggests the institutionalization of the 
economic participation of previously marginalized groups such as artisans, 
peasants, and women and insists on popular involvement in decision making to 
improve motivation, confidence in government, and the commitment of the 
people to the pursuit of collective goals. The Breton Woods institutions, 
especially the World Bank, are also increasingly endorsing the need for 
participation, as is clear from the long term perspective study Sub-Saharan 
Africa: from Crisis to Sustainable Growth.23 
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The differences between UNECA and the OAU on the one hand and the 
Breton Woods institutions on the other are moving beyond policies and 
strategies and agendas and assuming an ideological form. Nowhere is this more 
evident than in the Unocal’s attempt to locate its alternative agenda in a 
broader framework, in a speech on the African Crisis on October 25, 1990, the 
executive secretary of UNECA argued that Alternative Framework differs from 
the approach of the Breton Woods institutions in four major ways. First, it is 
human centered. "It distances itself completely from the orthodox mechanistic 
models or approaches that have reduced the entire business of adjustment to 
the attainment of a few balances such as balance-of-payment equilibrium and 
reduced government budget deficits without any regard to the implications of 
the social sectors and the overall welfare of the people." Second, it is a holistic 
approach to socioeconomic change. That means it does not focus on a few 
selected economic variables but rather situates change in the broader context of 
social, political, cultural, and economic values and institutions. Third, its 
policies derive their "validity and legitimacy from the very structural nature of 
the African political economy." That means, for instance, that its policies "are 
based on a full grasp of the fact that the basic manifestations of the African 
structural distortions include elements like the predominance of subsistence 
and mere trading activities; narrow, urban bias of public policies; neglected 
informal sector; fragmented markets; etc." Fourth, it is sensitive to specificity. 
It "refrains from proposing a program to be applied in all countries at all times 
as has been the discernible tendency with the orthodox 'ready-made' programs 
of adjustment that have been proposed to Asian, Latin American and African 
countries alike."24 These comparisons clearly strain beyond policy options to 
ideological leanings. 

The contrast between the IMF-World Bank approach and UNECA's 
Alternative Framework exacerbates the confusion of development agendas. 
UNECA is nowhere near as powerful in Africa as the World Bank or the IMF, 
but it is influential. It has the prestige of the UN body charged specifically with 
the development of Africa. African policy makers think highly of its technical 
mastery of the economic issues of development. Although it is a UN organ, 
African leaders trust it and assume it is more attentive to African nationalist 
interests than other international organizations. Hence they have tended to use 
their UNECA ministerial meetings for building consensus and, more important, 
for developing common positions in their relations to external bodies, 
especially the IMF and the 
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World Bank. It is now very difficult to distinguish between the views of the 
community of African leaders and those of UNECA as an institution. Because 
of this special relationship, when UNECA puts out something like Alternative 
Framework, it is taken seriously in Africa. 

The international development agencies I have discussed are not the only 
ones dealing with African development. There are many other development 
agencies whose influence on policy in Africa are far less than that of the World 
Bank, the IMF, and UNECA but nonetheless are quite significant in specific 
policy areas and in particular African countries. Some examples are the UNDP, 
the International Labor Organization, the Food and Agricultural Organization, 
the U.S. Agency for International Development, and the Swedish International 
Development Agency. These have their own agendas, too, which are not 
always mutually consistent. And within the same agencies agendas may shift 
with little consistency or continuity. 

Indeed, there are shifts and discontinuities and some advance in the World 
Bank's 1980s and early 1990s blueprints for Africa.25 For instance, the Bank 
has become more sensitive to the social impact of structural adjustment and to 
the need to invest in human resource development even while giving the 
market more scope. Sub-Saharan Africa shows that the Bank is now more 
sympathetic to regional integration and less apolitical; it now recognizes the 
significance of the governance factor. Still, the major thrust of the agenda of 
the Breton Woods institutions is clear and largely predictable, and the 
problems arising from these shifts and discontinuities are not of the same 
magnitude as the differences between endogenous and exogenous development 
agendas and between what African leaders want to do and what they have to 
do. 

The program outlined in UNECA's Alternative Framework does not appear 
to have emerged as a credible alternative policy. It has not been able to stem 
the tide of structural adjustment; if anything, the tide continues to rise. This 
may mean that the scientific status of the alternative framework is suspect, or it 
could be its sense of realism or the political will of its proponents that is 
suspect. Although a little convergence has occurred between the Alternative 
Framework program and the World Bank's structural adjustment programs, 
these two approaches nonetheless 
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still encode a rift between what African leaders want to do and what they have 
to do. 
 

Conclusion 
As suggested earlier, the problem in Africa is not so much that develop-

ment has failed as that it never really got started. At the beginning of the 
independence period, African leaders, with few exceptions, were so absorbed 
in the struggle for power and survival and so politically isolated by their 
betrayal of the nationalist revolution that they could not launch a national 
development project but instead opted for dependent development, letting their 
metropolitan patrons determine the agenda and find the resources to implement 
it. Thus policy making was largely divorced from political responsibility and 
development strategy was dissociated both from social needs and from the 
cultural and historical realities of the developing society. This dissociation led 
to development policies that have been more disruptive than developmental. 
Development could not proceed in a situation in which the national leadership 
had no vision or agenda of its own and relied on outsiders. 

In due course African leaders found that their opportunistic resignation to 
dependent development was not as acceptable as they had imagined. Some of 
them began to evolve their own notions of how to proceed. But that did not 
help the takeoff of the development project, which was now hampered by the 
clash between the Africans and their metropolitan patrons and by a confusion 
of agendas, a confusion later compounded by the differences in the agendas of 
the multilateral development agencies, especially the Breton Woods’s 
institutions and UNECA. 

This confusion would not have mattered much if the leaders had been in a 
position to carry out their preferred agenda. But they were too economically 
dependent externally and too weak politically to challenge their economic 
dependence. So they were left with an uncomfortable dilemma. They could 
present their preferred program such as outlined in The Lagos Plan of Action or 
Alternative Framework, but lacking the resources and the will to soldier on in 
self-reliance, they could not do much with it. On the other hand, they could 
count on some assistance in implementing an exogenous agenda such as the 
agenda of Accelerated Development or structural adjustment, which was 
invariably not as sensitive to nationalist aspirations and not as politically risky 
as their own programs, since it came from people who could not be held 
responsible for their failures. Even as the opposition of African governments to  
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the IMF's structural adjustment programs spread and evolved into an alterna-
tive approach, more African countries continue to adopt and implement 
structural adjustment programs. 

In this context, development becomes alienating on all sides. The outsiders 
that fashion the agenda are alienated from it the very moment it is created, 
because it is for others. Although it may be desirable for them to make the 
agenda stick as a manifestation of their values or power, they need not take 
serious interest in it, especially if such commitment entails significant costs. 
Thus after the UN General Assembly's special session on the African crisis and 
the concoction of UNPAAERD and APPER, their creators made little 
contribution toward their implementation. Considerable trouble has gone into 
establishing structural adjustment as the new orthodoxy, but except in a few 
countries such as Ghana, it has gotten so little support that even the Breton 
Woods institutions have been critical of the neglect. Their plea for support is 
not likely to change much. 

For the African leaders the alienation is more ominous. They are saddled 
with a strategy that hardly any of them believe in and that most of them 
condemn. They put up with it to avoid economic sanctions and in the hope of 
eliciting material support from external patrons. Invariably the support does not 
come, but, weak and fearful, they persist in hope. Lacking faith in what they 
are doing and caught between their own interests, the demands of their external 
patrons, and their constituents, African leaders tend to be ambivalent, 
confused, and prone to marginalize development and even their role in its 
pursuit. The development of Africa will not start in earnest until the struggle 
over development agendas is determined. 
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3 
Improbable Strategies 

I have been arguing that the problem in Africa is not so much that 
development failed as that it never really began. Nonetheless, elites in power in 
Africa have had to make an elaborate show of seeking development. In this 
chapter I examine what they have done in the name of development. 

To begin with, one must be aware of the tendency to ignore history, which 
has been the bane of analyses of the development experience in Africa. 
Development strategies and policies do not simply emerge and get 
implemented, their feasibility and success being determined by their formal 
character. Strategies and policies are made and managed by a government in 
office and political elite in power in a historical state and under a particular 
configuration of social forces. One cannot understand development policies 
and strategies, let alone the possibility of development, without referring 
constantly to the nature of the state and the dynamics of the social forces in 
which it is embedded. 

Instead of being a public force, the state in Africa tends to be privatized, 
that is, appropriated to the service of private interests by the dominant faction 
of the elite. The society in which the African state exists is typically segmented 
into small rival political communities, often with strong localized identities, 
competing to capture and exploit state power or at least prevent it from 
oppressing them. 

The nature of the state and the political context of development in Africa 
are such that, with minor exceptions, the commitment of most African leaders 
to development is at best ambiguous. Given a choice between social 
transformations, especially development, and political domination, most 
African leaders choose the latter. Because of circumstances that reach back to 
the colonial experience, most African states tend to be in hostile relation to the 
bulk of their population. 

These are the underlying realities that have made the pursuit of  
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 development in Africa perfunctory, contradictory, and ineffective. Against this 
background I discuss what African governments have tried to do about 
development. 
 

Agriculture 
Somewhat surprisingly, the multilateral development agencies, especially 

the World Bank and donor countries, have been more interested in agricultural 
development than most African governments, which are usually focused on 
industrialization. The Bank's understanding of the significance of agriculture is 
evident in its many reports and policy papers and in its economic blueprints 
such as the long-term perspective study Sub Saharan Africa.- from Crisis to 
Sustainable Growth (1989). A 1993 study states: 
 

Achieving the economic growth objective for the region of at least 4 
percent to 5 percent a year-as set forth in the Bank's long-term perspective 
study-requires agricultural growth rates of at least that amount. Agriculture 
still accounts for about a third of the region's GDP, and its role in 
economic transformation is crucial for its provision of investment capital, 
foreign exchange, and labor to other sectors of the economy. Agricultural 
production is also the most important source of the income needed to 
improve food security and reduce poverty, as most of the poor and food 
insecure is rural people.1 

 

This understanding of the role of agriculture in development is manifested in 
the lending patterns of the Bank and the donor countries, as table 3-1 shows. 

The Bank's understanding of the importance of agriculture has not, 
unfortunately, been matched by success in promoting agricultural production. 
For instance, on the Bank's own admission, at least 50 percent of its 
agricultural projects in Africa have failed its highest failure rate in the world.2 
The underlying reasons for this failure are the same as the reasons why African 
governments have paid relatively limited attention to agriculture and have had 
poor policy performances: the marginalization of women, the refusal to take 
poor people and their interests seriously, the insufficient commitment to 
participative development, and the desire to control what the farmer produces 
and how. 
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     Agriculture is the area where policies touch the lives of the majority of 
people. In Africa 50 to 80 percent of the population lives in rural areas, and this 
rural population are predominantly peasant farmers. Agriculture accounts for 
about 40 percent of gross domestic product, 30 percent of exports, and 75 
percent of employment.3 Yet in 1978, after almost two decades of 
independence, agriculture in Sub-Saharan Africa received only 9 percent of 
government expenditure, less than the 10.5 percent given to defense.4 As Jay 
Cox rightly says, "If agriculture is in trouble, Africa is in trouble.”5  

The government's insufficient attention to agriculture as well as bad 
policies has impaired agricultural development and contributed to food 
dependence. The combination of relative indifference and poor policies caused 
food production per capita to fall by 0.1 percent a year in the 1960s and by 1.4 
percent a year between 1970 and 1974. The World Bank reported in 1989 that 
in the previous thirty years agricultural exports declined steadily and food aid 
rose at 7 percent a year. But "despite the rapid growth in food imports, an 
average of about 100 million people in the early 1980s were undernourished 
-many more in years of poor harvest.”6 

It was not until the tragic food crisis of 1983-85 that the neglect of 
agriculture finally hit home. It was then agreed that investment in agriculture 
should be raised to between 20 and 25 percent of total public investment. 
Indeed, Africa's Priority Program for Economic Recovery (APPER), drawn up 
under the auspices of the Organization of African Unity (OAU), had proposed 
a total agricultural investment of $57.4 billion, or 44.8 percent of total 
investment .7 

In considering agricultural development in Africa, it is useful to distinguish 
between the latent and the manifest functions of agricultural policies. More 
often than not, the former undermines the latter. The manifest function of 
policy demands an increase in agricultural productivity, but the latent function 
emphasizes control. And that is the turn that policy has taken in most of Africa: 
an obsessive concern with the control of what the peasant produces, how he or 
she produces it, and how the product is disposed of. Such are the underlying 
preoccupations that have distorted the concerns of most African governments 
with land reform; for example, the Land Use Decree in Nigeria (1978); 
settlement schemes, 
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such as the million-acre settlement scheme in Kenya; extension services, such 
as the World Bank agricultural development projects; and marketing through 
government-owned marketing boards. 

The dialectics of development and control is well illustrated by the 
Sudanese irrigation scheme of Wad at Abbes. This scheme seems well 
intentioned, an attempt to increase the productivity of cotton farmers by 
providing irrigation, tractors, advisory services, pesticides, transport facilities, 
grading, ginning, and marketing. But this largesse effectively turned farmers 
into wage laborers: 
 

The scheme did not separate farmers from all means of production; 
however, it introduced insecurity of tenure. Farmers can lose their land if 
deemed negligent in cotton production. Between 1980 and 1982 alone at 
least a dozen Wad at Abbes farmers lost land this way. Farmers' ownership 
of means of production was further weakened by the introduction of pumps 
and other technology which is controlled by management. Ownership of a 
parcel of land on the scheme is meaningless without control over the 
technology required in production. For example, farmers have no control 
over the operation or maintenance of irrigation machinery. Insufficient 
irrigation is one of the main reasons they cite for poor yields. 

Control over the production process: with the establishment of the 
scheme, control over the production process was transferred from farmers 
to managers and policy-makers. The household remains the basic unit of 
production in that each household determines and organizes its own labor 
inputs and contracts independently with any hired laborers or 
sharecroppers it employs. Each household also controls production on the 
sorghum plot. But farmers have no choice in the decision to grow cotton. 
And, all inputs to cotton beyond labor are determined by management. 
Farmers cannot limit inputs such as fertilizer and aerial pesticide spraying 
or the prices at which they are supplied although they bear much of the 
cost. Farmers are also locked into a schedule as they receive water in 
succession along canal lines. Each must perform operations on time. Some 
observers of the Gezira Scheme have likened it to an assembly line.8 

 

As that situation suggests, the approach of the Wad al Abbas project was 
more oriented to improved supply through irrigation, pest controls 
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and other measures than to distributional concerns like land tenure and pricing. 
This bias reflects, ill turn, the divergence of interest between political elites and 
peasants. 

The situation in Burundi also illustrates the tendency of African govern-
ments to control agricultural production. Until the early 1990s agricultural 
production and pricing were determined by administrative fiat. The gov-
ernment determined not only prices but also inputs, which it easily controlled 
by supplying free or at subsidized prices. The system of controls was exercised 
by government ministries and parastatals. Now the Cotton Management 
Company remains the sole vendor of cotton, and the Cotton Textile Company 
of Burundi is virtually the monopoly purchaser of cotton, buying 90 percent of 
the cotton sold by the Cotton Management Company. Coffee is similarly 
controlled by the Coffee parastatal, the Burundi Office of Industrial Cultures, 
which became the Office du Café in 1991.9 

The latent function of agricultural policy, which expresses the interest of 
the political elites, can prevail over the manifest function because of highly 
asymmetrical relations of power between the elites and the peasantry. Political 
parties and political formations and interest groups representing the interests of 
peasants are rare in Africa. Rarer still are political formations with a peasant 
base strong enough to threaten the political elites or even muster sufficient 
resources to place the interests of the peasantry on the national agenda. 

Political leaders with strong commitments to the interests of peasants have 
as a rule been brutally repressed, especially when they have tried to form 
political movements. A case in point was the murder in Kenya of J. M. 
Kariuki, who had been private secretary to President Jomo Kenyatta. Kariuki 
was so revolted by the way that the elites, including the president, were 
accumulating land amid acute land scarcity that he spoke out and incurred the 
wrath of the Kenyatta government, 

Political parties or social movements with a peasant base have not been 
allowed to function. In Kenya, a splinter faction of the ruling Kenyan African 
National Union, which opposed the privatization of land, was systematically 
persecuted, and when it joined the opposition Kenya People's Union, that party 
was persecuted until it ceased to exist. In Ghana, Kwanie Nkrumah's ruling 
Convention People's Party severely repressed the National Liberation 
Movement, which was affiliated with cocoa farmers, when the NLM opposed 
the government's cocoa-pricing policy. After constant persecution, including 
assassinations, the NLM was proscribed. 
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I turn now for a more detailed look at agricultural development in two 
countries, Nigeria and Tanzania. 
 

Agricultural Policy Initiatives in Nigeria 
 
At independence, Nigeria, like most African countries, followed the line of 

least resistance and largely continued colonial economic policies. In agriculture 
this meant the promotion of selected export crops such as cocoa, groundnuts, 
and palm produce. The First National Development Plan, 1962-68, had no 
discernible agricultural strategy. No serious attempt was made to encourage 
private investment in agriculture; public investment was minimal and biased 
toward the interests of the elites. Of the total capital expenditure of N676.5 
million for the plan period, 91.9 million, or 13.5 percent, was to go to primary 
production, including agriculture. Of this allocation, approximately 30 percent, 
the largest share was for government-sponsored large-scale projects, especially 
plantations, irrigation schemes, and farm settlements; 23 percent for extension 
services; 13.3 percent for agricultural credit; 11 percent for research; 2.9 
percent for research and training; 7 percent for processing and distribution; and 
14.7 percent for unclassified projects. The allocation to agriculture, 
inordinately small to begin with, was largely unspent. In fact, 42.8 percent of 
the budgeted capital expenditure for the plan period was unspent. The 
government blamed this result on "the weakness of the Ministry of Agriculture 
especially in effective planning and coordination." 

The plan and its pattern of expenditure were biased in favor of export 
crops. Food crops did not elicit much attention. This is perhaps understandable, 
since export crops, especially cocoa, groundnuts, and cotton, rubber, and palm 
products, constituted 75 percent of Nigeria's export earnings. Also, food prices 
had been quite stable and food imports modest, about 10 percent of food 
requirements. 

The decade of the oil boom, 1970-80, reinforced the neglect of agriculture. 
Because of the boom, export earnings increased from 1,000 millionaires in 
1971 to N13, 000 million in 1980. Much of the increase was due to the 
expansion of petroleum production and the rising price of petroleum. The 
period from 1973 to 1978 was the quintessential boom period. In 1974-75 
revenue from petroleum increased by a multiple of five, and petroleum became 
Nigeria's main revenue base, accounting for 90 percent of exports. The boom 
led to a steep increase in federal 
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expenditure, which doubled between 1973 and 1974 and again between 1974 
and 1975.10 

With the oil boom the significance of agriculture was reduced. Agriculture, 
which accounted for 75.9 percent of total federal revenue in 1965, was 
contributing only 2.4 percent by 1980; in contrast, petroleum's share rose from 
2.7 percent in 1960, to 73.7 percent in 1971, to 96.1 percent in 1980. The oil 
boom and the rise in public expenditure that accompanied it had a negative 
impact on agriculture. The extraordinary rise in federal expenditure altered 
relative prices and wages markedly. As the World Bank study edited by Ishrat 
Hussein and Rashid Farui4ee correctly noted, "High wage and price increases 
secured the resources needed to accommodate the demand in no traded goods, 
but they depressed the non-oil traded goods sectors. An exchange rate polity 
that allowed the naira to appreciate with rising oil revenues in combination 
with rising domestic costs meant a sharp deterioration in international 
competitiveness. The negative impact of these policies on agriculture was 
particularly severe."11 For instance, by the second half of the 1970s the export 
of palm oil, cotton, and groundnuts, which had been the major 
foreign-exchange earners before the oil boom, had ceased. The demise of 
agriculture, especially staple crop production, and the reduction of the rural 
labor force by the civil war and urban migration (stimulated by the oil boom) 
put great pressure on the food supply and food prices. 

In the Second National Development Plan, 1970-74, agriculture fared no 
better. This plan was preoccupied with postwar reconstruction. Allocation to 
the economic sector as a proportion of total expenditure declined. The chapter 
of the plan that reviewed policy measures did not discuss agriculture. The plan 
talked generally about ensuring adequate food supplies and expanding exports 
as well as about producing agricultural materials for extensive domestic 
manufacturing activities. But there was little by way of an action program or 
financial commitment. There were to be special agricultural development 
schemes, for which N3 million was provided, and a National Agricultural 
Credit Institution, which was to get N6 million. Federal grants to all the states 
for seed multiplication, extension services, fertilizers, pesticides and 
herbicides, irrigation equipment, tractors and other implements, storage 
facilities, publicity and information, feeds, and so forth, got all of N17 million. 

The Third National Development Plan, 1975-80, reordered priorities 
between the productive sector and infrastructure development in favor 
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of the former, which along with commerce got about 60 percent of estimated 
public investment? One would expect this to mean much more investment in 
agricultural development. But that was not the case. The plan appeared to have 
incorporated the views of the Consortium for the Study of Nigerian Rural 
Development, which did not give priority to agricultural investment, despite 
the background of the Sahelian drought (1972-74), declining food production, 
rising food prices, and escalating food imports. For instance, rice importation 
increased sevenfold in just one year, 1975 to 1976. Despite the impending food 
crisis, allocation to agriculture was only 5 percent of total expenditure. Policy 
favored capital intensive, large-scale projects, particularly irrigation under the 
auspices of the River Basin Development Authorities (RBDAs). 

The RBDAs were a major feature of agricultural policy in this plan period. 
There were to be three RBDAs initially. Each of the projects was expected to 
irrigate twenty to twenty-five hectares at a cost of between N135 million and 
N330 million. But there were considerable cost overruns; the total cost of the 
RBDAs was close to N2.5 billion.12  Nobody now pretends that the RBDAs are 
cost effective or that they can ever be. Even if the initial capital outlay is 
written off, it is unlikely that returns can meet current costs alone. Most 
important, the RBDAs cannot meet the objective of producing enough to 
substitute for imported food, particularly wheat. And they have run into serious 
and continuing resistance from landowners and farmers, leading to violent 
conflicts and loss of lives. 

Other major policy instruments for increasing food crops were the national 
accelerated food production program (NAFPP) and the integrated rural 
development projects. According to the third development plan, the NAFPP 
intended to make selected farmers produce improved seedlings of maize, rice, 
wheat, and cassava that could be distributed to other farmers. These selected 
farmers would effectively be running seed multiplication and demonstration 
plots. The schemes were poorly-funded. The first progress report on the plan 
disclosed that only N1.167 million was made available to all the state 
governments of the federation to carry out this scheme. With such a level of 
funding the scheme could be only a gesture. 

A more serious effort to boost agriculture, particularly food crop devel-
opment, was the establishment of agricultural development projects (ADPs), 
initially launched in 1975 with pilot programs in Fatua (Katsina), Gusau 
(Sokoto), and Gombe (Bauchi). The programs were to be gradually 
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expanded to every state in Nigeria. Although they are joint ventures of the 
government and the World Bank, the ADPs are largely independent of the 
State Ministries of Agriculture and are managed by the World Bank. 

The ADPs are less ambitious than the RBDAs, are less capital intensive, 
and are aimed not at the commercial farmer but at the smallholder. The ADPs 
exist to provide services and facilities to help the smallholder become more 
productive; for example, fertilizers, water supply, equipment, herbicides, 
pesticides, planning, and land-clearing infrastructure development. The 
projects, which cost $30 million each, are mainly funded (about 60 percent) by 
World Bank loans. According to the Bank's Agricultural Sector Review of 
1979, the ADPs expect to reach into the rural areas and to "the productive 
reserve of 90 per cent of Nigeria's farming population.’ 13 

Despite the Bank's claims, there are many who doubt the cost-effectiveness 
of the ADPs and their contribution to agricultural development in Nigeria, 
issues to which I return shortly. Nevertheless, the ADPs constitute one of the 
few serious initiatives on agricultural development on the agenda and were far 
more useful to Nigerian agriculture than the large irrigation projects of the 
RBDAs. All the same, the Nigerian government continued to pour money into 
the large irrigation projects, while under finding the ADPs. For example, the 
large-scale irrigation projects got 72.7 percent of total agricultural expenditure 
in 1980 and 76.2 percent in 1981, whereas the ADPs got only 4.1 percent in 
1980 and 8.1 percent in 1981. 14 

By 1979 the problems of agricultural policy in Nigeria could be seen more 
clearly, and the government was greatly worried, particularly by the impending 
food crisis. The demand for food was growing at 3.5 percent a year, while the 
production growth rate was I percent a year. The government was projecting a 
deficit of 5.5 million tons of grain for the plan period 1981-85. Consequently, 
it became more sensitive to the deficiencies of its policy, a fact aptly reflected 
in the Outline of the Fourth National Development Plan, 1981-85. 15For one 
thing, the government recognized that in the past there had hardly been an 
agricultural strategy, even a bad one. Although the outline claimed to have 
taken a comprehensive view of the problems of development in agriculture, 
such an approach did not emerge. But at least the need for such an approach 
had been recognized. 

The outline was critical of the tendency in the past, especially in the 
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third plan, to emphasize capital-intensive large-scale projects such as the 
irrigation schemes. Because of the failure of those schemes and the increasing 
influence of the World Bank, the government declared it was shifting emphasis 
from large-scale farms, a focus that contributed very little to productivity, to 
smallholders, who account for 90 percent of the domestic food supply. The 
government also committed itself to expanding the ADPs, which it found to 
"have proved quite successful resulting in substantial improvements in incomes 
and living standards of the smallholder farmers in the project areas." But aware 
that the expansion of the ADPs would take a long time, the government 
devised a concurrent smallholder program, the accelerated development area 
program, for areas not yet covered by the ADPs. The program was to apply the 
core elements of the ADP approach, such as the supply of essential inputs to 
small holders. This approach typified the ascendancy of the World Bank in the 
management of Nigerian agriculture. 

Even so, Nigerian policymakers were ambiguous about their new com-
mitment to a smallholder strategy. Curiously, the government continued to 
hang on to the big irrigation projects, which by its own admission were 
unproductive. Under the fourth plan, N34.432 million, or 4.1 percent of the 
government's agricultural expenditure, was allocated to the ADPs; irrigation 
projects got N613.161 million, or 72.7 percent of the expenditure. In 1981 the 
ADPs got N75.098 million, or 8.1 percent of agricultural allocations; the 
irrigation projects got N710.516, or 76.2 percent. How could the irrigation 
projects continue to be funded on this scale by a government that had found 
them incapable of achieving their objectives? Perhaps the Nigerian leaders 
were fond of grand projects. Also, so much money had already gone into the 
projects that it might have seemed less embarrassing to keep the RBDAs going 
than to abort them and fail conspicuously. Finally, for some highly placed 
people, the RBDAs and their irrigation projects provided excellent 
opportunities for easy wealth. 

The most recent initiative in the area of agricultural development policy 
was yet another grand and costly project: the Directorate of Food, Roads, and 
Rural Infrastructure (DFRRI). Its function was to promote the development of 
agriculture and rural Nigeria by improving rural infrastructure, such as roads, 
water supply, electricity, and transportation; and to encourage the production 
of food by ensuring the availability and use of improved inputs, better 
implements, extension services, and so forth, The scale of the operation of the 
DFRRI can be gauged by its share of public expenditure, which dwarfs the 
allocation of every ministry and parasitical except one. The DFRRI got a 
budgetary allocation of N400 million in 1987 and 



N500 million in 1988. In contrast, the Ministry of Education got N4 million in 
1987 and N302 million in 1988; Health had N166.9 million in 1987 and 
N259.9 million in 1988; Industries, N191.2millionin 1987 andN260.2 million 
in 1988; Petroleum and Energy, N104.3 million in 1987 and N402 million in 
1988. Only the Defense Ministry did better than the DFRRI, with N717.6 
million in 1987 and N830 million in 1988. 

The DFRRI was expected to function on the basis of social participation; 
that is, the government would provide financing or seed money for projects 
executed in cooperation with local communities. Instead it became the 
dispenser of huge lucrative contracts. The Nigerian press concurred that the 
DFRRI's presence in rural communities was difficult to see, that it existed 
largely on paper, and that it appeared to have served patronage and corruption 
more than agricultural development. Government appointed inspectors found 
that the DFRRI made false claims about its accomplishments. Not surprisingly 
it has now been abolished. 

The DFRRI illustrates the contradictions between the latent and manifest 
functions of public policy in Nigeria. The concept of the DFRRI is basically 
sound, in the double sense that the development of rural infrastructure, 
especially roads, is essential for expanding agricultural production and that it is 
desirable to effect this development by participative strategies. However, this 
essentially sound policy was subverted by a greedy and corrupt political class 
that set out to appropriate the huge resources of the DFRRI. 
 

Nigerian Agriculture in the Era of Structural Adjustment 
 
By 1976 public expenditure had expanded so much that Nigeria began to 

have a budget deficit; wages continued to rise, and the Nigerian naira 
appreciated rapidly, as much as 100 percent between 1973 and 1978. Nigeria 
became more and indebted. Despite a second oil boom between 1979 and 
1982, the economy slid into crisis. By 1983 the budget deficit had grown to 12 
percent of GDP, and real incomes, which had increased by 200 percent 
between 1972 and 1980, fell by 60 percent. Even as the terms of trade 
deteriorated and interest rates rose, the naira continued to appreciate in real 
terms, ensuring strong demand for foreign exchange and imports. The 
Economic Stabilization Act of 1982, which introduced a set of austerity 
measures including import restrictions and higher import duties, failed to 
alleviate the economic crisis. Growth rates, real incomes, and consumption fell 
steeply, as did the terms of trade. In July 1986 Nigeria was obliged to launch a 
structural adjustment program. 
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The problem is that under structural adjustment programs agriculture still 
remains a "residual" category, expected to derive residual benefits from 
deregulation rather than from more active programs encouraging agricultural 
production. Agricultural policy still suffers from class bias, which often 
translates into ill-conceived policies and contradictions between manifest and 
latent functions. 

In Nigeria agricultural policy under structural adjustment has largely taken 
the form of deregulation, especially the abolition of monopoly commodity 
boards. The government did not launch any bold new initiatives for agricultural 
development, but it hoped that agriculture would benefit from the development 
of the infrastructure, especially roads, in the rural areas. The sign of 
government presence in agriculture lies somewhat incongruously in the 
occasional ADP office; in the odd local government area demonstration farms, 
where fertilizers may be obtained with a great deal of effort and some luck; and 
earlier in the DFRRI's sporadic efforts to improve the rural infrastructure. 

The Nigerian experience in agricultural development is not typical; 
agriculture does not suffer because the political elite interested in controlling 
agricultural surplus, confuses that concern with development policy. In Nigeria 
the enormous revenues from petroleum production make the control of 
agricultural surplus, as well as interest in agricultural development, 
unnecessary. Indeed, agriculture was so neglected that food imports became a 
major element of the Nigerian fiscal crisis. In 1961 oil contributed only 2.7 
percent of total export earnings, while non-oil exports accounted for 97.3 
percent. But the share of oil rose to 92.6 percent in 1975, and 96.1 percent in 
1980, and the share of non-oil exports fell to 7.4 percent in 1975 and to 3.9 
percent in 1980. The non-oil exports were predominantly primary 
commodities: groundnuts and groundnut oil, rubber, palm oil and palm kernel, 
cocoa, and cotton. The five export commodities had been reduced to three by 
1974, when only rubber, palm oil and palm kernel, and cocoa were being 
exported. By 1980 two more export commodities had vanished and only cocoa 
was being exported. 

The Nigerian experience suggests that the problem is not so much failed 
policies but no policies and some self-serving measures. But despite the 
self-serving measures, the absence of policies, and the residual status of 
agriculture, there were some openings for agricultural development. For 
instance, even though the DFRRI became a means of corrupt appropriation for 
the elite in power, it did provide some infrastructure that improved farmers' 
facilities, especially roads and markets. The devaluation of the naira in 1992 
made the internal terms of trade more favorable to 



rural people. 16 Agriculture also benefited from liberalization, especially of 
price and marketing controls. Indeed, the World Bank insists that agriculture 
benefited considerably from Nigeria's adjustment program. 

What the gains of agriculture really tell us is not so much the success of 
present policies but the immense potential for improvements in the event of 
better policies. A 1994 Bank publication makes this point implicitly, 
illustrating the self-serving measures that often pass as public policies in 
Nigeria: 
 

Agriculture. The allocation in the 1992 budget for fertilizer, the largest 
item in the capital allocation for the Ministry of Agriculture, is NO.6 
billion, but the actual total procurement cost is estimated at N3.4 billion, 
and extra budgetary allocations will be required. Of the eleven ongoing 
large-scale irrigation projects, for which N181 million has been allocated, 
only three, representing N63 million of the allocation, are deemed viable. 
Public grain storage facilities, a component of the Federal Strategic Grain 
Reserve Program costing N1.6 billion, are not fulfilling the goal of 
stabilizing food prices and enhancing the food security of the poor. Under 
capital supplementation N150 million has been set aside for project 
execution by a newly established agency, the National Agricultural Land 
Development Authority (NALDA), whose mandate is to address the 
chronic problem of underutilized farm land and rural labor and the high 
cost of land development. This mandate duplicates the activities of other 
agencies. 17 

 

Agricultural Transformation in Tanzania 
 
At independence in 1961, Tanzania, like Nigeria, did not initially try to 

change the inherited system of colonial agriculture. In particular, the country 
retained the colonial emphasis on export crops and may even have amplified it, 
since the variety of available food crops got smaller. Tanzania, however, 
managed the existing agricultural system with less efficiency than in the 
colonial era, if the rising food imports and declining exports is any guide. A 
Tanzanian scholar, L. A. Msambichaka, complains that "both during the 
colonial era and after independence, no state policy was seriously geared 
towards food self-sufficiency or improvement of the 
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human environment. Efforts have never been made to ensure that the nation is 
adequately supplied with enough food domestically."18 

But this situation was truer of the first years of independence. Tanzania is 
distinguished for being one of the few African countries that initiated a 
program of rural and agricultural transformation. The transformation was 
pursued progressively through the village settlement scheme of 1964, the 
Ujamaa village program of 1967, and the villagization scheme of 1973. 

A World Bank mission that visited Tanzania just before independence 
argued that (a) the prospects of agricultural development in Tanzania through 
the improvement of existing farming systems were poor, and (b) the more 
promising option would be through a very intense effort to transform 
agriculture through resettlement in new areas. In 1963 the newly independent 
government in Tanzania accepted the Bank analysis as the basis of its 
agricultural policy, and a Village Settlement Agency was duly established. 

The idea of resettlement, which the British rulers of Tanzania had also 
supported, seemed reasonable in the country's circumstances. The settlement 
pattern of Tanzania's rural population was too scattered. As much as 94 percent 
of the country's rural population of II million lived in relatively isolated 
homesteads rather than villages. There was a compelling reason to develop 
agriculture because the country was dependent on agriculture. Yet agriculture 
was still largely subsistence farming (59 percent of agriculture at 
independence).19 It was difficult to give the necessary support to peasant 
producers when the limitation of resources was greatly compounded by the 
scattered pattern of settlement. For instance, Tanzania had only 373 doctors in 
1967, a ratio of I doctor to 31,842 people.20 It is therefore not surprising that 
Tanzania embarked on resettlement. 

The early settlement schemes were largely voluntary. The settlers came 
mainly from such regions of land scarcity as Kilimanjaro. The settlers were 
liberally provided with inputs, services, and farm machinery. However, this 
benign approach to settlement was marred by paternalism and meddlesome 
officialdom. Even the liberal supply of equipment and services became a 
problem. It was disruptive and in some instances it encouraged the attitude that 
machines will do the work. But most important, the oversupply of tractors and 
other farm technology-in Upper Kiteli a farm 
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of 1,600 acres run by 100 families was given 10 tractors-saddled the settlers 
with debts they could not repay.21 

The concept of agricultural development through resettlement schemes was 
to change as a result not only of the failure of these earlier schemes but also of 
Tanzania's flirtation with socialism in the wake of the Arusha Declaration of 
1967. A central concept of this socialism was Ujamaa, which means family 
head. Ujamaa, whose components are mutual respect, common property, and 
communal labor, also became Tanzania's strategy of agricultural development. 
The ruling party, Tanzania African National Union (TANU), began to 
encourage people to form Ujamaa villages. Official policy was still committed 
to voluntary settlement, but government and party officials, anxious to look 
like pioneers of progress, became increasingly manipulative and coercive to 
achieve a higher rate of resettlement in the communal villages. For all that, 
there were no more than 800 Ujamaa villages by 1969. 

Dissatisfied by the slow growth of Ujamaa villages, the party and the 
presidency increased the pressures for their formation. President Julius Nyerere 
launched the plan to move everyone in the Dodoma area to Ujarnaa villages 
and, to emphasize the importance of resettlement, lived in one settlement 
village, Chamwino, for some time. Government and party officials then 
became militant about moving people to villages. Since the movement tended 
to be hostile to commercial farming, it stirred up strong antipathies and even 
led to clashes and the assassination of a senior party official, Wilbert Klerruu. 
According to government statistics, the number of Ujamaa villages rose from 
1,956 in 1970 to 5,556 in 1972 .22 But these statistics should be treated 
cautiously. Government and party officials had become so zealous about 
creating Ujamaa villages that they registered as Ujamaa, villages that had no 
communal farming activities. Some were merely existing villages into which 
people from surrounding homesteads were crowded. 

This enthusiasm was carried to a point where some officials talked about 
villagization. As waging war,  thus underlining the political elites' 
self-absorbed construction of values. Despite its apparent radicalism, suggested 
by its commitment to the abolition of commercial farms, the autonomy of the 
villages, and the empowerment of peasants, Ujamaa moved on inexorably to 
enhancing the role of party and government officials. These officials, anxious 
to show results to please TANU and protect their 
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careers and privileges were impatient with democratic procedures and became 
increasingly authoritarian. 

Ujamaa villages had actually been planned to have their own local 
government; hence they were not subject to the jurisdiction of the national 
Ward Development Committee (WDC) and the TANU branch. They had their 
own Ward Development Committees and their own TANU branch. But studies 
of the Ujamaa in the West Lake Region show that the intended localization of 
democracy was not realized. The decision making organs were the WDC and 
the General Meeting. The General Meeting, an assembly of all adults in the 
village and all government and party staff, was supposed to be the sovereign 
body of the Ujamaa village. But it usually met only once a year. Apart from 
electing the WDC, the General Meeting became largely ceremonial. And the 
democratic possibilities of the VVDC were dissipated by informality, 
infrequent meetings, and meetings with unclear official status, selective 
invitations, and the making of decisions outside official channels. This 
situation allowed party and government officials to exercise real power, 
particularly the agricultural field officer (AFO), who was responsible to the 
government for the operation of the village and who by virtue of that role was 
also responsible for all communication between the village and the 
government. 

The zeal of officials to show results may have undermined their sense of 
realism. For instance, the four-year plan of Ntobeye projected banana 
cultivation of eighty hectares bore whole, fishpond, a large herd of goats, dairy 
cows, beef cattle. They would require a total investment of TShl,289,000 for a 
cattle dip, stoves, maize grinders and sellers, 80 draft oxen, water supply, 
bulldozer, two tractors, and so on.23 By the standards of what was possible, as 
reflected in the already considerable experience of villagization in Tanzania, 
this was more a fantasy than a plan. The lack of realism on the part of officials 
and their effort to bring performance toward their plan targets made them 
coercive and increased the alienation of officials and peasants to the detriment 
of productivity. It is not surprising that for all its good intentions Ujamaa did 
not bring about the expected increase in productivity.24 

The response of the Tanzanian government and TANU to the problems of 
agricultural development through Ujamaa was, interestingly enough, more 
paternalism and coercion, this time tainted with barely repressed anger. 
Officials felt that the people had let them down by not taking 
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more enthusiastically to the Ujamaa movement and not working harder to 
produce more. 

On November 6, 1973, President Nyerere announced a new policy of 
compulsory villagization. In an uncharacteristically angry speech, the president 
reprimanded Tanzanians for not reciprocating all the effort and sacrifices the 
leadership had made to serve their needs and for frustrating the country's 
socialist development policies through indifference and idleness. The president 
said that, although he could not compel Tanzanians to be socialists, be would 
ensure that all Tanzanians lived in Ujamaa villages by 1976. As many as 5 to 6 
million people may have moved in what was a gigantic operation of 
unprecedented mass movement of people in Africa. Everything was pressed 
into the service of the operation-TANU cadres, the media, the army, the police, 
and the civil service. The government mounted a massive propaganda effort to 
promote the move, portraying people who opposed moving as individualist, 
selfish, antisocial, unpatriotic, and even immoral. 

Convinced that one reason for the program's lack of success was the 
attitudes and activities of "petit-bourgeois elements," the government an-
nounced the removal of all middlemen in commerce and trade. Under 
Operation Maduka, private shops were closed and replaced with cooperatives; 
goods were to be distributed directly by officials or by Ujamaa shops. These 
measures were predictably disastrous, since they threw the distribution system 
into confusion, and quickly led to the disappearance of essential commodities 
like kerosene, sugar, and soap. Sensing popular discontent, the government 
restored licenses to some private stores and agreed that private stores could 
operate until viable Ujamaa stores were available. Operation Maduka slowed 
down but continued to advance. By 1977 the number of Ujamaa and 
cooperative dukas (shops) was 3,284, about me percent of the number of 
private dukas.25 

It is paradoxical that while using coercion to move millions of people, 
often against their will, to new homes and new relations of production and new 
life-styles, the leadership of Tanzania continued to phrase its goals in 
emancipator values, in terms of the empowerment of the people by improving 
their productivity and providing better amenities for them; in essence, freeing 
the people from the exploitative grip of the petite bourgeoisie. The paradox 
comes into clearer relief when political reforms that accompanied compulsory 
villagization are examined. 
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The political reforms, like the economic ones, were presented as ways to 
institutionalize effective local government and facilitate the participation of the 
grass roots in government and to destroy the power of "local notables," who 
had used the District Councils (whose power was not drastically diminished) to 
manipulate and control the rural population. Instead, what the political reforms 
did was to facilitate government control of the rural population and its 
productive activities. Under the reforms, the regions received the status of 
ministries, with the regional party secretary as the political head and a newly 
created post, the development director (which was analogous to the principal 
secretary of a ministry), in charge of development, clearly the main business of 
government and society. 

The structural and functional differentiation within the bureaucracy that 
existed at the level of the central government was done away with. All the 
responsibilities that would normally be handled by different ministries were 
now fused in one monolithic structure and in one person, the regional party 
secretary. Aided by a technocratic arm, the development director, he or she 
made every major decision about every sphere of social and economic life, and 
he or she was the link between the region and the central government and the 
party. The regional party secretary controlled all development activities-this 
control was the very inspiration for these political reforms. This system has 
actually rolled back the development of civil society because it has drastically 
reduced the prospect of autonomous development initiatives. 

The same regional structure was replicated with the same effect at the level 
of the village. By 1977 the government decided to post officials to each village, 
called village managers. Although they were to function under the Village 
Council, their status as the central government in the village tended to place the 
Village Council effectively under them, especially since they were also the 
designated managers of the productive activities of the village. Here again 
control overrode development and even party ideology. 

To conclude, in a certain sense the pursuit of agricultural development 
through Ujamaa was a modest success: the policy certainly succeeded in its 
objective of consolidating residential patterns in rural Tanzania. The Tanzania 
government claimed that within a decade of villagization, 13,500,000 peasants 
were consolidated into 7,300 villages, a fact that reflects 90 percent compliance 
of the rural population.26 President Nyerere 
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may well have been correct in insisting that this consolidation laid the 
foundation for a better life for the people of Tanzania. However, the problems 
and failures of the policy were immense.27 

The people did not accept the TANU notion of communalism, and though 
they generally lived in Ujamaa villages, they rejected its communal demands, a 
posture demonstrating that the content was lost to the form. After a decade of 
villagization, less than 2.5 percent of GDP was derived from communal 
agricultural activity.28 The Ujamaa movement did not transform Tanzanian 
agriculture and did not succeed in its ambitious plans of increasing 
productivity. 

These failures were the result of putting control by the political class ahead 
of development. All the major contradictions of the Ujamaa movement arose 
from paternalism, coercion, and the self-centered presumptions of the political 
class. 
 

Tanzanian Agriculture under Structural Adjustment 
 
In its first six years of independence, 1961-67, Tanzania achieved a 

laudable growth rate of 6 percent a year; between 1967 and 1973 its GDP was 
still growing at nearly 5 percent a year. But external shocks, such as the steep 
rise of oil prices, drought, and poor policies, began to take their toll; growth 
declined and indebtedness increased. The agricultural growth rate declined to 2 
percent a year. Between 1976 and 1985 agricultural exports fell approximately 
30 percent, and receipts from exports fell from $426 million in 1977 to $184 
million in 1985 .29A structural adjustment program introduced between 1982 
and 1985 failed to stem Tanzania's slide into economic crisis. President 
Nyerere resigned in 1985 and handed over the presidency to Ali Hassan 
Mwinyi, who launched an adjustment program in 1986. 

Agriculture was not given many positive incentives but was expected to 
benefit from the reforms in the other sectors, especially their liberalization. As 
in Nigeria, agricultural performance improved modestly in the era of structural 
adjustment. Growth in agricultural GDP, which averaged 2 percent a year 
between 1978 and 1985, rose to 4.9 percent a year between 1986 and 1991, and 
the value of food sales increased 100 percent between 1983 and 1988.30 

However, it is misleading to read this improved 
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performance as the effect and the vindication of the structural adjustment 
program; it is better understood in relation to the self-interest of elites. 

Self-interest led the elites to control agricultural production and the 
distribution and consumption of agricultural commodities through numeric. 
Oust institutions and regulations. But when these controls, often justified in the 
name of socialism, appeared to be choking the economy to death, the elites 
beat a retreat from control and liberalized. Liberalization brought some benefits 
to peasant producers, but that was incidental. What mattered was the survival 
and legitimacy of the political class, which would have been jeopardized by 
economic collapse. Structural adjustment was at best a peg on which to hang 
self-interest at a historical conjuncture. The policy must also be understood in 
terms of its latent and manifest functions; then one can see why the policy 
takes on a particular form and a particular content in a given situation. 

Even under adjustment the contradiction between state and peasantry, 
between elites and masses, remains. Interests and politics define policies and 
the limits of agricultural performance. Significantly, the Tanzanian political 
class only backed off from controlling agriculture to avoid embarking on 
affirmative action to promote agricultural production. This situation continues 
to severely limit the development of agriculture. For instance, the input market 
remains "largely monopolistic, inefficient, and unresponsive to the needs of 
farmers.”31 The rural road networks so essential for agricultural development 
received little attention, and still less investment, so that by 1989 only 10 
percent of the rural roads were in good condition. The roads are receiving some 
attention now only because of substantial funding from external donors .32 

Overall, "agricultural services and infrastructure for poor farmers have not 
improved. Agricultural extension has been affected adversely by the general 
erosion of civil service salaries and shortages of government if financing, 
trained personnel, and transport facilities. These problems were rampant well 
before the economic recovery program but have not lessened under the 
program, and in some instances they have deteriorated further. Rural roads 
continue to be deplorable, and transport networks for agricultural produce are 
inadequate and distributed unevenly throughout the country."33 

To conclude, one cannot consider the prospects for agricultural devel-
opment in purely economic terms. One must look at interests and their 
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configurations and at the social location of actors and their politics, because 
those factors are decisive. Their significance is dissembled even in many 
analyses undertaken by the World Bank; for example, in A Strategy to Develop 
Agriculture in Sub-Saharan Africa and a Focus for the World Bank. 34 It is 
interesting that most of the constraints on agricultural development discussed 
in the report are related to the dynamics of interest group competition and the 
politics of class, even though the report does not recognize the constraints in 
that way. 

One constraint discussed is the poor state of roads and communications, a 
problem that the report links to “a heavy urban bias in most African public 
expenditure and policy regimes which has tended to focus transport 
infrastructure expenditures in large mega-cities which have little trade with 
rural areas, and which are dependent on imports. Secondary towns, which are 
collection markets for agricultural products, distribution points for farm 
imputes and places in which farmers children could seek secondary education, 
have often been neglected."35 

Another major constraint, according to the report, is the tendency for 
governments to crush individual initiative at the farm and enterprise level by 
setting agricultural product prices too low and by maintaining overvalued 
exchange rates that effectively reduce the price of agricultural exports and 
agricultural products that compete with imports. In the vast majority of cases, 
African farmers have received only a fraction of the world price. Most recently, 
this situation has become much worse, since world prices for most agricultural 
commodities produced in Africa have fallen. Furthermore, agricultural 
stagnation is being perpetuated partly because "autonomous farmers' 
organizations and cooperatives, and farmer participation in the management of 
agricultural development was actively discouraged.”36 

Another impediment to agricultural development mentioned in the report is 
that "inadequate rural health, rural water, family planning, and educational 
facilities have resulted in a high incidence of relatively unhealthy, poorly 
educated people in rural areas, expanding in numbers at a high rate. Such 
people are less likely than better-educated, healthy people where numbers are 
expanding at a lower rate to innovate in agriculture and in agro-processing. 
“Changes of land tenure systems are also compounding the problems of 
agricultural transformation: "Many governments have nationalized land. Some 
of this land is distributed for other uses, such as plantations owned by the state 
or by private enterprise 
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and farms owned by the elite. Both of these have reduced the traditional 
security of land tenure." Finally, in regard to the status of women, the report 
argues that for the African woman who is typically the African farmer and 
housekeeper, it is more difficult now "to maintain the required food production 
on increasingly smaller pieces of land. As forests recede, women must walk 
further for water as well. Increased work burdens on women make it difficult 
for them to apply the labor needed to intensify agriculture."37 

The report strikingly illustrates the significance of class and power 
relations for agricultural development, providing insight into the clash between 
its latent and manifest functions. 
 

Conclusion: The Problem of Agriculture 
Appearances notwithstanding, the commitment of African leaders to 

agricultural development is problematic. The difficulty is not that they do not 
want agricultural development or that they are not attempting to bring it about. 
The difficulty is rather that their intentions and actions filter through complex 
layers of self-interest, and the policies that emerge effectively cease to be 
policies of agricultural development, as opposed to, for instance, strategies of 
survival, power, or accumulation. 

To all appearances, agricultural policies in Africa have been dominated by 
the struggle of the political class against the peasantry over the control of the 
peasants' production and surplus. Such is to be expected in a continent whose 
leaders are seeking capitalist development in the context of largely recapitalize 
social relations of production. In most countries of Africa a stalemate seems to 
exist in the articulation between the capitalist and the recapitalize modes of 
production. The capitalist mode has become dominant but without 
accomplishing consumption. It is this contradiction that the state and capital on 
the one hand, and the peasantry on the other, are acting out. 

It has been argued in Goran Hyden's Beyond Ujamaa in Tanzania (1980), 
for instance, that development requires the liquidation, or at least the 
subordination, of the peasantry to the other social classes, that Africa's progress 
has been hampered by the persistence of what Hyden calls the "uncaptured 
peasantry." The behavior of the state in rural Africa might be seen in this 
context as a battle against the "insidious" freedom of the peasant, which is 
limiting the penetration of capitalism. Quite often, the 
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process of capturing the peasant takes the form of repressive legislation. A 
conspicuous example is Nigeria's Land-Use Decree (1978), which vested all 
land in the government on the plea that doing so would facilitate the 
availability of land for development. What the decree has done is to give legal 
backing to the expropriation of the peasant farmer's land for other use. 

Sometimes the methods of this struggle are much cruder. Thandinka 
Mkandawire is right in pointing out that African countries are behaving as 
though they have accepted the Hyden thesis that the African peasant must be 
crushed. As a result, there has been increasing social differentiation in the rural 
areas, land alienation and concentration through various schemes of 
"privatization," increasing consumption of the labor process by capital, and a 
more repressive presence of the state apparatus in the rural areas.38 

Since capital and peasantry are not in direct exchange relations, capital and 
state have to find other ways to control and appropriate peasant production. 
That may well be the main latent function of the measures paraded in Africa as 
policies and programs of agricultural development. They are arguably ways of 
controlling peasant production and appropriating surplus. Subsidized inputs, 
improved seedlings, agricultural credit and its inevitable "conditionality," 
quality control, extension services, and the lure of innovative technology can 
be used to determine what the peasant will produce and also how it is going to 
be produced and distributed. 

Through these methods, the peasant has been steered to the production of 
industrial crops that local capital needs as inputs or to the production of what 
the state needs to earn foreign exchange. In addition, the peasant's surplus is 
regularly appropriated by complex mechanisms, to the disadvantage of rural 
producer’s -methods such as taxation, licensing, overpriced inputs, monopoly 
buying of produce, and differentials in Producer and world prices. 

The interests of the political elite underlie the turning of the internal terms 
of trade against peasants; the emphasis given to export crops even in the face 
of food shortages; the distribution of land in favor of those who do not put it to 
the most productive use; the use of agricultural support systems to control 
production and facilitate the appropriation of the surplus product; and the 
preference for large-scale capital-intensive projects, such as the irrigation 
schemes of the RBDAs, which offer policymakers 
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lucrative deals. These interests could allow the latent functions of agricultural 
policy to override its manifest functions. Insofar as that happens, the 
assumption of a continuing process of agricultural development becomes 
doubtful, it is not surprising that agricultural growth in Africa has been 
minimal, lagging behind population growth rates (see table 3-2). 
 

Industrialization 
Industrialization is beset by the same problems as agricultural transfor-

mation and by the same results. Like agricultural transformation, it often 
receives low priority. Its latent functions invariably clash with and override its 
manifest function. Initially, most African leaders had hoped that someone else 
would take on the burden of development, while they concentrated on the 
struggle for power and accumulation. Insofar as they showed interest in 
development, their overwhelming inclination was to move according to the 
contours of established colonial relations. 

The first post-independence development plans in Africa-Nigeria's 
Development Plan, 1962-68; Kenya's First Development Plan, 1966-70; 
Tanzania's First Plan, 1964 -69; Zambia's White Paper on Industrial Policy, 
1964; Malt's Rapport sure le Plan Quinquennial de Développement Eco-
nomique et Social de la Republique due Mali, 1961-1965-all assumed capital, 
technological, market, and management dependence. The Nigerian plan 
projected 50 percent of capital requirements from external sources; Tanzania's 
plan projected 78 percent of development expenditure to be financed 
externally. Like most African countries, Tanzania carried its financial 
dependence into the postcolonial era. The apparent resignation of African 
countries to dependence was as much a reflection of objective necessities as of 
subjective contingencies. To begin with, the dependence of the economies left 
hardly any room for maneuver. Tables 3-3, 3-4, and 3-5 tell the story of 
dependence and the limited leverage for endogenous development. 
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The African successor to the colonial regime consisted not so much of a 
capitalist class as a mix of salaried persons and petite bourgeoisie: pensioners, 
lawyers, engineers, doctors, traders, teachers, ex-servicemen, journalists, 
religious leaders, farmers, small contractors, and trade unionists.39 These were 
people whose political power did not have a strong economic base. They did 
not have confidence in their ability to manage a capitalist economy, especially 
one they did not control. Other groups in the society were likely to be even less 
qualified to manage. 

Although the ability of the new rulers to manage economic development 
was doubtful, as well as their inclination to do so, we on the outside have 
readily assumed that Africa's ruling elites are bent on developing their 
countries. Our focus has been on the feasibility, success, or failure of African 
development projects, and particularly on how to improve their effectiveness. 

But what is the country that is being developed? Who is doing this 
developing and why? Consider, for example, Nigeria. It is still a contested 
terrain of conflicting identities even after three decades of independence and a 
still longer period of being one political entity. Possibly some of Nigeria's 
elites think of themselves primarily as Nigerians and place their Nigerian 
identity above all other identities. But many more are ambivalent about what 
their primary identity should be. And even more place their Nigerian identity 
below that of their local community, nation, or ethnic group. In Nigeria, as in 
most African countries, the state remains a battleground where individuals 
fight for whatever power or resource they can 
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capture. In the struggle people may treat public office as a resource or 
appropriate public funds. Such behavior has led to comments about public 
corruption, lack of accountability, and absence of public-spiritedness in Africa, 
judgments that entirely miss the point. 

Because of the historical legacy and objective conditions of contemporary 
Africa, a national development project in most African countries is not a 
rational undertaking. A few countries, such as Tanzania and Botswana, do have 
a fairly homogeneous culture, political integration, and leaders who have a 
credible sense of a national development project. But many more, such as 
Nigeria, Zaire, Uganda, Kenya, and Sudan, are so socially heterogeneous and 
politically fragmented from the exploitation of ethnic and other social 
differences that it is difficult to talk of a national development project. In some 
extreme cases, such as Zaire, the assumption of a development project and of a 
political leadership bent on development is patently absurd. In Zaire, as also in 
Togo, Somalia, and Sudan, ruler ship appears to be an exercise in "how to ruin 
a country. 40 

Nevertheless, all the leaders of Africa know they have to be seen to be 
assiduously promoting development. In most cases their efforts amount to little 
more than sporadic interventions that have been usually ineffective 
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and unsustainable. Thus pursuit of industrialization in Africa has meant drifting 
from one received strategy to another in total indifference to historical 
specificity; each strategy is abandoned in turn as it falls victim to weak 
political will, the selfish interests of the agents of change, and hostile 
conditions at home and abroad. 
 

Import Substitution 
The first-generation development plans of post-independence Africa, 

following the patterns of colonial plans, emphasized infrastructure and the 
social sector rather than the productive sector. For instance, in Ghana's first 
full-blown post-independence plan the Second Five-Year Plan, launched in 
1959-the productive sector got only 20.3 percent of planned investment, while 
infrastructure and social services got 79.7 percent. 

African leaders soon became dissatisfied with this manner of proceeding; 
they began to be conscious of the pervasive weaknesses arising from the lack 
of industrialization and the problems of dependence. Some were concerned 
about the deteriorating terms of trade, and many of them, conflating 
development with industrialization, were no longer so comfortable with 
remaining mere producers of primary commodities. The second-generation 
development plans began to shift emphasis to the productive sector and to 
grope for a strategy of industrialization. The first strategy adopted was import 
substitution. 

In the 1960s manufacturing did grow considerably. In 1960 real 
manufacturing output for Sub-Saharan Africa was only 6 percent of GDP; 
between 1960 and 1965 its rate of growth was 9.3 percent a year, well above 
the growth rate of GDP.41 From the middle 1960s, it declined steadily, and 
between 1975 and 1980 the growth rate became negative. 

Despite the impressive growth rate of manufacturing from 1960 to the 
early 1970s, Sub-Saharan Africa did not keep up with growth rates in other 
developing areas. In that period Africa's share of global manufacturing value 
added rose from 0.7 percent to 0.8 percent. In contrast, between 1960 and 1975 
the Latin American share rose from 4.1 to 4.8 percent, and the Asian share 
from 2.2 percent to 3.0. Africa's share of manufacturing exports fell from 1.1 
percent to 0.6 percent between 1970-71 and 1975-76.42 

It is interesting to look at the changes over time in the distribution of 
manufacturing production between the consumer, intermediate, and 
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capital goods of nine African countries engaged in import substitution (see 
table 3-6). In the early and mid- I 960s, when African countries embarked on 
industrialization, simple consumer goods such as textiles, beer, beverages, and 
soap made the highest contribution to manufacturing output, a contribution that 
averaged 58.17 percent of total production. In the late 1970s it averaged 55.5 
percent. The share of intermediate goods averaged 28.62 percent in the earlier 
period and 29.5 in the later one. The contribution of capital goods varied 
widely, from 1.1 percent for Ethiopia to 25.0 percent for Ivory Coast, and 
averaged 13.23 percent. By 1980 the contribution of capital goods still varied 
widely, from 2.3 percent in Ethiopia to 24.0 percent in Zimbabwe, for an 
average of 14.4 percent. Overall there was not that much change between the 
periods. 

Looking at the import substitution experience of Kenya, Tanzania, and 
Zambia, one finds that all three countries expanded their manufacturing sector 
considerably between 1964 and 1977, with Kenya achieving the highest growth 
rate, 8.4 percent. But just what accounts for this growth? As table 3-7 shows, 
import substitution contributed an impressive 55 percent of manufacturing 
output for Zambia between 1965 and 1972. This was due not to export 
expansion but to local satisfaction of existing domestic demand. Following the 
Unilateral Declaration of Independence by Southern Rhodesia and the 
imposition of sanctions in 1965, Zambia had to find a means of obtaining 
locally the goods it had imported from Southern Rhodesia. Thus there was a 
sharp expansion in the production of textiles, leather, clothing, chemicals, and 
petroleum products. 

In Tanzania, import substitution made no contribution to the expansion of 
manufacturing output in a similar period, a fact that is all the more surprising 
considering Tanzania's adoption of the philosophy of self-reliance. A trend that 
was perceptible in Kenya-namely, the simultaneous replacement and increase 
of imports-occurred in a more dramatic way in Tanzania. The import of 
textiles, clothing, beverages, and mineral products decreased by replacement, 43 
but the import of other consumer goods, especially wood products and 
processed foods, rose just as fast. This process of neutralization was 
accentuated by the modest rise in the import of intermediate and capital goods 
(table 3-7). 

It remains to consider the relation of import substitution to import 
dependence: to be specific, the extent to which manufacturing production 
depends on imported inputs (table 3-7). In Zambia, imported inputs as a 
percent of gross output (the import coefficient) decreased from 26 percent 
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in 1964 to 18 percent in 1970. This change largely reflects input decline and 
value added in wood, textile, beverages, and metallic mineral and tobacco 
products. In Tanzania, the input coefficient fell by only 2 percent in the same 
period. Here the sharp decline of import dependence in consumer goods was 
offset by increasing import dependence in intermediate and capital goods. In 
Kenya, the import coefficient, far from failing, rose by 10 percent. There are 
two explanations for this: the importance of multinational corporations in the 
economy of Kenya, which often find it more profitable to procure inputs 
abroad from their own subsidiaries or associates, and by the higher share of 
intermediate and capital goods in Kenyan manufacturing. 

To sum up the experience, constraints, and effects of import substitution 
strategy in Africa, the imports substituted tended to be very simple consumer 
goods such as textiles, beverages, and foods. Instead of moving on to 
intermediate and capital goods, African industrialization usually got trapped in 
the manufacture of simple consumer goods. In a few places the consumer 
goods share of manufacturing output actually increased rather than diminished. 
Africa achieved some increase in manufacturing output from the 1960s to the 
early 1970s without a significant change in its industrial structure. 

In the course of import substitution, African countries become less 
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dependent on imported consumer goods, but their dependence on imported 
intermediate and capital goods increased in the process, sometimes neutralizing 
the gains of reduced consumer goods imports and putting severe pressure on 
their balance of payments. The African experience of import substitution 
indicates that the strategy tends to run into difficulties after the initial period in 
which basic consumer goods are replaced. To move beyond consumer goods to 
intermediate and capital goods has been difficult for many reasons, including 
the no availability of capital and technological know-how and a preference for 
imported inputs. The East Asian countries that started with import substitution 
largely avoided these problems by greater discipline within the political class 
and business community, a better macroeconomic framework, and rapid 
movement toward an export push. This is well documented in the World 
Bank's The East Asian Miracle (1993). 

The import substitution strategy was also greatly hampered by a limited 
domestic demand. Most African countries are too small and too poor to 
generate the demand to sustain continued industrialization on a scale that 
would offset the constraint of not being able to replace intermediate and capital 
goods. Exports might have been a way around this problem. But then the 
problems of protectionism in foreign markets and the competitive weakness of 
African exports would arise. It did not take long for Africans to discover the 
limits of import substitution and to recognize the need for a new approach to 
industrialization. But by then Africa's development problems had been 
compounded by the oil crisis, declining agricultural productivity (itself 
associated with an inappropriate industrialization strategy), deteriorating terms 
of trade, and escalating indebtedness. 

I have followed convention and talked of import substitution. However, 
what was being practiced in Africa was not strictly speaking import substi-
tution but rather import reproduction, which implies the domestic production of 
the particular product that was formerly imported and focuses on 
product-specific rather than generic functionality. It does not disaggregate the 
product into its cultural and aesthetic qualities and its function, Import 
substitution, on the other hand, makes this disaggregating in an effort to reach 
the "generic" character of the product, the purpose it serves, and the function it 
fulfills. Once that essence is grasped, a new product can be made to serve the 
function and yet be physically and aesthetically a much different product. 

In being oriented to reproduction rather than substitution, Africa was 
taking on a more difficult task, which allowed for less flexibility and 
compounded the prospect of failure. But this choice should not be re- 
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garded as a simple one, reflecting the state of mind of policy makers. Rather, it 
is a choice historically and objectively constituted by the dependence of 
African leaders on the international development community and by the 
domination of African economies by multinationals. 
 

Export Promotion 
Export promotion was both a logical progression of import substitution and 

a reaction to its constraints. Foreign markets had to be found to deal with the 
problem of limited domestic demand and capacity utilization and to realize 
economies of scale. Because import substitution industrialization in Africa 
relied so heavily on imported inputs and the mobilization of capital to purchase 
machinery, it created a demand for foreign exchange. Export promotion was 
seen as a way to obtain the needed foreign exchange. As import substitution 
industrialization in Africa got under way, many countries found themselves 
producing too much relative to their capacity to import.44 These were some of 
the circumstances that pushed African leaders into the export promotion route. 

Export promotion appears to have been even less successful than import 
substitution. It was being pursued during a period of global export expansion, 
1965 to 1973, when export volume in manufactured goods for the world as a 
whole was growing at 10.7 percent a year. For developing countries as a group, 
the growth rate was higher still, 11.6 percent a year. For Sub-Saharan Africa 
the growth of export volume in manufactures was 7.5 percent a year in 
1965-73. Between 1973 and 1980 it declined to 5.6 percent a year; the decline 
continued in the period 1980-84, when it was only 2.9 percent a year. The 
growth rate rose in 1986, but by 1987 it had declined to - 0. 3  percent a year.45 

In primary products, in which Sub-Saharan Africa is supposed to have 
comparative advantage, performance was just as bad. From 1965 to 1975 the 
growth of export volume of primary products for Sub-Saharan Africa was 15.3 
percent a year. In 1973-80 it declined dramatically to -0.1 percent a year, and 
went down to - 8.2 percent a year in 1980 - 84. For 1987 it was estimated at - 
7.4 percent a year. Africa is lagging not only behind other primary producers 
but also behind the industrialized countries.46 

One might think that Africa's export drive would benefit from the 
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abundant supply of labor, labor intensity, and low wages. But African wages 
are relatively high compared with those of some other developing countries. At 
the same time, productivity is low, making it very difficult for African products 
to compete in the world market. This constraint, however, could have been 
reduced by suitable policies such as exchange rate adjustment. 

Another obstacle to export promotion is the influence of multinational 
corporations in African economies. They offer some possibilities for export 
promotion, especially technical know-how, productive efficiency, and 
worldwide networks. But reliance on them tends to accentuate dependence, 
creating problems for the expansion of manufacturing and exports. Also, the 
multinationals tend to relate to Africa mainly as a source of raw materials and a 
market for manufactured goods. Processing natural resource-based 
commodities does not offer significant opportunities for export expansion 
either. As Ravi Gulhati and Uday Sekhar argue, "Many resource-based 
activities are very demanding of skills, capital and energy. Many are subject to 
sizable economies of scale. Some are subject to the monopolistic or 
oligopolistic control of trans-national corporations, Tariff rates in OECD 
markets tend to rise with the extent of processing, and shipping freight rates are 
frequently biased in favor of primary commodities."47 In the face of these 
problems the export promotion strategy failed. That strategy, like import 
substitution, reinforces the tendency of African regimes to rely on the funds of 
the international development agencies and to follow the line of least 
resistance. 

Some of these problems could have been overcome under different 
circumstances. But that did not happen because of weak institutions and 
failures of the political class, including indiscipline and corruption associated 
with the inability to engender a national development project and a strong 
sense of commitment to it. For instance, in Ivory Coast, Kenya, Nigeria, 
Ghana, and Zaire, the principle of promoting specific industries to encourage 
exports was subverted by parochialism and rent seeking and in Nigeria by 
large-scale projects such as the liquefied natural gas project. The Abeokuta 
Steel Mill failed because of corruption; basically the political elite tended to 
see such projects not so much in terms of the compelling need for national 
development as in terms of accumulation, patronage, and power. Again, the 
contrast to the performance of the East Asian political class is instructive .48 
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Indigenization 
Some African countries, such as Nigeria, Ghana, Tanzania, and Senegal, 

considered indigenization of ownership and control of their economies as 
important aspects of industrialization. Under the influence of dependency 
theory, they saw an organic relationship between dependence and under-
development. According to this view, dependence stands in the way of auto 
centric growth and tends to produce incongruities between the structures of 
production and consumption.49 Indigenization was also motivated by 
nationalism. The independence movement was about the people taking control 
of their affairs, and the quest for development was integral to it. Foreign 
ownership and control of the economy was a constant reminder that the 
fulfillment of the nationalist aspiration had hardly begun. Indigenization was 
always on the agenda, albeit sometimes only implicitly. 
 

Tanzania and Kenya 
In Tanzania indigenization was pursued in the context of the parasitical 

system. That system came to dominate the economy in the wake of the Arusha 
Declaration, which committed Tanzania to socialism and self-reliance. In 1965 
the National Development Corporation was founded to oversee the 
industrialization of Tanzania. It was the offshoot of the Tanganyika 
Development Corporation, founded in 1963. A system of parastatals was 
created for the financial sector, namely, the Tanzania Development Finance 
Corporation, the Bank of Tanzania, the Central Bank of Commerce, and the 
Tanzania Investment Bank. Agriculture was placed under two parastatals, the 
National Agricultural and Food Corporation and the National Agricultural 
Company. Retail came under the State Trading Corporation. By 1966 Tanzania 
had 43 parastatals and by 1973, 112. 

The elaborate parastatal system in Tanzania projects a picture of an 
economy in which ownership and control have been localized. But that is more 
apparent than real. Consider the control of the parastatals themselves. In 
1967-70 external funds contributed 13 percent of parasitical expenditure. As 
Tanzania pursued indigenization and self-reliance, the external contribution to 
parasitical expenditure rose steadily and steeply: 20 percent in 1970-71, 56 
percent in 1971-72, 73 percent in 1972-73, and 59 percent in 1973-74. 

In Kenya the issue of indigenization assumed a special urgency for 



reasons associated with settler colonialism. One factor making it so urgent was 
land hunger. The European settlers had reserved for their own use the best land 
in Kenya, 3 million hectares, or about 80 percent of the best land. Land hunger 
fanned the Mau Mau movement and the violent confrontation between Kenya 
and its colonizers. Under pressure from land-hungry Kenyans, the government 
launched successive schemes for buying out some of the Europeans' land for 
the settlement of Africans. The Million Acre Settlement Scheme of 1961 
created African large-scale commercial farmers, or tried to create them. The 
settlement farms of this scheme were on the average 12 hectares and cost about 
KSh700 each. In 1965 another settlement was launched for smallholders, the 
Squatter Settlement Program; the average size of the farms under this scheme 
was 4.5 hectares. 

While Kenya was indigenizing land ownership, its agriculture remained 
tied to foreign capital. According to Kenya's development estimates for the 
year 1971-72, of the total expenditure of KSh6,700,331 for agriculture, 
KSh4,399,099, or 59 percent, was to come from foreign sources. Of the 
estimated total crop production budget of KSh2, 542,550, KSh l, 610,010, or 
63.3 percent, was to come from foreign sources. Of the gross total development 
budget of KSh2,393,070 of the Agricultural Development Corporation, the 
major agricultural credit agency of Kenya, KShl,696,880, or 82.39 percent, 
was to come from foreign sources. The Agricultural Development Corporation 
expected 79.4 percent of its development expenditure from foreign sources.50 

Kenya's pursuit of indigenization in commerce and industry was charac-
teristically moderate. The government began by buying controlling shares in 
strategic businesses: 50 percent interest in the Standard Bank of Kenya, 50 
percent in Barclay's, 60 percent in East African Oil Refineries, and 59 percent 
in East African Power and Lighting. 

Kenya was wary of buying out foreign entrepreneurs to increase Kenya's 
control of the economy. The government reasoned that if the existing 
indigenous capital is used to buy foreign-owned enterprises, "the nation has no 
more productive assets than before, only their ownership has changed. What 
may be lost are the new resources that could have been purchased instead."51 
So indigenization was interpreted as a process to facilitate African business and 
commerce. To this end, the Industrial and Commercial Development 
Corporation (ICDC) was established; it stimulated African business mainly by 
offering credit facilities. It was 
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supported by a network of prostates, notably the Development Finance 
Company of Kenya (DFCK), to help in matters of investment, the Kenya 
National Properties Limited (KNP) to help in procuring business premises, and 
the Kenya National Trading Corporation to assist Kenyans in retail and 
wholesale trade. These bodies not only contributed little to indigenous control 
of the economy; they created a problem in that they were not backed by a 
sound financial policy. Their preferred credit status placed considerable stress 
on the financial system. 

As in agriculture, the bodies that were set up to bring about indigenization, 
especially the ICDC and DFCK, were themselves dominated by foreign 
capital. The Kenyan government had only a 15 percent equity share in both 
organizations, with the same proportion of shares going to the Commonwealth 
Development Corporation, the Netherlands Overseas Finance Company, and 
the German Development Corporation.52 
 

Nigeria 
Nigeria's commitment to indigenization was somewhat stronger. Nigeria 

was interested in using indigenization to localize ownership and control but 
also to further the transfer of technology and industrialization. The basic 
approach, carried through the Nigerian Enterprises Promotion Decrees of 1972, 
was to divide enterprises into two categories: one exclusively for natives, and 
the other in which foreigners could participate under certain conditions. 

The exercise did not markedly increase Nigeria's control of its economy; 
the effect on the localization of ownership was more impressive. Essentially, 
what the decree achieved was to arrange an accommodation between 
indigenous and foreign capital; it reduced the chances of conflict and deepened 
the vested interest of the indigenous leadership in capitalism.   

This accommodation often evolved into a partnership that tended to 
frustrate the purpose of indigenization. One problem of indigenization in 
Nigeria, and Africa generally, is the tendency for African entrepreneurs to 
become surrogates of foreign entrepreneurs in return for cash rewards or 
profitable business opportunities. The chairman of the Nigerian Enterprises 
promotion board, Minso Wadzama Gadzama, who was responsible for 
implementing the indigenization decrees, complained repeatedly of the 
collusion of Nigerians with expatriate business to defeat the decrees. 

 80



In an interview given to the Business Times in April 1982, he disclosed that 
Nigerians received money to buy shares as nominal owners. Having bought 
shares, they then pressed to retain the foreign management and even to increase 
the expatriate quota. Because of such collusion, Gadzama declared, more 
expatriates were involved in Nigerian enterprises five years after the 
indigenization drive began than before the decrees .53 

Even when Nigerians used their own money to buy the expatriate 
enterprises, the new owners preferred profit to control. They wanted to retain 
the expatriate managers on the grounds that they were likely to perform better 
and make more profit. That was true even for those supposedly strategic 
enterprises in which the government acquired controlling interest. Usually the 
government settled for a division of labor in which the Nigerian managers were 
the staff management specialists such as legal advisers, personnel managers, 
and company secretaries, while expatriates held line management positions 
such as finance manager, manager, production manager and engineering 
manager.54 

In the end, indigenization turned out to be only a strategy of incorporation; 
at best the indigenous political class improved the ownership of the economy 
but not its control. The drive for indigenization did not alter the division of 
labor between foreign capital and the indigenous political class, although it 
might have improved the access of the latter to business opportunities. Even 
that is uncertain, because in the course of implementing structural adjustment 
programs the indigenization measures have been largely reversed. The 
emphasis has shifted to providing incentives to attract foreign investment. 
Indigenization policies in Africa underline the inability or the reluctance of the 
African elite to take charge of economic management and development. 
 

Conclusion 
The indigenization process in Africa illustrates the ambivalence of the 

elites who make public policy and the clash between the latent and manifest 
functions of public policy. Even when indigenization was pursued in the 
context of a socialist policy, such as in Tanzania, it may have been successful 
in indigenizing ownership, but not control. Yet even if it had been successful in 
localizing control, the significance of this success would have been 
problematic. Control cannot be seen in isolation; it has to be related to other 
values, such as the effective management of the economy, 
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to maximize growth with equity. Often indigenization policies were carried out 
in a macroeconomic framework that did not serve the cause of economic 
growth or equitable distribution. 

In sum, most of the indigenization drives in Africa invariably became a 
legitimizing veneer for the elites to sell public assets cheaply to themselves and 
to exploit those assets in ways that hurt the prospect of economic growth. Here 
again one recognizes the effects of class on the management of the economy. 
 

Structural Adjustment 
The international development community seems to have decided that 

structural adjustment is the way to recovery and sustainable growth. Although 
African governments and leaders disagree with the policy, they have had to go 
along with it. Africa has been adjusting for more than ten years, yet arguments 
about the merits and demerits of the program are still raging. The World Bank's 
1994 comprehensive study, Adjustment in Africa: Reforms, Results and the 
Road Ahead, was supposed to have put an end to this debate. To all 
appearances it has not done so. 

Are structural adjustment programs (SAPs) succeeding in Africa? The IMF 
is adamant that they are, as is the Bank, although it speaks less dogmatically. 
But judging by the narrow standards of the IMF, such as growth rate, external 
balance, and rate of inflation, it is difficult to make a case for structural 
adjustment, at least for Africa. The bottom line, as one student of adjustment 
argues, is that after a decade of structural adjustment there has not yet been one 
clear case of success.55 

In evaluating structural adjustment, one needs to take account of the 
enormous significance that it has assumed in African economies and in the 
lives of Africans. Conceived originally as short-term measures for bringing a 
distressed economy back on course, SAPs now look like the only strategy of 
development in Africa, absurd as that may seem. Are the programs serving 
their goals in Africa? Since adjustment is a tool for a short-term objective, can 
it serve the broader objective of sustainable development? Are its social and 
political costs affordable? Most important, what is the significance of 
adjustment for development in Africa? And what is the significance of Africa's 
adjustment performance for my thesis that the current crisis of 
underdevelopment in Africa is essentially a political problem rather than an 
economic problem, although economic factors are not irrelevant? 
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Nigeria 
Nigeria gives credence to the point that World Bank and IMF officials 

often make; namely, that whatever the problems of structural adjustment it is 
Africans who have created the need for it. Between 1973 to 1978, during 
Nigeria's first oil boom, oil revenue grew quickly, to more than 90 percent of 
Nigeria's export revenue. This increase was matched by an increase in public 
expenditure, which quadrupled between 1973 and 1975. By 1976 expenditure 
already exceeded revenue, During the second oil boom in 1979-85, the surge in 
oil revenue elicited such profligacy that real income began to decline rapidly, 
as much as 60 percent between 1980 and 1983, when Nigeria recorded a 
negative growth rate of - 6.7 percent and a budget deficit rising to 13 percent of 
GDP. Austerity measures instituted in 1982 and 1984 failed, and the crisis 
deepened, especially with the sharp fall of real oil prices in 1986, the 
worsening of the terms of trade, debt service obligations, and a sharp fall in 
imports and exports. As mentioned in chapter 2, by the end of June 1986 a 
structural entrustment program was in place. The Nigerian adjustment 
program, which was typically eclectic and monetarist, had the following goals: 

1. To diversify the productive base of the economy, reduce import 
dependence and dependence on oil. 

2. To improve the balance of payments. 
3. To improve public sector efficiency. 
4. To give greater role to market forces and the private sector. 
5. To facilitate accelerated, sustainable growth. These goals were to be 

achieved through: 
a. Fiscal and monetary policies to reduce inflation and ensure more 

rational and productive use of financial resources. 
b. Liberalization of price and exchange controls. 
c. Privatization and commercialization of public enterprises. 56 

The SAP designed by the government of Nigeria proposed trade liberal-
ization; an import levy as a disincentive to imports; incentives for exports, 
especially non-oil exports; a reduction of the petroleum subsidy; privatization; 
and a balanced budget. The World Bank and IMF rejected this program, 
because it did not include the devaluation of the naira. The regime eventually 
adopted a revised SAP to meet that objection. 

The major elements of the new adjustment program were implemented 
between July 1986 and December 1987, the most important being  
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exchange-rate adjustment. A floating exchange-rate system consisting of two 
tiers was established. The first tier was the official government-fixed rate for 
government transactions such as debt servicing; the second tier, funded by the 
government with petrodollars, was a market-determined tier in which foreign 
exchange was auctioned by the Central Bank of Nigeria (CBN). When the 
second tier became operational in September 1986, the naira was effectively 
devalued by 66 percent. The Nigerian government stayed with exchange-rate 
reform. According to the World Bank, "From 1988 to 1992, the quarterly 
average of the naira exchange rate per US dollar depreciated by 27 percent, 58 
percent, 61 percent, and 83 percent over the 1987 base period." This 
devaluation was partly driven by the foreign exchange demand-supply gap, 
which continued to grow-from $360 billion in 1986, to $15 billion in 1989, to 
$17.5 billion in 1990.57 

Another important reform in the Nigerian SAP was privatization, deemed 
necessary because the government was getting little from an investment of 
more than N23 billion in public enterprises. A committee was established to 
carry out this project. A decree of 1988 enjoined assessment of the possible 
privatization or commercialization of 145 public enterprises. Eventually most 
of these were scheduled for privatization. But implementation proved difficult, 
since problems arose with evaluation, the resistance of employees, and the 
auctioning of shares. By mid1992 only 68 of these enterprises had been 
privatized, some only partially.58 

The reforms also included measures to strengthen and discipline a 
market-driven financial system. In the reform period the financial system grew 
substantially. According to the CBN, commercial banks grew from 29, with 
1,297 branches, in 1986 to 65, with 1,950 branches, in 1992. Merchant banks 
grew from 12, with 27 branches, in 1986 to 54, with 84 branches; in 1992.59 the 
reforms also included interest rate deregulation and credit liberalization. A 
tight money policy was to be pursued to contain pressures for higher wages 
arising from the deflationary regime. The state and federal governments and 
their subsidiaries and prostates were required to withdraw their deposits from 
the commercial and merchant banks and deposit them with the CBN. A credit 
ceiling was imposed, and credit targets were set. The manufacturing sector was 
to get 35 percent of commercial bank loans and 40 percent of merchant bank 
loans, while 
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agriculture was allocated 15 percent of commercial bank loans and 10 percent 
of merchant bank loans.60 

Finally, the Nigerian SAP called for public service reform. The aim was to 
make the public service more professional, more accountable, and less prone to 
abuse of power and dereliction of duty. Ministers became chief executives and 
accounting officers in their ministries. The highest position in the ministry, the 
director-general, became a political appointment to be held at the pleasure of 
the president. The power of the Federal Government Service Commission to 
appoint, promote, and discipline was substantially diluted. The civil service 
was to be professionalized: every civil servant was to perform a specialized 
function; the idea of a central pool of civil servants and central deployment was 
to be discontinued. To improve their professional competence, public servants 
were to be trained on a systematic and continuous basis. 

The political repercussions of SAP were a major concern, since Nigerians 
had debated and rejected an IMF loan tied to the adoption of the program. The 
concern was all the greater because civil society, especially mass organizations 
such as the labor movement and student groups, was developed and politically 
active in Nigeria. In these circumstances it was not surprising that special 
programs had been introduced to ameliorate the social impact of the SAP; 
notably, the establishment of the National Directorate of Employment to 
evolve measures for reducing unemployment, including training and placement 
and the provision of credit for small commercial and manufacturing 
enterprises; the urban mass transit programs, which provided buses and other 
vehicles to reduce the cost of public transportation; and the Directorate of 
Food, Roads and Rural Infrastructure, which tried to improve the delivery of 
social services in the rural areas and farmers' access to markets. 

Even in the presence of these measures the demand for mitigating SAP's 
social effects continued to grow. In 1988 the federal government was obliged 
to introduce a deflationary budget and adopt a relief package, including a grant 
of N75 million to pharmaceutical companies for the importation of drugs to 
increase availability and reduce prices. A grant of N65 million was given to the 
National Directorate of Employment to facilitate youth employment. Also in 
1989, the People's Bank was established, with a N270.5 million grant to give 
low-interest loans to small-scale enterprises. In 1990 the government 
encouraged the establishment of community banks to develop a financial 
system and improve the availability of credit in the rural areas. 
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has SAP succeeded in Nigeria? According to the World Bank study Adjustment 
in Africa, it has been moderately successful: "Nigeria's adjustment program 
had a positive impact on aggregate output. By 1988 output rebounded from its 
limited 2 percent growth in 1986 to growth at almost 9 percent, spurred 
primarily by an increase in agricultural production, Between 1989 and 1991 
overall GDP growth averaged 5.8 percent annually, dominated by the oil 
sector.”61 

This "robust growth of GDP" occurred despite what the study considers a 
reform process that has generally been "unsatisfactory." The study explains it 
as follows: "Oil production and experts are not affected by public sector 
inefficiency and other policy distortions," by the performance of the private 
sector, especially the agricultural sector, and by better utilization of capital as 
well as increasing investment.62 

Agriculture seems to have responded positively to structural adjustment, 
with output growing "by more than 4 percent in the five-year post-adjustment 
period compared with near stagnation in the five-year period before 
adjustment.”63 According to statistics of the Central Bank of Nigeria, which the 
World Bank study also cites, between 1986 and 1990 the production index for 
export crops (with 1980 as base year) was 141.8, and the real price index was 
159.4. For food crops the production index was more impressive still, 183.8, 
but the real price index was only 86.4. The Bank study explains this highly 
significant anomaly by saying that "such non-price factors as the availability of 
imported technology, improved infrastructure and the weather may be more 
important determinants of the difference.64 

Manufacturing production is also judged to have benefited from adjust-
ment, growing at an average of 5.1 percent over the adjustment period 
1986-91, from a negative growth rate of -3.9 percent in 1986. Nevertheless, 
this is hardly a sterling performance, given the generous foreign allocation and 
other concessions to the manufacturing sector. Despite such incentives, the 
contribution of manufacturing to GDP remained a mere 8.3 percent. Indeed, 
the SAP has caused a shift from production to services. While the contribution 
of manufacturing to GDP was stagnating, that of finance and insurance rose 
from 3.11 percent in 1986 to 8.7 percent in 1991. 

SAP does not appear to have helped much in regard to external balance 
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and the diversification of the Nigerian economy. Total merchandise exports 
fluctuated during the adjustment period, rising from $6.8 billion in 1986 to 
$13.9 billion in 1990 and then falling to $12.1 in 1991. These fluctuations were 
not due to SAP but to the oil sector. Non-oil exports did not increase markedly 
as had been expected. In 1992 non-oil exports accounted for a negligible 3.6 
percent of export earnings, while the share of oil was 77.3 percent. 

The indebtedness of Nigeria has increased over the adjustment period. The 
debt stock, which was only $18.9 billion before the SAP period, had risen to 
$33.2 billion by 1991. It fell to approximately $28 billion in 1992 as a result of 
a buy-back arrangement with the London Club. But by 1994 it had again risen 
beyond the 1991 level to nearly $40 billion. Exchange rate management under 
SAP has been disappointing in its effects. Inflation, which averaged 18 percent 
between 1980 and 1985, rose to an average of 24 percent between 1986 and 
1991; by the end of 1992 it was over 46 percent and remained in that high 
range through 1993. The World Bank study blames government policies, 
which supposedly defeated the purpose of SAP: "The fiscal and monetary 
restraint envisaged by the structural adjustment program was either abandoned 
or not pursued vigorously from the outset. Credit to the federal government 
increased by 12 percent in 1987. Although net foreign assets fell by 39 percent, 
net credit to the private sector remained relatively strong, all of which 
increased the supply of money by 23 percent in 1987.65 

And despite the measures taken to cushion the impact of structural 
adjustment, its social consequences were severe, especially for the poor: 
"Employment in the manufacturing sector declined despite increased output 
and low wages because private firms have streamlined operations in order to 
control operating costs. The overall structure of employment has changed, with 
the greatest decline evident among expatriate employees and unskilled 
workers. With the contraction in formal sector employment, the informal sector 
appears to have grown."66 

The poor have suffered from the high rate of inflation as well as from other 
conditions: the fall in real wages among urban workers; the collapse of 
infrastructure, including water supply, electricity, and transportation; the new 
commitment to cost recovery in education, health care, and City Council 
services; and the general decline in welfare indicators such as adult literacy rate 
and primary school enrollment. Throughout the adjustment period SAP 
continued to be resented and was a constant cause of unrest, 
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especially among the working class, which effectively opposed its intensi-
fication, particularly the total removal of the petroleum subsidy. 

In this brief review of structural adjustment in Nigeria, I have evaluated the 
SAP regime by the narrower criteria of the World Bank and IMF and have 
greatly relied on the data from these institutions. Even by those standards the 
SAP regime could hardly be called successful. It seems even less so when it is 
evaluated from broader concerns. But before going into those concerns, I 
review the Ghana experience of structural adjustment. 
 

Ghana 
The Bretton Woods institutions regard Ghana as "the front-runner in 

adjustment," the clear success story of the adjustment regime in Africa. In 
Adjustment in Africa the author of the Ghana chapters says: "By customary 
criteria, Ghana's adjustment program has been a success. Policy reform has 
been extensive, despite opposition and institutional constraints. The benefits of 
adjustment have been large, visible, and widely shared. The results are all the 
more remarkable given the chaotic initial conditions and the external shocks 
sustained since it began."67 

The economic condition of Ghana in 1983, when it started its adjustment 
program, was very poor. Major physical infrastructure and public facilities 
were at different stages of decay or collapse. Shortages of basic commodities, 
including food, were widespread. Even while Ghana was reeling from one of 
the worst droughts in its history, nearly 1 million Ghanians living in Nigeria 
were forced to return home. Cocoa prices were falling, and government 
revenues had been declining for several years, as had incomes in real terms. 
Cocoa production had fallen from 376,000 tons in 1975 to 179,000 tons in 
1983, and government revenue had fallen from 20 percent of GDP in 1970 to 
only 5 percent in 1982. These two declining values were related. Cocoa 
production was declining partly because cocoa producers were being so 
overtaxed that they only received, according to the World Bank, between 15 
percent and 40 percent of prevailing world prices. In the face of this 
disincentive, farmers produced less and depressed government revenue. While 
productivity and incomes fell, inflation increased phenomenally at an average 
annual rate of 53 percent for the decade before adjustment, 1972-82.68 

Like most adjustment programs in Africa, exchange-rate adjustment was a 
central element in Ghana's SAP. A series of drastic devaluations 
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reduced the cedi’s exchange rate to the dollar from ¢2.75 in 1983 to ¢90 in 
1986. More devaluation was to follow. Ghana has had one of the most drastic 
exchange-rate adjustments in the history of policy reform. 

Ghana's adjustment program paid much attention to the liberalization of 
trade. An important part of this process was the liberalization of price controls 
and foreign exchange regulations. Import taxes were substantially reduced, 
though by 1992 they were still roughly 10 percent across the board. Export was 
liberalized and encouraged by a system of incentives, including tax rebates on 
export earnings and duty-free concessions for certain imports, especially 
machinery. 

Along with trade, the financial sector was liberalized. Interests rates were 
deregulated for commercial lending, and government divested itself of the 
ownership of commercial banks. Commercial banks were no longer required to 
meet specific quotas for sectoral lending and left commercial credit to market 
forces. In effect, government shifted from control of the financial sector to 
indirect influence by means of such instruments as government securities. 

As regards agriculture, which accounts for more than 40 percent of the 
country's GDP, the emphasis of the reform program was less on positive 
intervention than on government withdrawal and on the salutary impact of 
exchange-rate adjustment in increasing the prices of traded agricultural 
commodities. Government subsidies to agricultural production, especially 
fertilizers and other imports, were removed. At the same time, government 
divested itself of agricultural ventures, including fertilizer production. Export 
trade restrictions in agriculture, especially export taxes, were reduced. New 
export arrangements for agricultural exports gave Ghanian farmers a higher 
proportion of prevailing world prices for their exports, 

The adjustment program of Ghana, like that of Nigeria, was sensitive to the 
social consequences of adjustment. The Bretton Woods institutions were 
particularly interested in the social consequences of SAP in Ghana, since that 
country was regarded as the model pupil that would help to vindicate structural 
adjustment programs throughout Africa. As a result, the level of foreign aid to 
support the adjustment regime in Ghana was unusually high. According to 
Adjustment in Africa, foreign aid to Ghana rose from $270 million in 1984 to 
$480 million in 1990.69 Adjustment support enabled Ghana to undertake in 
1988 a rather ambitious program of action for mitigating the social 
consequences of adjustment, called 
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PAMSCAD. This ambitious and complex measure, which involved "seven 
sectoral ministries, thirteen public agencies, twenty-three distinct projects and 
numerous designated activities," did not succeed: 
 

The intent was to provide quick relief to the poor throughout the country. 
While some progress was made, the impact was less than anticipated. The 
difficulty in targeting assistance to the poor stems from two factors. First, 
the poor are not concentrated in any particular area. Second, their 
consumption pattern does not differ distinctly from the pattern of the 
nonpoor. Furthermore, most of the measures under the program of action 
attempted to overcome some of the shortcomings of similar programs 
implemented elsewhere. For example program design called for avoiding 
simple transfers in favor of producing useful assets for local communities. 
In addition, the wages offered under the project were kept relatively low to 
avoid attracting the nonpoor. But these constraints generated new 
problems. Administrative procedures became cumbersome, and the 
response rate from the poor was lower than expected.70 

 

Still, the Bank insists that adjustment has not harmed the poor but made 
them better off. The study says that some quality-of-life indicators such as 
infant mortality were positive during the adjustment period. It also asserts that 
agricultural policy liberalization has helped the poor by improving farmers' 
earnings. 

Perhaps it is an indication of the magnitude of the problems of structural 
adjustment in Africa that the Bretton Woods institutions regard Ghana as their 
star pupil. Ghana's performance is hardly outstanding even by their own 
evaluation: 
 

The adjustment program has clearly changed the economy. Growth has 
been restored. Since 1983 real income per capita has averaged 2 percent 
annually-in contrast to the 1970s when real income fell by a third. 
Evidence suggests also that the benefits of growth have been distributed 
broadly. Farmers and rural workers have benefited from improved 
producer prices for cocoa and the liberalization of trade for other cash 
crops. Real food prices (for cereals and roots) have fallen gradually. 
Furthermore, government expenditures on social programs rose 
significantly during the adjustment period. Social indicators show 
improvements across the board. 

 90



The extent and replicability of Ghana's experience have attracted much 
interest. Many believe that Ghana's adjustment performance has been 
exceptional by regional standards. But the performance largely reflects the 
depth of economic decline before reform. Over a longer time horizon, 
Ghana's record is not that distinctive. For example, between 1980 and 
1990, real GDP growth in Ghana averaged 3 percent annually, behind nine 
other sub-Saharan African countries, including Botswana, Burkina Faso, 
Burundi, Congo, Mali and Mauritius and comparable to six others, 
including Malawi, Senegal, Tanzania and Zimbabwe.71 

 

A serious problem raised by the Ghana experience is whether the gains of 
structural adjustment, especially economic growth, can be sustained. This 
question is particularly serious not only because Ghana is regarded as the 
success story in Africa but also because it was given an unusual level of 
foreign aid to mitigate the rigors of structural adjustment and to ensure that the 
gains of adjustment would be sustained. 

Ghana's GDP growth rate averaged close to 5 percent a year over the 
adjustment period, and the economy expanded by about 40 percent. 
Approximately 77 percent of this growth, according to the World Bank study, 
was in the service sector, particularly commerce. Industry accounted for only 
18 percent of the growth, and of this, 3.6 percent was from mining activities. 
More significant, in an agricultural economy, agriculture accounted for only 5 
percent of the growth. The growth pattern, normal by standards of highly 
industrialized countries, clearly indicates a serious weakness, namely, that the 
Ghana economy is not being adjusted in a way conducive to sustainable 
growth. The study takes note of this and suggests "a need to re-examine policy 
and other structural constraints."72 These structural constraints and weaknesses 
include a rudimentary financial system and a capitalist class. The rate of 
domestic saving rose only slightly, from 5 percent to 8 percent of GDP, 
compared with a current Sub-Saharan Africa average rate of 13 percent. Ghana 
has nonetheless been able to achieve an investment rate of 16 percent of GDP. 
This means that much of the investment has come from foreign aid, largely for 
government investment and investment by public enterprises. The World Bank 
study estimates that private sector investment is no more than 8 percent of 
GDP and is properly concerned about that: "After a decade of generally 
favourable adjustment efforts, private sector investment,  
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normally the driving force for vigorous growth, has not been particularly 
strong."73 
 

Adjustment, Growth, and Development 
Structural adjustment in Africa has become the surrogate of a role it cannot 

possibly fulfill. By its nature the structural adjustment program is an interim 
measure; it is more like first aid in the face of an emergency, not a cure. More 
important, the structural adjustment program s not a development strategy, It is 
supposed to be a response to economic shocks and salient imbalances, a way to 
remove distortions and constraints of economic growth, not a recipe for 
economic growth. 

By all indications, the Bretton Woods institutions and all the proponents of 
SAPs know this. They do not claim that SAP is other than an emergency 
measure, nor do they claim that it is a strategy of economic development. But 
they have, inadvertently perhaps, perpetuated such misrepresentations. They 
have failed to put anything other than SAP on offer in Africa for well over a 
decade, during which they have been absorbed in the advocacy and practice of 
SAP while remaining mute on development strategy. African critics of SAP 
have not helped matters. Even while viewing SAP negatively, they have kept it 
current. They are trapped in its discourse; most important, they have offered no 
alternative to SAP as an emergency measure or as a credible alternative 
development strategy. Apart from minor modifications of SAP, such as some 
sensitivity to its social consequences, all that African critics have achieved is to 
give SAP an even stronger and more ubiquitous presence. 

In recent times the tendency is to regard SAP as part of the hegemony of 
the market following the winding down of the cold war and the collapse of the 
Soviet empire. The market is revered as the key to the wealth of nations. Some 
people, impressed by its role in material civilization, are now inclined to 
represent it as the truth of history. In this context, it is not surprising that the 
wealthy industrialized countries have taken the position that what the poorer 
countries need to overcome their economic backwardness is to embrace the 
market. The industrialized countries all support SAP as the response to the 
crisis of underdevelopment and as the way to generate the movement to the 
market. For that reason the question of development strategy no longer seems 
to arise. The issue of 
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now development: should proceed, a, leas, in broad outline, has been settled. 
The settlement of the issue is more apparent than real, however. The 

market cannot be and never has been a strategy of economic growth, even in 
the experience of the North. The North, exercising the prerogative of victory in 
the long-drawn-out contest of paradigms of society, has reinvented 
development as an ideological emblem. The history of economic growth in the 
North has been sanitized and recast as a celebration of the North. The rigors of 
primitive accumulation and the process of proletarianization have been glossed 
over, as have the contradictions of the market that bred statism and the welfare 
state, without which capitalism may well have collapsed.  Also forgotten is 
colonialism and its contribution to economic development. 

What now exists is a simplified view of economic development, which 
posits that underdevelopment was initially universal and that every country can 
grow out off it by following policies that are known, tested, and unfailing, 
Thus the late starters are saddled with the singular burden of carrying out an 
abstract and misleading conception of development that does not reflect the 
realities of their own history or even the histories of the North. Because Africa, 
in particular, is guided by fictitious concepts and is working with blunt 
instruments, its social transformation has been unduly difficult. 

One of the greatest drawbacks of SAP is its Politics, which is typically 
authoritarian Perhaps that was inevitable in Africa. There the SAP regimes 
started before the wave of democratization; a basis hardly existed for 
subjecting SAP to a democratic mandate. The African leaders whose perfor-
mance had contributed to the need for adjustment were neither in the habit of 
subjecting public policy to democratic determination nor willing to expose 
their governance record to public debate. In any case, by the time SAP became 
an issue, they had invariably run out of options. The international supporters of 
SAP were scarcely more inclined to the democratic legitimation of public 
policy. For one thing, they had near-absolute faith in the validity of their policy 
prescription; for another, they assumed that the austerity of SAP would not 
survive a public debate. As a result, the internal and external promoters of SAP 
were disposed to its authoritarian imposition. 

This attitude compounded the problems of Africa immensely. SAP became 
necessary in the first place because of the extreme economic deterioration that 
had depressed real incomes and the quality of life and subjected 
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the political and social system to much stress, including alienation, an 
intensifying struggle for a diminishing surplus, and an increase in the incidence 
of violent conflict. But SAP in effect accentuated those tendencies. 

Although I suggested above that the politics of SAP is authoritarian, 
strictly speaking, SAP has no politics. Rather, the program hinges on the 
renunciation of politics -politics understood as the process of aggregating 
interests, articulating them, and negotiating consensus on the general thrusts of 
public policy and on the managers of public policy. But as seen, SAP usually 
arrives in Africa by imposition. This imposition calls for considerable coercion 
because the government doing the imposing has no legitimacy and because 
African SAPs are extremely austere. With rare exceptions, SAP goes hand in 
hand with the militarization of society. A society thus militarized may look 
superficially unified and stable in its monolithism, but it is effectively 
fragmented, incoherent, and unstable. 

 This political incoherence is the bane of Africa. The state in the sense 
of a public force or a truly public sphere, a commonwealth or res publica, 
hardly exists except in a few instances. In much of Africa, the public sphere is 
a contested space where strangers converge to appropriate for their interest 
groups whatever is on offer, including the power of the state. Every interest 
group is out for itself; each wants to appropriate and privatize state power to its 
own benefit. The issues of national interest, public interest, or even public 
policy scarcely arise. When they exist, they are lost in the contradiction 
between the manifest and latent functions of policy. 

How so much of Africa got that way is a very complicated problem that 
can only be touched upon here. The problem clearly has something to do with 
the forms of social heterogeneity that exist in Africa. But that is not enough, 
because similar conditions exist in countries such as India and Indonesia, 
where the political elites have been coherent enough to launch a development 
project. Africa's political incoherence has something to do with 
authoritarianism, which has engendered strong centrifugal tendencies. Again, 
one has to go deeper to find intervening variables to account for the fact that 
countries like Taiwan, Singapore, China, and South Korea have found the 
political coherence to effectively execute a development project. But for now 
my limited concern is to show that structural adjustment has contributed to the 
political incoherence in Africa. 

In Nigeria, for instance, structural adjustment was a major cause of the 
chain of political crises that has shaken the country since 1988, beginning 
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with the political crisis of the SAP debate itself. The very tabling of the debate 
caused considerable anger and alienation from the public, which was merely 
reminded of the economic mismanagement that necessitated SAP in the first 
place. The proposal to adopt SAP was angrily rejected, but a government that 
had clearly run out of options and out of legitimacy imposed it anyway. 

SAP deepened the division between the military and civilians, and between 
ethnic groups as elites invoked ethnic identity. Regionalism and religious 
differences became politicized as elites came under pressure to find a base of 
power at a time of political anxiety and economic crisis. These differences 
raised the premium on political power and the intensity of political 
competition. Politics became overcharged and lawless as efficiency norms 
replaced legitimacy norms. Attempts to conduct party primaries broke down in 
disorder. When a presidential election was finally held, the military annulled it 
because its outcome was too threatening to the prevailing structure of power. 
Nigeria fell into deep political crisis: two presidents disputing political 
legitimacy, most nationalities demanding a sovereign national conference to 
reconsider the basis of political association in Nigeria, several groups seeking a 
confederation, and a few clamoring for secession. 

A grave defect of SAP is that it is blind to its own politics, not only about 
its impact on politics but also about the impact of politics on its own feasibility. 
In particular, SAP is blind to the fact that it is usually associated with the 
de-democratization of politics. In Nigeria SAP was established in the wake of a 
military coup and, as mentioned, after rejection of the outcome of a public 
debate that had come down heavily against structural adjustment. In Ghana 
structural adjustment followed the shift from the populist program of the 
Provisional National Defense Council (PNDC) in 1982-83 to a conservative 
posture in 1983, when President Jerry Rawlings, alarmed by a collapsing 
economy and prompted by the IMF, veered to the right and purged the PNDC, 
appointing to it conservatives such as justice Anan and replacing the People's 
Defense Committees, the radical grass-roots bodies that were the soul of the 
populism of 1982, with Committees for the Defense of the Revolution, which 
were state controlled and had largely an economic role. In Burkina Faso 
adjustment came after the shift from Thomas Sankara's democratic revolution 
to the conservative coup of Blaise Campaore in October 1987. Campaore 
abolished the Comités de Défense de la Révolution, which epitomized people's 
power in the Sankara revolution, and restored the power of technocrats and 
bureaucrats and the status of traditional rulers. To be 
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sure, structural adjustment was subjected to some consultation, but that was a 
carryover from the Sankara legacy, neatly exploited to legitimate the shift to 
the right. 

Because SAPs in Africa tend to be associated with de-democratization and 
a shift to the right, it is difficult to sustain the view that structural adjustment 
favors the poor or the expectation that its social impact will be effectively 
cushioned. True, the rural poor, especially farmers, could benefit from some 
aspects of deregulation such as the dissolution of commodity boards and the 
deregulation of prices. But these are incidental benefits that do not change the 
point: the undemocratic politics of SAPs cannot privilege the poor; it is more 
prone to marginalize or victimize 

But the fate of the poor is not the main issue here. The main issue is the 
association of structural adjustment with de-democratization and political 
incoherence. These tendencies stand in the way of evolving consensus on a 
development project and a development strategy; they prevent the people from 
possessing their own development strategies and development policies. 
 

Conclusion 
To return to the larger picture: this chapter has elaborated on the argument 

that the problem is not so much that the development project in Africa has 
failed as that, because of bad political conditions, it never really got started. 
The point is not that there are no development strategies, policies, and projects, 
but rather that they are produced by a particular government in office and a 
particular elite in power in the context of a determinate state and a historical 
configuration of social forces. However, because of the constitution of the state 
in Africa and the dynamics of social forces, these policies and projects tended 
to be mere gestures whose latent functions have overriden their manifest 
functions. With few exceptions, the African elites have been more interested in 
political survival than in development, and the conditions of their survival have 
usually been inimical to development. Agriculture has not been given the 
importance it deserves, and agricultural policy and development have tended to 
disappear in the struggle between the state and political elites, who want to 
control the peasants' surplus product, and the peasants, who resist 
expropriation. 

Political elites absorbed in the struggle for survival and often lacking in 
cohesiveness and confidence have largely ceded development strategy 
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to external agents, but in exogenizing development they also aborted it. 
Nonetheless, gestures continue to be made toward development as African 
leaders adopt ad hoc, and often opportunistically and confusedly, the latest fad 
of the international development community -import substitution, export 
promotion, integrated rural development, structural adjustment, and so 
forth-with little concern for the realities of African conditions. These are 
passing enthusiasms, not development strategies. And now Africa is stuck in 
the discourse and practice of SAP, which is only an emergency measure rather 
than a development strategy, and there is no sign of anything else on the menu. 
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4 
Blocked Options 

Grand strategies of development are now of less interest than specific policy 
options. Amid considerable confusion over just what the problem is, there exist 
many options on how to proceed. In what follows I examine some of these 
options in order to show how they are politically constituted and why, despite 
their popularity and apparent feasibility, they are blocked. 
 

The International Environment 
In the past it was assumed that the international order would not change in 

any way significant for the pursuit of development in Africa. The winding 
down of the cold war has altered that assumption. Now there is great concern 
among Africans and some members of the international development 
community about the marginalization of Africa. And for good reason. The 
considerable attention that Africa enjoyed in the 1960s and 1970s owed much 
to the cold war. Africa, like every other region of the developing world, was 
courted for diplomatic support. Even those parts of Africa with limited 
strategic, political, and economic attraction were courted as each side in the 
cold war-principally the United States and the Soviet Union-tried to limit the 
influence of the other side in the world and to expand its own. 

Each side cared deeply whether African countries took the socialist or 
capitalist path, for that choice had some potential for making the world safer or 
more hostile to it. More important, each side thought that its acceptance as a 
model by any developing country would help to vindicate its worldview. This 
courtship of Africa was not limited to the superpowers, however. The cold war 
contributed to some localized rivalries, such as those between North and South 
Korea, East and West Germany, Israel 
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and the Arabs. The principals in these rivalries also cultivated allies in Africa, 
enabling Africa to get into many more foreign policy agendas. 

All that has changed now that the cold war is over. It is difficult to 
envisage anything that can keep Africa on the international agenda. It cannot 
be Africa's needs or humanitarian interest; it has to be something that matters 
significantly for the economic, political, and strategic interests of the major 
international players. The problem of sustaining any interest in Africa is 
compounded by the dramatic changes resulting from the disintegration of the 
Soviet empire, changes that have captured the imagination of the world. 

Africa is apparently being marginalized by developments in science, 
technology, and production that are unlinking the industrial economies from 
the primary economies. Primary products are being displaced by synthetic 
materials, which are often stronger, more versatile, and easier to work with. At 
the same time the raw material content of goods has been decreasing in a 
continuing process of dematerialization and miniaturization. 

These changes mean that the highly industrialized countries are not as 
dependent on primary producers as they used to be. These objective factors, 
more than the deliberate manipulation of the world market, are undermining 
primary producers, depressing commodity prices, diminishing their exports and 
export earnings, turning the terms of trade against them, and driving most of 
them ever deeper into debt. Whether they are anybody's fault or not, these 
changes objectify the North - South divide and the marginalization of Africa. 

In the past, African leaders put great effort into development through 
internationalism, thinking perhaps that this would be a useful way of getting 
resources from the industrialized countries while diversifying their dependence 
enough to find some space for maneuver. This approach was tested in the 
demand for a new international economic order, which accomplished nothing. 

More interesting perhaps because of its African specificity was the effort to 
pressure the international community through the United Nations to help 
Africa out of its crisis. By 1984 African countries recognized that their 
economic decline was so deep that it had created an emergency that must be 
tackled. Consultations were held among African leaders in the context of 
organizations such as the United Nations Economic Commission for Africa 
(UNECA), the Economic Community of West African States (ECOWAS), the 
Organization of African Unity (OAU), and the African Development Bank 
(ADB). At the same time pressures started to 
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mount for a special session of the UN General Assembly on the African crisis. 
Eventually these pressures prevailed. 

As noted in chapter 2, in anticipation of the special session, African 
countries prepared a comprehensive document called Africa's Submission to 
the Special Session of the United Nations General Assembly on Africa's 
Economic Crisis. The program of action in this document, known as Africa's 
Priority Program for Economic Recovery, 1986-90 (APPER), was approved in 
1985. 

The special session in 1986 welcomed the APPER affirmation that 
Africans took "responsibility for the economic and social development of their 
countries, identified areas for priority action and undertook to mobilize and 
utilize domestic resources for the achievement of those priorities." The General 
Assembly went on to adopt its own program, the United Nations Program of 
Action for African Economic Recovery and Development, 1986-1990 
(UNPAAERD). To emphasize its seriousness, Resolution S-13/2 urged the UN 
secretary-general to monitor the implementation of UNPAAERD and report 
back to the General Assembly at its forty-second and forty-third sessions. 

In a special report on UNPAAERD in 1991, Secretary-General Javier 
Pérez de Cuéllar showed the inadequacy of the response of the international 
community to the program. Its support was expected to come through greater 
official development finance (ODF), especially official development assistance 
(ODA). 

The report lamented that "there was a reduction, rather than an increase, in 
real net resource flows to Africa" by the end of the period of UNPAAERD, 
Measured in 1986 prices and exchange rates, net resource flows declined from 
$24.6 billion in 1986 to $23.3 billion in 1990.1 ODA was essentially stagnant 
for the period at $16.2 billion in 1986 and $16.9 billion in 1989. The net flow 
of export credits declined sharply, from $ 2.1 billion in 1985 to -$1.8 billion in 
1988. Private flows fell from $5.3 billion in 1986 to an estimated $3 billion in 
1990.2 

 Although the prospects of promoting development in Africa through 
multilateralism have become more utopian, the international development 
community continues to argue for international partnership in development and 
in some cases, such as the Lome Convention, tries to make its usefulness to 
Africa plausible. This tendency finds willing collaboration among African 
leaders, some of whom are so hard pressed that they are easily seduced by any 
arrangement that promises some transfer of 
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resources, however meager. But as can be seen from the Lome Convention, 
such arrangements are not a development option. 

The Lome Convention, a comprehensive cooperation agreement between 
the European Community (EC) and African, Caribbean, and Pacific Countries 
(ACP), is negotiated through three institutions, the ACP-EC Council of 
Ministers, the ACP-EC Committee of Ambassadors, and the ACP-EC Joint 
Assembly. The convention was signed in 1975 and then renewed in 1979, 
1984, and 1989. The agreements give aid to the ACP countries through several 
funds; namely, Emergency Aid; Refugee Aid; Sysmin, for mining industries; 
Structural Adjustment Fund, for policy reform; and Stabex, for stabilizing 
earnings from agricultural exports. They also offer trade assistance such as 
some duty- and quota-free access to EC markets and special funds, mainly the 
European Development Fund (EDF) and the European Investment Bank (EIB). 

There are some real benefits in these arrangements. But they are small and 
their cost is high, sometimes arguably prohibitive. To begin with, the amount 
of money that the European Community puts out for the Lome Convention is 
quite small relative to the number of years covered, the number of countries to 
be served, and the needs of the ACP countries, and even to the number of 
countries that are collectively giving this aid. For instance, under Lome I the 
financial outlay was ECU3,450 million (European currency units) for five 
years, or ECU690 million a year for all ACP countries (see table 4-1). 

Lome IV (1990-95) was hailed as a watershed in the financial outlay of the 
EC for Lome. Compared with Lome 111 (1985-90), it increased total aid 
nominally by about 40 percent and by about 20 percent in real terms. But 
ECU12,000 million for five years of Lome W comes to ECU2,400 million a 
year for all ACP countries from the entire EC. And some of this money will be 
recycled back to the donors through tied purchases and technical services. 

One of the most important benefits of the Lome Convention to the 
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ACP countries is supposed to be preferential treatment. A World Bank and 
U.S. Agency for International Development report argues that "these 
preferential arrangements have not resulted in marked increases in African 
exports. In OECD [Organization for Economic Cooperation and Development) 
countries, demand for African products has been limited. Agricultural 
protectionism and subsidies in industrialized countries have limited market 
access and reduced world market prices. The lack of necessary inputs has 
impeded expansion in the supply of products for export. Finally, in some 
potentially significant areas, African exports have remained insufficiently 
competitive.3 The report goes on to show that in spite of new concessions on 
agricultural products in Lome IV, ACP countries had in the early 1990s a 
lower share of the EC market than they had in 1975. 

Multilateral institutions such as the Lome Convention inadvertently 
perpetuate dependence rather than self-reliance, and they impose priorities that 
are not salient for Africa. When the convention started in 1975, it was praised 
as a welcome example of aid without strings. But the judgment was premature. 
Already by 1977 the Lome Convention began to reveal the inevitable 
conditionalities. By 1983-84 structural adjustment had become the dominant 
issue in the Lome Convention. "Policy dialogue" and policy reform are now 
firmly established as marks of sound economic management for ACP 
countries, decisive for sharing in the benefits of the Lome Convention. Under 
Lome IV, ECU1,150 million is reserved under the EDF for structural 
adjustment reform. As the political and economic integration of Europe 
progresses, the ACP countries increasingly face a monopoly power that pulls 
them ever more forcefully toward the European model of society. 

Multilateral arrangements are expensive mainly because they are diver-
sionary. The problems they address are highly selective, and the selectivity is 
defined largely by the perceptions and interests of the stronger party in the 
bargain, the donors. The Lome Convention does not really address the 
commodity issue despite its gestures in the direction of the stabilizing of 
commodity earnings. Lome IV provides ECU1,500 million under the EDF for 
Stabex and ECU480 million for Sysmin, quite insignificant sums for stabilizing 
commodity earnings of all the ACP countries over a period of five years. In 
any case, the fundamental problem is not stabilizing export earnings but being 
more productive, being more competitive, and breaking out of an international 
division of labor that confines Africa to commodity production. 
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Finally the Lome Convention does not address the debt problem. The EC's 
basic position has been that there is very little the community can do about the 
debt problem of ACP countries, on the ground that the debt issue is one of 
bilateral relations, that with only 2 percent of ACP countries' debts the EC is an 
insignificant creditor. In the spirit of this disclaimer, the EC does not offer any 
significant initiatives for dealing with the debt problem. Invariably, it offers 
only token measures: a slightly lower interest rate on EIB loans from the EIB's 
own funds, an increase in the grant components of EDF financing, offers of 
technical assistance for debt management, a willingness to discuss the ACP's 
debts, provided it is understood that the EC will not interfere with the 
prerogatives of the London and Paris Clubs to deal with their debtors. 
 

The Debt Problem 
Most leaders in Africa continue to assume that development is essentially a 

matter of making adjustments in the vertical relations between Africa and the 
wealthy nations of the North. In the name of development, African leaders 
have been preoccupied with finding access to northern markets and obtaining 
more loans on better terms, more foreign investment, better prices for African 
commodities, access to technology, technical assistance, debt cancellations, 
and net financial flows in favor of Africa. But these do not constitute a feasible 
development option. 

The debt problem is not an aberration. It is inherent in the development 
strategies that Africa has been pursuing, in the location of Africa in the world 
economy, and in the prevailing international division of labor; its persistence 
and magnitude underline the limitations of present development strategies and 
the difficulties of overcoming them. 
 

The Worsening Situation 
The debt of developing countries was partly a product of the decade 

1974-84, when the effective cartel strategy of the Organization of Petroleum 
Exporting Countries (OPEC) produced the great oil boom. Some of the surplus 
earned by OPEC members found its way to the industrialized market 
economies, whose banks began to have excess liquidity. Since the demand for 
capital had been dampened by the economic slack resulting from high energy 
costs, those economies began to encourage developing countries to borrow 
money to mop up the excess liquidity. In some cases, 
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such as Nigeria, which was seen as having good prospects, credit was liberally 
extended. 

African countries took advantage of the availability of credit, borrowed 
enthusiastically, and made poor investments with their easy credit. Between 
1974 and 1982 the nominal dollar value of the debts of developing countries 
rose from $140 billion to $560 billion. In Africa the debt increased even more 
dramatically. By the end of 1984 Africa's external public and publicly 
guaranteed debt was about $145 billion, a sevenfold increase in indebtedness 
from 1974. In the same period real output fell by about 1 percent a year. By 
1990 Africa's debt had leapt to $250 billion, a virtually unserviceable 
magnitude, given Africa's economic resources. 

While Africa was getting deeper into debt, its inability to repay was 
increasing. According to the International Monetary Fund, the terms of trade of 
Sub-Saharan Africa was: - 0.3 on the average for 1970-79; - 3.3 in 1980; - 4.5 
in 1981 and 1982; 1.6 in 1983; 6.4 in 1984; - 1.6 in 1985; - 15.2 in 1986; 4.8 in 
1987.4 The export earnings of Sub-Saharan Africa, considerable in the period 
1975 to 1980, declined sharply after a peak of $30 billion (excluding Nigeria) 
in 1980. They averaged only about $26 billion annually between 1980 and 
1986. If Nigeria is included, the decline is more precipitate, from an average of 
$49 billion between 1979 and 1981 to only $35 billion for 1986-87.5 

With mounting indebtedness, declining export earnings, and deteriorating 
terms of trade, new commercial lending became more difficult, and the 
prospects of economic recovery worsened. Africa's loans are characterized by 
stiff conditions that might be getting stiffer. The average interest rate on 
African debts is about 6 percent, which is very high considering the eligibility 
of many African countries for concessionality.6 In the last decade many more 
African countries have been struggling to reschedule their loans in the context 
of the Paris Club, but they have not had the benefit of easy terms such as those 
of Mexico. The charges have usually been too high, the periods have been too 
short, and new capital has been very scarce. 

Debt-servicing obligations in Africa have reached a point at which they are 
a major obstacle to economic growth. As table 4-2 indicates, the ratio of 
external debt to exports is so high that growth is all but impossible. The general 
statistics understate the hopeless situation of many African countries, some of 
whose debt ratios exceed 1,000. For instance, as of 
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the end of 1987, the debt ratio for Guinea-Bissau was 1,500, for Somalia, 
1,428.6, and for Sudan, 1, 520. 1.7 Africa spent $23 billion on debt servicing in 
1990. But this amount would have been much higher were it not for the fact 
that only 60 percent of the debt obligations due were serviced, while the rest 
were rescheduled. 

What are the prospects for dealing with the debt burden in Africa? One 
way out of the problem would be increased export earnings that would create 
enough trade surplus to service debt and maintain growth. The difficulty here is 
that for most African countries the ratio of debts to exports is not decreasing 
but rising, in some cases, very steeply. For Sub-Saharan Africa as a whole, the 
ratio of debts to exports rose from 296.8 percent in 1986 to 334.6 percent in 
1990.8 These percentages reflect the low and negative growth rates in export 
volume and export earnings. The purchasing power of African exports has 
been falling substantially. Measured with 1980 as base year, it fell from an 
average of 76 percent in 1981-85 to 54 percent in 1986-90. It will be extremely 
difficult to reverse these tendencies enough for Africa to reduce its debt-export 
ratio substantially. Africa will need an export growth rate of about 10 percent 
to clear the interest on debts and have scope for a very modest growth, but such 
a performance is unlikely. 

Data from the UN Conference on Trade and Development (UNCTAD) 
indicate that between 1986 and 1990, export volume grew at an annual rate of 
2.5 percent. Worse still, Africa's export earnings fell in nominal terms from an 
annual average of $62.3 billion in 1981-85 to $54.8 billion in 1986 - 90. 
 

Tentative Attempts to Solve the Problem 
The debt burden of Africa is so great and the capacity to repay so limited 

that it is increasingly necessary to think not in terms of servicing but in terms 
of debt stock reduction and write-offs. The international development 
community has taken some steps in this direction. Just before the 1988 summit 
of the Group of Seven (G-7) in Toronto, President François Mitterrand 
announced that France was writing off one-third of the debt owed by the 
poorest countries. In April 1990 Italy canceled $1 billion ODA debt, some of 
which was owed by African countries. All in all, France has canceled roughly 
$2.4 billion owed by thirty-five African countries; and the United States has 
canceled $1.4 billion owed by twenty- 

 106



two African countries that have implemented structural adjustment programs. 
What might be promising here is the apparent acceptance of the idea of 

debt cancellation. But the actual amounts canceled are small. According to 
World Bank estimates, between 1978 and 1990 donors canceled only $7.6 
billion of debt, a virtually insignificant amount for a twelve-year period 
considering that, at Africa's current level of indebtedness, the yearly 
requirement for full servicing is roughly $40 billion. Debt forgiveness has had 
very little effect on debt-servicing burdens of Africa not only because the 
amounts being canceled are very small but also because the canceled debts are 
concessional debts associated with the ODA. The debt cancellations reduced 
the debt-service payments of African countries in 1990 by less than $ 100 
million out of a total debt-service payment of $ 10 billion. 

It is not likely that there will be a significantly higher level of debt 
forgiveness. For one thing, as the report of the UN secretary-general on 
UNPAAERD showed, "Africa's debt structure and debt-service payments have 
become concentrated and more inflexible, being tied to a rise in the share of 
multilateral financial institutions, most notably the World Bank and the IMF," 
whose debt is never forgiven and must be fully serviced."9 Thus in 1989 all 
countries (except four) owing the multilateral agencies fully serviced their 
debts; 86 percent of the amount due was paid. Currently multilateral debt 
accounts for 21 percent of Africa's total debt, compared with 41 percent for 
official bilateral debt and 38 percent for private debt. The share of 
medium-term and long-term multilateral debt increased in Sub-Saharan Africa 
from 18.8 percent of the total debt in 1980 to 26.6 percent in 1990.10 

Private credit is not as important in Africa as in other parts of the world. As 
of 1990 Sub-Saharan Africa owed only $30.6 billion, or 22 percent, of its total 
indebtedness. But private debts are a special problem in that private creditors 
do not appear to have strong reasons for cooperating in easing Africa's debt 
burden. On the whole, they have been adamant against write-offs and reduction 
of interest rates, and their rescheduling terms have been stringent. Commercial 
banks usually have no confidence that African economies will recover. Indeed, 
the arguments made by well meaning people for debt relief for Africa, whether 
in terms of partial or total write-offs, a cut in interest rates, or long 
moratoriums, have inevitably focused on the vulnerability of African 
economies and therefore may have reinforced this lack of confidence. The 
doubts have not been helped by 

 107



the political difficulties of implementing structural adjustment programs in 
Africa, or by the intense debate and increasing skepticism about the 
effectiveness of those programs. 

The banks are quite naturally concerned with their interests in the context 
of their business strategies. For many of them, their goal is now to reduce their 
exposure in Africa. Those that have significant financial stakes, and many 
corporate clients in Africa do, will have some interest in debt management 
arrangements that will improve the liquidity of their African debtors. But those 
whose stakes are smaller are more inclined to cut loose and run; they are not 
likely to be interested in debt management operations, such as restructuring, 
even if it means that the actual value of their debt is depreciated. Even for the 
former group of commercial banks, their concern with debt management 
arrangements that will improve Africa's liquidity is weakened by the fact that 
what Africa owes them is relatively small. 

Banks that want to lend new money are discouraged by the rising free rider 
syndrome, that is, a state of affairs in which restructuring agreements allow 
creditors to collect the full interest on their outstanding loans without 
contributing new money or conditions to generate this interest payment. 
Because African debtors are so desperate for debt restructuring, commercial 
creditors are able to insist on restructuring agreements that have elements of 
the free-rider syndrome. 

In recent years there has been less talk about cancellation and more 
emphasis on new approaches, at any rate new techniques of debt management 
that purportedly provide more flexibility in reconciling the interests of 
creditors and debtors. These have been characterized as the market based menu 
approach. The elements of this approach include security and debt-conversion 
techniques such as exit instruments, debt-equity conversion, lending and 
relending facilities, and interest- and currency switching options, as well as 
new money instruments such as interest capitalization, commodity-linked 
bonds, interest-retiring agreements, and new money bonds. For reasons that 
need not detain us here, many of these methods are not suitable for African 
conditions and are not likely to contribute much to debt relief or economic 
recovery. But some of them have considerable potential for reducing the debt 
burden of Africa if explored carefully in the context of a sound macroeconomic 
framework. 

Two American plans for dealing with the debt crisis have generated a great 
deal of attention, the Baker plan and the Brady plan. But neither plan is a 
feasible strategy for dealing with the debt crisis in Africa. The 
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Brady plan which is the more interesting because it appears to indicate the U.S. 
Treasury's implicit acceptance of partial debt write-off, has been more notable 
for the controversy surrounding it than for its effectiveness in dealing with the 
crisis. The controversy got so heated that a defensive Treasury began to 
quibble that it was offering not so much a plan as some ideas for discussion. 

But that did not reduce the confusion and the controversy. Some objected 
that the proposal seemed more concerned with reducing the losses of 
commercial banks than in bringing relief to poor countries. The international 
financial institutions, especially the IMF, did not like the prospect of looking 
like guarantors of the debts of commercial banks. The suggestion implicit in 
the Brady plan that funds from the IMF and the World Bank might be used as a 
subsidy for commercial banks that discount their debts did not sit well with 
some of the contributors to those agencies. Great Britain, for one, made it clear 
that it did not accept the idea. 

The Brady plan was the Group of Seven's idea of the way out of the debt 
crisis. It had been offered after the group had rejected a proposal for a 
North-South summit to discuss, among other things, the debt problem. Also 
rejected by the G-7 was a proposal for a debt moratorium, the setting up of an 
international fund for debt insurance, and a new multilateral lending institution 
proposed by Helmut Schmidt, then the West German chancellor. The rejection 
of these modest but useful proposals suggests that the Brady plan could not 
have been a really effective response to the debt crisis-even if it had succeeded 
on its own terms. 

A serious attempt to deal with the problem would have had to take into 
consideration the impact of interest rates in the industrialized countries on the 
indebtedness of poor countries. For instance, a 1 percent rise of interest rates 
would increase indebtedness far more than all the Brady plan funds would 
cover. Even within the context of such a plan, the regional specificity of Africa 
is not considered, perhaps because of its small share of third world debts. Only 
Nigeria and Cameroon were clear candidates for benefiting from the reductions 
that might have arisen from the Brady plan. 

There is no sign that Africa's creditors will cancel its debt on a large scale 
or grant the continent substantial relief. And there is no chance that Africa can 
pay its debts or even grow out of them, because the very reasons that call forth 
and sustain the debt also constrain economic growth. In any case, the debt 
burden of Africa, oppressive as it is, is not a fundamental problem but only a 
symptom. Even if all of Africa's debts were canceled, 
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it would not make much difference as long as those conditions, such as 
inappropriate policies, corruption, & disarticulated economies, and Africa's 
location in the international division of labor, remain. 
 

Commodities 
Commodities are a critical element in the relationship between Africa and 

the industrialized countries. African leaders believe that if Africa got good, 
stable prices for its commodities, its terms of trade and its debt problems might 
not exist or would be less burdensome. That is why they have been greatly 
concerned about adjusting this aspect of the relation of Africa and the North. 
They see commodity prices as an important element in a strategy of economic 
recovery and development. 

In the present international division of labor, Africa is the quintessential 
primary producer. In 1965 primary products accounted for 92 percent of 
Africa's merchandise exports. Since then, the share of primary products in 
Sub-Saharan Africa's merchandise trade has hardly changed. For instance, in 
1988 it was still 88 percent, despite all the years of effort to industrialize and 
diversify the productive and export base of African economies. African 
economies are not only commodity dependent, they are dependent in a very 
fragile way, as the export concentration ratio is very high. 

Africa's dependence on primary commodities for its export earnings has 
become a major element of the crisis of underdevelopment in the light of trends 
in the prices of primary commodities and their implications for the terms of 
trade. Africa's share of the world market in commodities is declining, as are its 
terms of trade and purchasing power. These trends have been disastrous for the 
continent. Between 1980 and 1987 Africa lost fully 50 percent of the 
purchasing power of its export earnings. The future trends are not promising. It 
is estimated that by the year 2000 commodity prices will be about 25 percent 
below the level of 1980. 

If one examines the factors behind these long-run trends, one sees that they 
are not likely to disappear. On the contrary, in the very long run, prospects may 
be gloomier still. The industrialized countries get better organized all the time 
for the defense of their common interests against the developing countries 
under a growing list of agencies, including the OECD, the G-7, the General 
Agreement on Tariffs and Trade (GATT), the Paris Club, and the London 
Club. One issue on which the industrialized countries have been singularly 
touchy in recent years is the price of 
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primary commodities. They constantly worry about how a rise in 
commodity prices will add to their inflation rates, and they are ever ready to 
deal with any signs of a price surge in primary commodities. They are not 
necessarily against developing countries' getting more for their commodities; 
one presumes they would not mind an increase so much if it carried no threat 
of inflation, however small. But that is unlikely unless the rise in commodity 
prices is accompanied by a relative fall in wages in the industrialized 
countries. And that is indeed unlikely. 

African commodity producers suffer from protectionism even in a world 
that is making a theology of market forces. A 1988 study by the Overseas 
Development Institute, Commodity Prices: Investing in Decline? has 
underlined this tendency. For instance, in Japan the prices paid to agricultural 
producers were on the average 2.5 times higher than world prices, in the EC 
countries 1. 5 times higher, and in the United States 1.1 times higher. Because 
of protectionism, the EC countries became net exporters of grain. The EC, 
which imported 16 million tons of grain in 1970, exported 16 million tons in 
1985.11 

It would appear, however, that Africa's commodity problem has less to 
with the Machiavellian designs of the North than with objective forces, 
especially the changing structure of production occasioned by advances in 
science and technology. As mentioned, there has been a shift from 
material-based manufacturing such as shoemaking and tire manufacture to 
knowledge-based manufacturing industries such as computers; there has also 
been a shift from the production of goods to services. Because of these 
changes, the share of manufacturing in GDP has been decreasing gradually 
since 1965, and the share of services has been increasing.12 

Changes in the technology of production are reducing the primary 
commodity content of manufactures. Thus it has been estimated that since 
1900 the quantity of raw materials needed for a given unit of manufacture has 
been declining slowly but steadily at a rate of 1.25 percent a year compounded. 
The biotechnology revolution is threatening commodity producers, too. By 
techniques like tissue culture, tropical primary products or their equivalents can 
now be produced in laboratories in the North. Protein for animal feed may soon 
be produced from petroleum in European laboratories and factories and make 
the export of soybeans and cassava unnecessary. However, there is some 
chance that new possibilities for these commodities might open up. Also, as the 
Overseas Development 
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Institute reports, research is tinder way in Europe for the production of such 
commodities as cocoa butter and pyrethrum. It is telling that all the changes 
discussed here are irreversible. 

The preoccupation of African leaders and the international development 
community with the fluctuations of commodity prices and the worsening of the 
terms of trade for commodity producers is understandable. It is indeed highly 
desirable that Africa earn more for its commodities and that commodity prices 
be more stable. Certainly much can said for retaining and, if possible, 
increasing market shares, for increasing productivity and export intensity in 
commodities. 

But Africa must look beyond these concerns, for they are not really the 
solution and the problems they raise are considerable, For instance, as cocoa 
producers in West Africa have discovered, increased productivity across the 
board may leave primary producers poorer as they compete among themselves 
and force down world commodity prices. Africa needs to be productive and 
competitive and to diversify and strive for industrialization instead of being 
fixated on commodity prices. 

The commodity problem is real. But it is poorly conceived and exagger-
ated. It is the symptom of the more fundamental failures in development 
strategies that have hindered productivity, competitiveness, diversification, and 
industrialization. Higher commodity prices would not contribute much to the 
resolution of the African crisis, whose causes lie in the limitation of the 
broader policy framework and in a political context that is detrimental to 
development. 

 
Conclusion: Marginalization and Self-Reliance 

 
African leaders and the international development community alike are 

now less interested in grand strategies of development. The emphasis has 
shifted to pragmatism, to such policy instruments and options as encouraging 
foreign investment, eliminating or reducing the debt burden, improving the 
terms of trade, and realizing greater production, export intensity, and better 
prices for commodities. Those options suggest that development can be 
achieved by relatively modest adjustments on the vertical relationship between 
Africa and the North. However, doing so is not an appropriate policy option. 
As discussed, the necessary adjustments are problematic. But even if they were 
not so problematic, this approach would still fail. To understand why, one must 
put considerations on Africa and the global economy in the context of the 
discourse on the marginalization  
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of Africa. For only in that context can one clearly see the economic and 
political constraints on the strategy of development by adjustment of the 
vertical relations between Africa and the North and also the reasons why the 
African crisis is primarily political rather than economic. 
 

Marginalization and Its Genesis 
 

What is the discourse on the marginalization of Africa saying? What 
exactly does the marginalization of Africa mean? What is being said is quite 
clear and simple. The concern is mainly (but not exclusively) with economic 
marginalization, with the economic regression of Africa relative to other 
regions of the world and the diminishing importance and relevance of Africa to 
the global economy, particularly to the industrialized countries. The statistics 
of Africa's role in the global economy make the point well enough. Africa's 
share of exports in world trade, which was only 2.4 percent in 1970, was down 
to 1.4 percent by 1990. Even its share of non-oil primary commodities fell 
from 7 percent to less than 4 percent in the same period.13 That is why Africa 
was deservedly voiceless at the GATT negotiations and quite predictably came 
out worse than any other region. A 1993 study for the World Bank and the 
OECD Development Center estimates that, on account of the GATT 
agreement, the world will be at least $213 billion richer a year by 2002, 
whereas Sub-Saharan Africa will be $2.6 billion a year poorer.14 

Like every other key indicator, net financial flows to Africa have been 
diminishing steadily. Significantly, the decline continued even after 1986, the 
year that the world community set out to reverse such trends by launching 
UNPAAERD. Net financial resource flow to Africa was $15.8 billion in 1985, 
$22.2 billion in 1990, and $18.4 billion in 1992. But at 1985 constant dollars 
and if allowance is made for profit, interest, and capital repayment, net 
financial transfers to Africa in real terms declined to $10.4 billion in 1990 and 
$5.3 billion in 1992. Overseas development assistance fell from $19.7 billion 
in 1990 to $18.3 billion in 1991 and $12.1 billion in 1992. 

This trend holds for bilateral relations between most industrialized 
countries and Africa. Perhaps the United States is a good example, since it is 
an important country that was not a colonial power. U.S. interest in 
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Africa began and peaked in 1958-62, driven by the Kennedy administration's 
concern about a communist presence starting from Egypt and spreading to the 
rest of Africa. In this period U.S. aid to Africa rose from $110 million to $519 
million and Africa's share of U.S. aid increased from 2 percent to 8 percent.15 
But when the fear turned out to be exaggerated, U.S. interest waned. In the 
decade 1963-73 U.S aid to Africa declined steadily, from $519 million in 1963 
to $286 million in 1973. 16 Africa accounted for 6.0 percent of U.S. imports in 
1975, 4.1 percent in 1983, and roughly 2.0 percent in 1988. Africa's share of 
U.S. exports was 3.0 percent in 1970, 2.2 percent in 1983, and only 1.2 percent 
in 1988. In 1988 Sub-Saharan Africa accounted for only 1 percent of total U.S. 
investment in developing countries, and this investment was concentrated in 
the oil producing countries of Nigeria, Angola, Cameroon, and Gabon.17 By 
1990 Africa got only 0.46 percent of U.S. investment. Insignificant as this 
percent is, it is still declining. The economic marginality of Africa to the 
United States is now also being reflected in other spheres. For instance, the 
staffs of the Bureau of African Affairs of the State Department and the Africa 
Desk of the USAID are being decreased. The USAID has also been reducing 
its missions in Africa. 18 

How can one account for the problem of marginalization? Perhaps it is not 
necessary to do so, because the problem is more apparent than real. What is 
popularly called the problem of marginalization is essentially a restatement of 
the perennial problem of underdevelopment. Marginalization is in reality the 
dynamics of underdevelopment, the development of underdevelopment by the 
agents of development. According to the World Bank, the average annual 
growth rate of GNP per capita for Africa was 1.3 percent between 1980 and 
1990 and - 0.6 percent in 1991.19 Average agricultural (weighted) growth rate 
for 1970 to 1980 in Africa was 1.5 percent. With population growth rate 
averaging above 3 percent, Africa has became food dependent and prone to 
chronic malnutrition. Industrial value added has been virtually stagnant. The 
1989 long-term perspective study by the World Bank, Sub-Saharan Africa: 
From Crisis to Sustainable Growth, set a target of 5 percent value added for 
1990 and then 7 percent to 8 percent for subsequent years.20 But Africa 
managed only 2.1 percent 
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in 1990 and 2.9 percent in 1991, and there seems to be no chance of substantial 
improvement in the short to medium term.21 Indicators such as industrial value 
added could not improve with the weak performance in capital formation, a 
crucial statistic. 

The World Bank study also targeted a rate of 25 percent of GDP for gross 
domestic investment for Sub-Saharan Africa in the 1990s. But between 1989 
and 1991, the rates declined from 21.9 percent to 16.0 percent. 22 With a very 
low rate of return on investment and strong competition from Asia, the former 
Soviet-bloc countries, and Latin America, Africa's ability to attract foreign 
direct investment, already very poor, will not improve and might get worse. 
Foreign direct investment in Sub-Saharan Africa, small even at its peak of 
$2,303 million in 1989, was only $570 million in 1990 (Indonesia alone got 
$964 million in the same year) and $669 million in 1991.23 The state of 
financial resource flows to Africa can be seen from the fact that even the World 
Bank group, the agents of African development, have been recording negative 
transfers since the late 1980s. The terms of trade are against Africa, to the 
detriment of its growth potential. The average index fell by about 23 percent 
between 1985 and 1987 and then hovered around the same level until 1991, 
when it fell again by 8.9 percent .24 

In these circumstances Africa has become heavily indebted. Sub-Saharan 
Africa's debt as a percentage of GNP was 28.6 percent in 1980 and 107.9 
percent in 1991. As a percentage of total exports it was 96.6 percent in 1980 
and 329.4 percent in 1991. Debt service as a percentage of exports was 10.9 
percent in 1980 and 20.8 percent in 1981.25 It looks as though Africa can 
neither pay its debts nor grow out of them. 

For the most part, Africa has been stagnating or regressing economically. It 
has therefore become unattractive to foreign investors, unable to import or 
export much and so a virtual nonentity in world trade, and increasingly unable 
to elicit the interest of other regions. The decline is not just a cause of 
marginality; it is also the process of marginalization. The discourse on 
marginalization is really about the deepening crisis of underdevelopment. 
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Agents of Marginalization 
A notable weakness of the marginalization discourse is that it does not 

address the real problem. Who is decrying marginalization? Who or what is 
getting marginalized? By what? In what regard? Strangely enough, the 
discourse about the fate of Africa focuses on non-Africans. It orchestrates 
concerns about non-Africans not taking enough interest in Africa, not doing 
enough with it or for it, not giving it consideration. It worries about external 
social forces being allowed to complicate or even defeat Africa's bid to escape 
from underdevelopment. And it encourages non-Africans to pay more 
benevolent attention to Africa. 

Somehow the discourse manages to forget that it is natural and appropriate 
that Africa should be marginal to non-Africans, just as it should be primary to 
Africans. Worse still, it represents the development of Africa as being not so 
much what Africans do as what is done by outsiders about Africa. 
Development is strategized in such a way that those who have the most interest 
in development, those who should be its means and ends the Africans 
themselves-are marginalized. As a result, real development becomes 
impossible. In effect, the agents of development in Africa, namely, the African 
elites and the international development community, engendered this 
exogenous development strategy. 

The African elites marginalized the African role in the development of 
Africa by their politics. When the elites succeeded the colonial regime, they 
chose to inherit the colonial system rather than transform it in accordance with 
the democratic aspirations of the nationalist movement. Invariably, the elites 
fell out with their followers and became repressive. Repression bred more 
hostility, inviting more repression, in a continuing spiral. As a result, 
reactionary monolithism has dominated Africa in the form of single party 
regimes and military rule. Military rule in Africa reflects a reality that was 
already fully formed. It was not the military that caused military rule in Africa 
by intervening in politics; it was the character of politics that engendered 
military rule. By degenerating into warfare, politics propelled the specialists of 
violence to the lead role. 

Beset by a multitude of hostile forces that their betrayal of the nationalist 
movement and their political repression had created, the African elites 
developed a siege mentality. They became so absorbed in the struggle for 
survival that they could not pay much attention to anything else, especially 
development. More often than not, the things that the elites did to hang on to 
power became impediments to development. For example, they manipulated 
ethnic and communal loyalties to elicit loyalty and establish 
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common cause with some communities. In doing so, they divided into hostile 
camps not only the elites but also the wider society and transformed ethnicity 
into a violent and highly destructive force in many countries, including Togo, 
Congo, Rwanda, Kenya, Liberia, Angola, Uganda, Ethiopia, Burundi, 
Mauritania, Zaire, Nigeria, and Sudan. In trying to consolidate their power and 
to prevent rivals and opponents from having access to power, they used state 
power to control the economy and to appropriate wealth. This political strategy 
created an unproductive state capitalism in which surplus was accumulated and 
distributed with state power, and the law of value could not take root. The 
system has spawned administrative controls and regulations whose power of 
enforcement is used corruptly. 

Entrepreneurship has been discouraged. Economic success is dependent on 
state power or state patronage. For anyone outside the dominant faction of the 
political elites, it was generally futile to harbor hopes of becoming wealthy by 
entrepreneurial activity or even to take personal safety for granted. So these 
people directed their energy to seeking the inside track on power. For those 
who were part of the ruling faction, entrepreneurial activity became 
unnecessary, since wealth could be accumulated faster and with less risk by 
using state power. So entrepreneurship was blocked at both ends. 

A predatory state and Hobbesian politics have ruined the prospects of 
development by spreading alienation, resentment, inefficiency, and corruption. 
Politically disenfranchised and set upon by state violence, the people are no 
longer available for supporting the state or its development project. Some of 
them have retreated to ethnic or communal identity and local concerns. 
Political repression has forced highly educated and talented people to become 
political or economic refugees in other countries, their talents lost to the cause 
of national development. 

Having marginalized development as well as the vital agents of develop-
ment, African leaders have been reduced to making token gestures to 
development while attempting to shift the responsibility for it to foreign 
patrons. Although they talked about the fragility of political independence and 
the need to buttress it by means of self-reliant development, they eagerly 
embraced economic dependence and allowed outsiders to conceptualize and 
manage development, thus marginalizing even their own role in development. 
That is the background to the exogenous development and the economic 
regression that is all too apparent in Africa today. 

With the initiative for development conceded in this manner, development 
came to be regarded not so much as what Africans do as what others might do 
for Africa. Programmatically it was regarded as incremental 
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adjustments in the vertical relation between Africa and the industrialized 
countries in Africa's favor: more aid on more lenient terms, more access for 
African goods in Western markets and on better terms, more transfer of 
technology, more investment, and more debt forgiveness. 
 

The Benefits of Marginalization 
Perhaps marginalization, so often decried, is what Africa needs right now. 

For one thing, it will help the evolution of an endogenous development agenda, 
an agenda that expresses the aspirations of the people and can therefore elicit 
their support. Because of exogeneity, and its contradictions, Africa does not 
even at this late stage have a development agenda. As noted, what Africa has is 
a confusion of agendas, reflecting the demonstrated failure of an exogenous 
agenda that its promoters do not acknowledge and the unfulfilled promise of an 
endogenous agenda that African leaders are too dependent and too diffident to 
push through. 

The marginalization of Africa in the world economy could be useful in 
another important sense. Insofar as it leaves the development of Africa to 
Africans, it offers a chance of breaking out of another major development 
trap-the dissociation of development strategy from social experience. This 
problem arises from the values and social situation of the external agents and 
patrons of development. The external agents who are "developing" Africa 
inevitably see development as the reproduction of their own society, achievable 
by their own tutelage and the gradual transfer of relevant values from their 
society to Africa. This view underlies the familiar notion of development as an 
adjustment of the vertical relationship between Africa and the industrialized 
countries, by transferring resources downward. 

When a people must be developed not by themselves but by others, 
development becomes a benevolence that is largely insensitive to social needs. 
In Africa, one might say, what currently prevails is development against the 
people-not of them or for them. The African variety of structural adjustment, 
well-meaning as it might be or even "necessary," is an excellent example of 
this odd phenomenon. In the name of economic growth, real incomes are 
reduced by as much as 40 percent or more overnight. The prices of social 
services and staples are raised enormously, and inflation rates soar. These are 
the kinds of magnitudes of austerity that have earned the IMF the title of mad 
doctor. They break down social consensus, cause violent conflict, anxiety and 
deep despair, and sometimes premature death on a large scale, especially 
among children. These grim 
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notions of policy reform can be inflicted only by people who do not belong to 
the adjusting society or by those who are immune to the impact of the reform. 

However, the scientific validity or long-run effects of structural adjustment 
may be rationalized, and whatever the good intentions of its managers, the 
undeniable fact is that these managers cannot be held to account. Social needs 
cannot be externally defined. Only endogenous development can bring 
development strategy into harmony with social needs. 

Foreign development agents do not see the people as agents of 
development or as the essential energy that must fuel it, as a source of ideas of 
how to proceed, or even as a constituency to which the agents are accountable. 
With few exceptions, they do not take seriously the idea of the people 
developing themselves. They also have political interests that are unlikely to be 
served by making development an open-ended democratic process, determined 
by the will of the people, drawing on their energy, and serving their interest. 

Neither do most African leaders act as if they believe in the need for their 
people to be the engine of development. They assume that what development 
requires is known and clear: their own leadership and the passive acquiescence 
of the masses. Indeed, that was the ideological basis of the single-party 
regimes, as well as military rule, and the rationale for criminalizing dissent in 
Africa's interregnum of political authoritarianism. But having marginalized the 
people, this development paradigm cannot draw on their support, and it cannot 
even be put into effect. Leaders are obliged to look outside for aid, investment, 
and technical assistance rather than tap the energy of the people. So the 
strategy that was originally an effect of the alienation and marginalization of 
the people becomes also its cause. There is no development in alienation. 

Development can only be related to and driven by social will in the context 
of democracy. It is only in this context that the people can be the means and the 
end of development. Without democracy, the advantages of demarginalizing 
Africans in the development process and giving them control cannot be 
realized. With minor exceptions, African elites have placed great obstacles in 
the way of development by their antipathy to democracy. 

The international development community has compounded these ob-
stacles in its confusion over the merits of exogeneity and the relationship 
between democracy and the market. It assumes that it is promoting democracy 
and development simultaneously by supporting policy reform and political 
conditionality. To do so depends on a prior assumption, namely, 
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that the liberation of market forces is never contradictory to democratization 
even in the short run. But this is mistaken; that relationship is mediated in very 
complex ways by historical conjunctures and permutations of sequences of 
democratization and market reform and any number of other salient intervening 
variables. 
 

The African Experience 
Without going into these complexities, I want to make a few general 

comments to show how, proceeding from their abstract assumptions about the 
harmony of market reform and democracy and development, the international 
development community has in fact been subverting democracy and 
development. It has not taken full account of two concrete particulars: 
exogeneity and the special character and content of policy reform in Africa. 

The African experience shows that exogencity defeats democracy, 
whatever the intentions of the developmental and economic policies associated 
with it. External development agents, who are presumably democrats, have felt 
constrained to give market reform priority over democracy. The most 
important issue of public policy, namely, structural adjustment programs 
(SAPs), is not subject to democratic choice, because the agents distrust the 
people's ability to chose correctly on an issue in which "the right choice" is 
absolutely clear. At the same time, SAPs are so draconian that they are 
assumed to require imposition. 

Zambia's experience shows how these assumptions play out. Despite its 
breezy confidence, the development community is failing to reconcile its 
support of democracy with its support of SAPs. In effect, what has emerged is 
the following accommodation. The development community supports the 
African regime and its democratization on the understanding that it is 
disempowered, so it cannot choose against the market. Unable to go anywhere 
except with the SAPs, the government then proceeds to implement them, not 
by democratic sanction but by disempowering the people in turn and imposing 
the programs. 

When the Kaunda government broke with the IMF in May 1987, and 
adopted a home-grown reform program, the New Economic Reform Program, 
the Zambia Congress of Trade Unions (ZCTU) supported the move "in the 
national interest." Also, when the government went back to the IMF in 
September 1989 after the failure of the program, the ZCTU remained 
consistent and opposed that action. However, in 1990 ZCTU decided to 
support the Movement for Multiparty Democracy (MMD), a political 
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formation dominated by business people and commercial farmers that was in 
favor of policy reform. With the help of ZCTU, the MMD came to power on 
October 31, 1991, in a landslide victory, capturing 125 out of the 150 seats in 
parliament. 

The victory was a mandate for democracy. But it was also a mandate for 
reform. And the democratization mandate succumbed. After the victory of 
Frederick Chiluba and the MMD, the Western powers poured aid into Zambia. 
As was to be expected, the aid was contingent on Zambia's embracing reform 
unequivocally, an easy conditionality because the MMD's internal financiers, 
the powerful Zambian business lobby called the G-7 Club was in favor of 
reform. So Chiluba embarked on a harsh, ambitious project of reform, which 
included astronomical inflation rates (fueled by the 500 percent increase in the 
price of maize meal) and the scaling down of social services. 

The labor movement broke with the MMD government, denouncing the 
harshness of the reform program. The new president of the ZCTU, Fackson 
Shamenda, has complained that the MMD and the government are now captive 
to business interests. The unofficial labor strikes that were characteristic of the 
turbulent last years of the Kaunda regime have started again. Under pressure, 
Chiluba has become increasingly authoritarian; for instance, he dismissed four 
senior ministers, including the minister of finance, and belligerently refused to 
give an explanation. On March 8, 1993, he declared a state of emergency and 
gave himself extraordinary powers on the pretext of a plot to overthrow his 
government, the socalled Zero Option Plan. 

President Chiluba, the symbol of the democratic revolution, became a 
means of disempowerment. With the support of the business and international 
community, his government subverted the democratic side of his dual mandate 
while pressing the other, policy reform, against the opposition of mass 
organizations. Though increasingly alienated and distressed, the people of 
Zambia have no place to turn; the Kaunda regime was so discredited and the 
victory of MMD was so commanding that there is currently no credible 
alternative. 

However, Chiluba's winning coalition is in disarray. In August 1993, nine 
members of parliament resigned from the MMD, citing corruption and poor 
leadership, and declared their intention to form a new party to challenge 
Chiluba and the MMD in the election of 1996. Significantly, these were people 
who were crucial for the victory of the MMD in 1991. The president's biggest 
problem now appears to be the widespread belief that he is governed by 
Western donors, whose agenda has become dominant  
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in Zambian public policy. He is perceived to have been forced by the West into 
giving the highest priority to fighting drug trafficking, a perception 
strengthened by his dismissal of Boniface Kwawimbe, his health minister, and 
Dean Mung' OMB, a deputy minister in the presidency, Seeing no alternative 
for now, Zambians are expressing themselves in the perfect metaphor of 
political disempowerment, apathy. In the local government elections of 
December 1992, fewer than 20 percent of the registered voters bothered to 
participate. 

The experience of Zambia can be expected to occur repeatedly with minor 
variations, for exogeneity is incompatible with accountability and that is only 
one of its patent irrationalities. There is no accountability in exogenous 
development because there is no way of holding the foreign managers of the 
economy responsible for the policies they initiate. They do not seek or need a 
democratic mandate from their client states. And yet their power is decisive. 
The World Bank and the IMF, in particular, have become the dominant power 
over economic management in Africa, by virtue of the resources they control, 
their monopoly of information, and their aura of scientific authority and by 
being the gateway to northern support. By all indications, the Bretton Woods 
institutions have unfortunately come to symbolize power without 
responsibility, rather like the failed national leadership. 

With its principal players dissociated from the culture, the social needs, 
and the social will of the people supposedly being developed, exogeneity is 
singularly irrational. One cannot do social engineering successfully and 
without trauma by focusing on what ought to be, while refusing to take society 
as it is. Exogenous development implicitly assumes that development is 
politically neutral, an assumption clearly reflected in the tendency to place the 
most important decisions of public policy beyond politics and to find it 
appropriate to exercise power without responsibility. Exogeneity is also 
irrational in failing to recognize or in ignoring the interface of the economic 
and political markets. Only the economic market counts, not the political 
market that moderates it and ensures that its blind forces do not annul all 
collective purpose even as they confer the benefit of efficiency and 
productivity. Finally, exogeneity is irrational in the contradiction between its 
manifest and latent functions; the one develops for the people, the other against 
the people. It renders the political market inoperable and irrelevant. 

To conclude, if Africa is marginal to the rest of the world, that is as it 
should be. The problem is not, as is often imagined, Africa's marginality to the 
rest of the world but the marginalization of Africans in the development  

 122



 123

of Africa. This is precisely why the development project in Africa cannot get 
started. Development is something that people do by themselves and for 
themselves, or it does not happen. The people of Africa will have to empower 
themselves to repossess their own development, a formidable task. Only a 
successful struggle for repossession will finally remove the obstacles that have 
until now grounded the development project. 
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5  
The Residual Option 

In this final chapter, I want to outline what the appropriate development 
paradigm for Africa might look like, taking account of present realities in 
Africa and the global environment at large. First I review the nature of the 
paradigm, I then examine its political presuppositions, and finally I consider its 
development strategy. 
 

The Nature of the Paradigm 
As an approach to development, this paradigm may be characterized as the 

residual option, to suggest what is likely to remain after separating out the 
confusions, irrelevances, frills, and distortions that stand in the way of 
strategizing development in Africa. What is left after this sorting out process is 
the energy of ordinary people. 

To avoid misunderstanding, it should be emphasized that what I offer here 
is the sketch of a paradigm, not a blueprint or an action plan. I do not go into 
the particulars of industrial and agricultural policies, tariff regimes, demand 
and supply management, or the methods for raising investment and saving 
ratios, labor productivity, export earnings, and the like. The paradigm will be 
necessarily formal and abstract. 

A paradigm in this context can be only about the logic, the values, the 
principles, and the general path of movement, a theoretical structure of 
experience whose practical operation will vary depending on the historical 
circumstances of each country. To be sure, some concrete details will be 
needed for clarity. However, the paradigm cannot rest on the validity of such 
"facts"; its validity depends initially on its logic, its principles, and its grasp 
and articulation of the problem. This is not to deny that its ultimate vindication 
depends on the success or failure of those who practice it; but that is another 
matter. 
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It is important to remember that the logic, principles, and values of the 
paradigm are neither arbitrary constructs nor abstractions; the), are derived 
from, indeed determined by, the problem. A paradigm is a manner of 
proceeding in regard to a problem, a possible solution. Therefore its 
constitution as well as its relevance depends crucially on the nature of the 
problem. 

It is extremely important to bear this obvious but often neglected point in 
mind, because one of the difficulties of the development literature in Africa is 
the relation of problem and solution. Often the problem is unclear, and if so, it 
cannot have a solution. Scholars and agents of development tend to focus on 
ideologically derived answers to the problem of development that bear no 
relation to the nature of the problem. Their concern is not so much to solve a 
problem on its own terms as to realize an image of the world. 

It is because of this bias that in the preceding chapters I have articulated 
what the problem is, what it is not, and what a particular understanding of an 
aspect of the problem entails. In this sense those chapters are an important part 
of the paradigm, if not the most important part, for they determine its character: 
its logic, its values, its principles, and the way in which they relate. 

The basic assumptions of the paradigm are as follows: 
-Development is not economic growth even though economic growth in 

large measure determines its possibility. A development paradigm cannot 
therefore be judged merely by its conduciveness to economic growth, although 
this criterion of judgment is not irrelevant to its validity. 

-Development is not a project but a process. 
-Development is the process by which people create and recreate 

themselves and their life circumstances to realize higher levels of civilization 
in accordance with their own choices and values. 

-Development is something that people must do for themselves, although it 
can be facilitated by the help of others. If people are the end of development, as 
is the case, they are also necessarily its agent and its means. 

-Africa and the global environment are to be taken as they are and not as 
they ought to be. What the paradigm contributes is some idea of what they can 
be. 

These assumptions are largely the prevailing conventional wisdom of the 
development community. The only thing new here is that I take them seriously 
and apply them systematically, allowing them to color and shape 
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every aspect of development. As will be seen, applying these assumptions 
systematically results in a markedly different way of approaching development 
from that prevailing today. 

The difficulties of changing to a different way of seeing and doing things 
from those with which everyone is familiar are notorious. They are all the more 
so in the field of development, where the prevailing paradigm is so well 
established, so apparently plausible, and so embedded and legitimized in the 
existing structuration of power that the very idea of a possible alternative 
seems frivolous and utopian. 
 

The Politics of the Development Paradigm 
I want to begin by specifying the political context of the development 

paradigm. As has been seen, development strategies are not made and 
implemented in a political vacuum, especially since development is a collective 
enterprise. Every development strategy is always contextualized in a particular 
state, social structure, culture, and meaning. It implies a structure of politics, 
but it also influences political interactions, practices, and outcomes. 

By the assumptions of the paradigm African countries can develop only in 
the context of democratic politics. Considerable confusion exists among 
scholars of development over the relationship between development and 
democracy. Some say there is no necessary relation between democracy and 
development. Some argue that democracy is detrimental to development; 
others think it is conducive to it. And some think the matter is one of 
sequencing. By all indications this confusion arises from scholars' not taking 
the assumptions, the conventional wisdom, seriously. Once that is done, the 
confusion disappears; there may be errors but not confusion. 

The prevailing development ideology, like the paradigm, sees the people as 
the end of development. In practice, however, they are only nominally so. That 
is not surprising, since people cannot be the end of development unless they 
are already its agents and its means, a condition that has never been true in 
Africa. If the people are the agents of development-that is, those with the 
responsibility to decide what development is, what values it is to maximize, 
and the methods for realizing it-they must also have the prerogative of making 
public policy at all levels. They must not merely participate in the conventional 
sense of the word; they must be the ones who decide on how to proceed with 
social transformation. To be sure, up to a point it is possible for the people to 
be the means of development without the need for a democratic political 
system: 
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the people can be coerced or manipulated to give their resources to promote 
their leaders' notion of development. However, this process of enlisting the 
people's resources is oppressive and exploitative rather than emancipatory, and 
a process that is not emancipatory cannot be conducive to development. An 
oppressive and exploitative way of seeking development is a contradiction in 
terms. That leaves the option of the people making themselves the means of 
development, and this option requires political democracy. 

Finally, if people are the end of development, then their well-being is the 
supreme law of development. But the well-being of the people will only be the 
supreme law of development if they have some decision making power. It is 
possible of course that someone can exercise public decision making power to 
the benefit of others. But the only one way to ensure that social transformation 
is not dissociated from the well-being of the people is to institute democracy. 

In insisting on the necessity of political democracy, one should recognize 
that for the development community democracy in development is highly 
problematic and possibly undesirable. Some think that democracy tends to 
complicate the task of development or that it may be detrimental to 
development. No doubt the world as a whole and the development community 
in particular has been very impressed by what the newly industrializing 
countries (NICs)- notably, Thailand, Taiwan, South Korea, and Singapore-have 
achieved under authoritarian rule. The dramatic performance of China in the 
last fifteen years has reinforced this view. Although no one is saying that 
countries seeking development should embrace authoritarianism, some believe 
that the new emphasis on democracy in Africa is misguided and may well be 
detrimental. Sometimes the discussion of the success of the East Asian 
countries hints at the need for a benign, efficient dictatorship with the 
"appropriate" macroeconomic framework. 

There are many difficulties, some dilemmas, and not a little confusion in 
this debate, and some clarification is in order. To begin with, most people 
conflate development and economic growth. When they cite the impressive 
achievements of authoritarian countries such as South Korea in development, 
the content they give to development is usually economic growth. What I am 
interested in is development, and for present purposes the possible relation of 
political authoritarianism to development. A case for authoritarianism's being 
positively correlated to development does not really arise, because democracy 
is part of the very meaning of political development. 
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Still, it should be said that the authoritarianism of the East Asian economic 
growth is a complicated fact. As the World Bank study The East Asian Miracle 
indicates, the authoritarianism of the NICs in East Asia has certain "redeeming 
features"1 -features that are usually associated with a democratic polity but that 
may also occur in a more rudimentary form in nondemocratic polities. These 
include accountability, predictability, the rule of law, and competition. In each 
of these countries a disciplined political class with a well-articulated national 
project of development achieved some element of accountability by taking its 
obligations to the nation seriously; it was able to achieve some 
predictability-lawful rule by its own internal discipline and by its 
understanding of the importance of predictability as a desirable business 
environment-as well as to achieve competition in certain stipulated spheres. 
Labeling the NICs autocratic is not inaccurate, but it conceals those features 
that signal the existence of some critical, though imperfect, democratic values. 
Political authoritarianism needs to be differentiated. The authoritarianism of 
the NICs of East Asia is entirely different from that of Africa, which tends to 
lack these rudimentary democratic values, to the detriment of economic 
growth. 

If it is granted that these features played an important role in economic 
growth in the NICs of East Asia, these countries, far from refuting the 
usefulness of democracy to economic growth, give it some weak support. One 
might then argue that if authoritarian regimes are able to mimic some 
democratic values and use them effectively to achieve rapid economic growth, 
there is no need to put so much energy into clamoring for democracy. That 
would be a mistake, however. The existence of these limited democratic values 
in authoritarian regimes is fortuitous; it depends on the character and the will 
of the dominant faction of the political class. If these values are so necessary, 
their existence should not be merely fortuitous; it should be objective and 
guaranteed. But only in the context of a mature democracy can values such as 
the rule of law, accountability, transparency, and competitiveness be fully 
operational as well as guaranteed. 

It is important to avoid thinking of Africa by making analogies and easy 
comparisons with the experiences of others, especially the NICs of East Asia. 
Political authoritarianism has its own specificity, which markedly affects its 
consequences. While in East Asia autocratic states are well established and in 
control, in most African countries there is really no state, liberal or autocratic. 
What exists is a public force that should be 
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the state but that is only nominally so because it is essentially privatized. Being 
privatized, the so-called state is not able to rise above the struggles and 
conflicts of contending social groups. It becomes itself a contested terrain 
where contending parties vie for the appropriation of resources, including the 
power of the state. All this spells an unusually intense political competition, in 
which the stakes are so high that the situation is essentially lawless; politics is 
basically warfare, or at best an anarchy of dedicated self seeking. 

In most of Sub-Saharan Africa, unlike East Asia, the state not only is very 
rudimentary, if it can be said to exist at all, but was also displaced. It was 
displaced by colonialism, which in the course of its violent assault on 
indigenous society directed loyalties to primary groups, and also by the 
state-building project of the post-independence era, which was almost as 
coercive as the colonial state-building project and had roughly the same effect. 

In Africa political authoritarianism prevents the crystallization of the state 
or even of a political class. Rather, it tends to constitute a plurality of 
"informal" primary groups that are largely the repository of loyalties. It 
unleashes powerful centrifugal forces that render the polity incoherent and 
unable to establish a common purpose, including a development project, and to 
pursue it effectively. In short, political authoritarianism is an important reason 
why the development project in Africa has not been able to take off. 
 

The Feasibility of Democracy in Africa 
It is not enough to settle the question of the desirability or even the 

necessity of democracy in Africa. How about its feasibility? In the context of 
my concern here with development, that is the critical question. 

But before addressing this question, it is necessary to deal with a 
preliminary question: what is democracy? And, in particular, what is the kind 
of democracy whose feasibility is at issue in Africa? About this question there 
is also much arbitrariness and confusion. But once again, by taking the familiar 
assumptions of development practice seriously, the confusion can be dispelled. 
On these assumptions Africa requires somewhat more than the crude variety of 
liberal democracy that is being foisted on it, and even more than the 
impoverished liberal democracy that prevails in the industrialized countries. 
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The North's Attitude to Democracy in Africa 
Even at its best, liberal democracy is inimical to the idea of the people 

having effective decision making power. The essence of liberal democracy is 
precisely the abolition of popular power and the replacement of popular 
sovereignty with the rule of law. As it evolved, liberal democracy got less 
democratic as its democratic elements, such as the consent of the government, 
the accountability of power to the governed, and popular participation, came 
under pressure from political elites all over the world as well as from 
mainstream social science, which seemed even more suspicious of democracy 
than political elites, On the pretext of clarifying the meaning of democracy, 
Western social science has constantly redefined it, to the detriment of its 
democratic values. 

To illustrate, the group theory of politics evades the meaning of democracy 
and pushes the notion that the essence of democracy is the dynamics of group 
competition, which prevents the monopolization of power and allows the 
accommodation of the broad concerns of many groups. According to the 
interest group theory of democracy, the citizen is no longer a real or potential 
lawmaker, a participant in sovereignty, but only a supplicant for favorable 
policy results in accord with articulated interests. For the protective theory of 
democracy, the democratic polity is one in which the citizen is protected 
against the state, especially by virtue of a vibrant civil society. Sovereignty 
disappears as does participation as people settle for protection. In several 
important books political apathy has been praised for being conducive to 
political stability or for being a mark of satisfaction with the rulers.2 More 
recently, in the hurry to globalize democracy in the wake of the cold war, 
democracy has been reduced to the crude simplicity of multiparty elections to 
the benefit of some of the world's most notorious autocrats, such as Daniel arap 
Moi of Kenya and Paul Biya of Cameroon, who are now able to parade 
democratic credentials without reforming their repressive regimes.3 

For Africa, the concern of northern countries in promoting even this crude 
version of democracy is some progress. Through decades of involvement in 
Africa, the North's attitude had been that democracy is not for Africa. That 
attitude was an important component of the ideology of colonization, which 
held that Africans were unfit to govern themselves, that they needed the 
civilization of colonial tutelage as their one hope of eventually achieving 
self-determination and development. 
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Even in the era of political independence in Africa, the North remained 
indifferent to issues of democracy on the continent, alienated by the nationalist 
onslaught on its presumptions and concerned that self-government, which 
Africans had so "hastily" demanded, would fail. Northern governments were 
happy to cooperate with the newly independent African governments in a 
"partnership in development"; they gave indulgent support to authoritarian 
African regimes in order to maintain influence and to protect their interests. 
This support was all too easily given because the authoritarian tendencies of 
the postcolonial era only confirmed the North's prejudices against the political 
maturity of Africa. In their quest for allies in the cold war, the great powers 
ignored considerations of human rights in Africa and sought clients wherever 
they could. All this crystallized opinion against democracy in Africa. 

The prejudice was so strong that the question of democracy in Africa was 
hardly ever raised. From time to time-for instance, during the Carter 
administration in the United States-human rights became an issue, but never 
democracy. On the rare occasions when democracy was discussed, it was 
mainly to raise doubts about its feasibility. 

From the early 1990s, issues of democratization and human rights began to 
dominate the North's interest in Africa, the result largely of the "capitalist" 
revolution in eastern Europe and the winding down of the cold war. The Soviet 
empire was, in the eyes of the West, the antithesis of democracy. The spectacle 
of the long, dramatic, and largely successful democratic struggles that took 
place after the breakup of the empire convinced the West that liberal 
democracy was feasible everywhere, and western nations began to be sensitive 
to democracy's possibilities even in Africa. 

But Africa is so marginal now that it is difficult for non-Africans to bring 
themselves to care about what happens in the continent, including 
democratization, particularly when it entails some cost. The North says it cares 
about the democratization of Africa-but it would appear, not nearly enough. 
Clearly it is more interested in economic policy reform than democracy, and it 
is promoting structural adjustment in ways that tend to reinforce political 
authoritarianism. At the same time, the North continues to collude, often 
profitably, in making arms available to African governments, arms that are 
used for repression and that perpetuate underdevelopment. Insofar as the North 
is interested in democracy, it promotes a kind of democracy whose relevance to 
Africa is problematic at best and at worst prone to engender contradictions that 
tend to derail or trivialize democratization in Africa. 
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The Kind of Democracy Africa Needs 
I have discussed the kind of democracy that is unsuitable for Africa rather 

than the kind that Africa needs. It is time to redress the balance. Taking 
account of the stated assumptions of the paradigm as well as the social and 
economic realities of Africa, such as Africa's social pluralism, its poverty, its 
relatively low level of literacy, and the emphasis in rural communities on 
solidarity and cooperation, the suitable democracy for Africa would have the 
following four characteristics: 

-A democracy in which people have some real decision-making over and 
above the formal consent of electoral choice. This will entail, among other 
things, a powerful legislature, decentralization of power to local democratic 
formations, and considerable emphasis on the development of institutions for 
the aggregation and articulation of interests. 

-A social democracy that places emphasis on concrete political, social, and 
economic rights, as opposed to a liberal democracy that emphasizes abstract 
political rights. It will be a social democracy that invests heavily in the 
improvement of people's health, education, and capacity so that they can 
participate effectively. 

-A democracy that puts as much emphasis on collective rights as it does on 
individual rights. It will have to recognize nationalities, subnationalities, ethnic 
groups, and communities as social formations that express freedom and 
self-realization and will have to grant them rights to cultural expression and 
political and economic participation. This could mean, for instance, a second 
legislative chamber, a "chamber of nationalities," with considerable power in 
which all nationalities irrespective of their numerical strength are equal. It 
could mean consociational arrangements, not only at the national level but 
even at regional and community levels, It will also entail such arrangements as 
proportional representation and an electoral-spread formula like the one used in 
Nigeria, by which a party must secure a stipulated minimum percentage of 
votes over a large part of the country to win. 

-A democracy of incorporation. To be as inclusive as possible, the 
legislative bodies should in addition to nationality groups have special 
representation of mass organizations, especially youth, the labor movement, 
and women's groups, which are usually marginalized but without whose active 
participation there is unlikely to be democracy or development. 

Realizing this kind of democracy will depend partly on how far the 
democratization process is driven by Africans themselves, especially  

 132



non-elites. What are the prospects of democratization from within? On balance, 
the prospects are favorable. One reason is the failure of the development 
project in Africa, which has brought most African governments and ruling 
elites into disrepute and caused a monumental legitimacy crisis in most of the 
continent. 

The standing of the political elites suffers not only from evident manage-
ment failure but also from their appearance of neither knowing what to do 
about the mounting crisis nor being in control of events. They appear 
exhausted, defeated, and bewildered, and they have ceded the initiative to the 
international development community, which has also been beaten by the 
so-called African problem, although still managing to keep the appearance of 
self-assurance through ideological dogmatism. 

The African political elites have been further weakened by the sheer 
visibility of their lack of control, their poverty of ideas, and their humiliation. 
Everyone can see the tragic consequences of a grossly mismanaged economy, 
and everyone can see that those responsible for it do not know how to make 
amends. Everyone can see how agents of international financial institutions 
take over significant functions of government, approving tariff regimes, 
decreeing the level of social services, and deciding on subsidies, privatization, 
issues of trade, wage levels, the locations of industry, the choice of consultants 
for government projects, and so forth. 

In some countries poorly paid policemen are out of control and openly 
extort money from citizens. Poorly paid soldiers have become bandits, seating 
off isolated country roads and mounting illegal checkpoints to extort money. 
As if it is not enough to cede control of the economy to foreigners and to lose 
control over the armed forces, Africa's ruling elites are also losing control of 
their cities and countryside because of collapsing infrastructure, unserviceable 
roads, and the encroachment of the forest. The evident helplessness and 
humiliation of African leaders has emboldened people to defiance. 

The structural adjustment programs that African countries have been 
obliged to adopt are compounding the weakness of the state in Africa owing to 
their one-sided emphasis on privatization, denationalization, and reliance on 
market forces. These problems are weakening the state even politically. They 
are so drastic and so severe in their impact that they engender hostility to the 
state and undermine its limited legitimacy. In some cases, such as Zambia, 
Gabon, and Nigeria, they have led to popular insurrections against the state. 

Finally, the rigors of the African crisis, especially structural adjustment 
programs, have forced the masses in Africa to turn away from states that 
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seem helpless in the face of a persistent and deepening crisis, states whose 
ability to maintain social services and infrastructure are visibly declining or 
nonexistent. For the most part, people are turning to community organizations, 
special interest groups, and self-help projects to survive and to arrest the 
erosion of social services as well as the collapse of the social infrastructure. 
Even as the state often remains powerful and meddlesome, it is increasingly 
perceived by its citizens as irrelevant at best, and a nuisance at worst. 

The African state is even less likely to be the focus of its citizens' primary 
loyalty now than it was twenty years ago. To be sure, the weakness of the state 
and even its displacement does not necessarily translate into a buoyant civil 
society, a thriving associational life, or democratization, but it improves the 
prospects of opening alternative political spaces and for waging democratic 
struggles. 

A major asset to democratization in Africa is the growing realization that 
there is no alternative to participative development. At the Bretton Woods 
Committee meeting in Washington in April 1990 the president of the World 
Bank, Barber Conable, listed better governance as the primary requirement for 
economic recovery in Africa. The World Bank's African blueprint, 
Sub-Saharan Africa: From Crisis to Sustainable Growth (1989), highlights the 
necessity of accountability, participation, and consensus building for 
development. And the Bank's press clips on the report show that this view has 
won approval all over the world. 

A conference of more than five hundred groups representing nongov-
ernmental grass-roots organizations, UN agencies, and government, which 
convened in Arusha, Tanzania, in February 1990 under the auspices of the UN 
Economic Commission for Africa (UNECA), resulted in the African Charter 
for Popular Participation in Development and Transformation. The Charter 
points out that the absence of democracy is the main cause of the chronic crisis 
in Africa. A speech by the UN secretary-general Javier P6rez de Cu6llar at the 
Arusha conference argued an inescapable link between economic recovery in 
Africa and participation. A declaration called The Political and 
Socio-Economic Situation in Africa and the Fundamental Changes Taking 
Place in the World, which was adopted by the twenty-sixth summit of the 
Organization of African Unity, held in Addis Ababa, July 9 - 11, 1990, 
acknowledged that a political environment that guarantees human rights and 
the rule of law would be more conducive to accountability and probity than is 
the present environment and that "popular-based political processes would 
ensure the involvement of all... in development efforts." 
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Africa's Struggle for Democracy 
The foregoing are as yet only theoretical explorations of the feasibility of 

democratization in Africa. But what are the realities on the ground? What is the 
actual state of the struggle for democracy in Africa? 

A strong movement for democracy is firmly in place in Africa, and it has 
had considerable success. Just a decade ago, military rule, one-party systems, 
and personal rule were the standard fare in Africa. Now they are the exception 
rather than the rule. An impressive number of African countries can boast of 
electoral competition, constitutionalism, popular participation, and a 
respectable human rights record: Botswana, Cape Verde, Senegal, Namibia, 
Mali, Zambia, Gambia, Mauritius, Benin, and São Tomé and Principe. Many 
more have made attempts at democratic transition. These include Nigeria, 
Ghana, Cameroon, Angola, Tanzania, Niger, Congo, Burkina Faso, Mauritania, 
Guinea-Bissau, Ivory Coast, Togo, Mozambique, Kenya, Lesotho, and 
Seychelles. Most of these have turned out to be false starts; the democratization 
has often been shallow. But a few, especially Benin and South Africa, have 
been remarkably successful. Several countries, such as Zaire, are still holding 
out. But the pressures for democratization are so strong that for most of Africa 
it is no longer a question of whether there will be a democratic transition but 
when. 

By 1989 authoritarian regimes were being challenged all over Africa, and 
popular demonstrations for political liberalization and democracy were 
commonplace. By 1990 there was no doubt that a fundamental political change 
was taking place as the popular pressures for political reform grew in intensity 
and spread. In 1989 thirty-eight of the forty-five countries of Sub-Saharan 
Africa were being ruled either by an autocrat, the military, or a single party. By 
1994 military or de facto military regimes had become a curiosity; all but a 
handful of African countries are now at some stage of democratic transition. 

In 1990, a watershed in the democracy movement in Africa, there were 
popular uprisings in fourteen countries for liberalization and democracy. In 
Ivory Coast, demonstrations in February and May 1990 demanded a multiparty 
system. In Zaire, an innocuous forum for political dialogue that President 
Mobutu Sese Seko had allowed as a way of diffusing political frustration 
criticized Mobutu and his government vehemently. By May there were violent 
demonstrations for a multiparty system. 

In Zambia, riots broke out as people demanded an end to one-party rule, 
prompting the government to promise a referendum on the issue. In August 
1990 Mozambique's government was obliged to promise multi-party 
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elections in 1991; Angola had already accepted the principle of a competitive 
party system in June 1990. In Kenya, riots broke out in July 1990 in protest 
against political monolithism and President Moi's disregard of the rule of law. 
In Cameroon, political tension rose in February 1990 following a lawyers' 
strike in February to protest the arrest and trial of Albert Mukong, a dissident. 
When Yondo Black, the former head of the Cameroon bar, was arrested for 
allegedly forming an opposition party in February 1990, people began to call 
openly for a multiparty election. Kenya endured days of rioting in July 1990, 
after the arrest of two prominent advocates of pluralism, Kenneth Matiba and 
Charles Rubia. 

It would appear that the majority of African leaders initially reacted to the 
democratization demands by making the minimal reforms that would, they 
hoped, deradicalize the movement. More often than not this took the form of 
administrative reforms in the exercise of the autocrat's personal power or 
political reform of the ruling party: for instance, Moi's Commission on the 
Reform of KANU (Kenyan African National Union); President Gnassingbe 
Eyadema's restructuring of the ruling party in Togo in January 1990; President 
Kenneth Kaunda's dismissal of his cabinet and the reshuffling of provincial 
governors in June 1990; Jerry Rawlings's institution of decentralization; the 
resignation of President Mobutu as head of the Popular Movement of the 
Revolution (MPR), and the revocation of the ban on opposition parties in April 
1990; and the abandonment of the doctrine of the supremacy of the party in 
Benin in December 1989 and in the Congo in July 1990. But these failed to 
contain the surge of the democratic revolution. Even leaders like Rawlings, 
Eyadema, Biya, and Moi who took the hard line found the pressures 
unrelenting and eventually accepted multiparty elections. In each of these 
cases, the movement became more insistent. All of them have been forced to 
concede, to accept the multiparty system. Some like Biya and Eyadema have 
tried to maintain power through a spurious democratic legitimacy of rigged 
elections, but that has not removed the pressure for democracy. 

Most leaders in Africa have already found the pressures too strong for 
token gestures and have had to go along with substantial reform. In Benin, 
Mattieu Kerekou, who had hoped to contain the democracy movement, lost 
control after the initiation of the National Conference of Active Forces and 
eventually lost his presidency in a popular election. In Ivory Coast, Felix 
Houphouët-Boigny, who had hoped to deal with the demand for pluralism with 
cosmetic changes, was eventually obliged to introduce a multiparty system, 
fight an election, and suffer considerable loss of prestige. Mobutu has had to 
release political prisoners and to accept a multi-party 
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system and electoral competition, although he still expects to manipulate the 
multiparty system and the election to ensure his survival in power. President 
Kaunda, who so adamantly opposed pluralism, eventually reconciled himself to 
a multiparty system and electoral competition. He fought an election and was 
resoundingly voted out of power. Zimbabwe has at last ended the state of 
emergency in effect since independence and has released all political prisoners. 
President Robert Mugabe found to his disappointment that even his own party, 
ZANU-PF (Zimbabwe African National Union-Patriotic Front), did not support 
his bid to change Zimbabwe into a one-party state, and in September 1990 he 
set aside his plans to make it a one-party state. In March 1990 Madagascar 
legalized a multiparty system; Niger did the same in July 1990. One of Africa's 
longest serving autocrats, President Moussa Traore of Mali, was forced out of 
office in March 1991 after twenty-three years in office. 

Some of the gains of democratization have been remarkable, particularly 
the peaceful transition to nonracial democracy in South Africa. Also notable is 
the successful transition to multiparty democracy in Malawi. Against all odds 
Mozambique had a successful multiparty election in 1994, and the prospects 
for further institutionalization of democracy look good. 

There have been remarkable reversals too, notably in Nigeria, Togo, 
Gambia, Rwanda, Zaire, Sudan, and Angola. With few exceptions the 
democratization has been shallow; typically, it takes the form of multiparty 
elections that are really more of a democratic process than a democratic 
outcome. Authoritarian state structures remain, accountability to the gov-
ernment is weak, and the rule of law is sometimes nominal. More often than 
not, people are voting without choosing. 

Most of Africa is still far from liberal democracy and further still from the 
participative social democracy that our paradigm envisages. However, there 
has been some impetus toward this particular kind of democracy. 

The impetus lies mainly in the internal motivation for democratization in 
Africa. The surge for democratization arises largely from the failure of 
development strategies in Africa and the politics associated with them. As 
noted earlier, in most of Africa, development was launched as an ideological 
blind by a leadership that was alienated and discredited. In their alienation 
African leaders became so repressive that the people began to see the state and 
its development agents as enemies to be evaded, cheated, or defeated, as 
circumstances permitted. In this atmosphere African leaders were obliged to 
operate with a siege mentality. They became so absorbed in mere survival that 
everything else, including development, was marginalized. 
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These circumstances were more conducive to regression than development, 
and that is precisely what occurred. The average annual growth rate of per 
capita income for Sub-Saharan Africa between 1973 and 1980 was a minimal 
0. 1 percent; between 1980 and 1989 it was -2.2 percent. On some social 
indicators Africans are worse off today than they were twenty years ago. While 
the development project floundered, political repression flourished. 

That is the background of the democracy movement in Africa. It opposes 
authoritarian elitism and the construction of development as a strategy of 
power and exploitation. It is bent on eliminating a leadership whose apparent 
incompetence and exploitative practices have become life threatening, a threat 
amply illustrated in Zaire, where per capita income in real terms is only a 
fraction of what it was when President Mobutu came to power twenty-seven 
years ago. Finally, the democracy movement in Africa is trying to initiate the 
kind of politics that will make development possible. 

The movement does not yet have an articulated political theory. From what 
can be pieced together, the movement views the economic regression of Africa 
as the other side of political repression. It insists that the cause of development 
is better served by a more democratic approach that engages the energy and the 
commitment of the people, who alone can make development sustainable. Its 
theory posits the inescapable connection of the political and the economic, and 
the priority of the political. That came out clearly in the Arusha conference. 
The African Charter for Popular Participation argues that the absence of 
democracy is the main cause of the crisis of underdevelopment in Africa: 
 

We affirm that nations cannot be built without the popular support and full 
participation of the people,  nor can the economic crisis be resolved and the 
human and economic conditions improved without the full and effective 
contribution, creativity and popular enthusiasm of the vast majority of the 
people. After all, it is to the people that the very benefits of development 
should and must accrue. We are convinced that neither can Africa's 
perpetual economic crisis be overcome, nor can a bright future for Africa 
and its people see the light of day unless the structure, pattern and political 
context of the process of socio-economic development are appropriately 
altered. 

We therefore have no doubt that at the heart of Africa's development 
objectives must lie the ultimate and overriding good of human-centered 
development that ensures the overall well-being of the people through  
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sustained improvement in their living standards and the full and effective 
participation of the people in charting their development policies, 
programmes and processes and contributing to their realization. We 
furthermore observe that given the current world political and economic 
situation, Africa is becoming further marginalized in world affairs, both 
geo-politically and economically. African countries must realize that, more 
than ever before, their greatest resource is their people and that it is 
through their active and full participation that Africa can surmount the 
difficulties that lie ahead.4 

 

In that passage one finds the awareness that gives urgency to the 
democracy movement in Africa: the notion that Africa's economic prob1cms 
are rooted in its politics and that a democratic revolution is needed to beat the 
crisis of underdevelopment. Africans are seeking democracy as a matter of 
survival; they believe that there are no alternatives to this quest, that they have 
nothing to lose and a great deal to gain. This awareness has grown in recent 
years as it has become more and more obvious that neither the indigenous 
political elites nor the multilateral development agencies are capable of dealing 
with the African crisis. 

Insofar as the democracy movement in Africa gets its impetus from the 
social and economic aspirations of people in Africa yearning for "a second 
independence from their leaders," it will be markedly different from liberal 
democracy. In all probability it will emphasize concrete economic and social 
rights rather than abstract political rights; it will insist on the democratization 
of economic opportunities, the social betterment of the people, and a strong 
social welfare system. To achieve these goals, it will have to be effectively 
participative and will have to draw on African traditions to adapt democracy to 
the cultural and historical experience of ordinary people. 

Such a people-driven democratization, however, will continue to be 
challenged by the elite-driven democratization that reduces democracy to 
multiparty electoral competition and generally exploits it as a strategy of 
power. It is by no means clear that the people-driven democracy will prevail. 
But it has a fair chance. 
 

The Development Strategy 
Development strategy is not a matter of drawing up an ideal blueprint but 

rather one of pragmatically devising a way of proceeding within the 
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constraints and possibilities of the realities on the ground, the realities that have 
been articulated and analyzed in the preceding chapters. The realities 
themselves are multifaceted, complicated, elusive, and in some respects 
contradictory, all of which suggests that proceeding by paying attention to the 
realities on the ground is not saying much. But they have been structured in the 
course of my analysis, insofar as the analysis has suggested which tendencies 
in the pursuit of development are desirable and which are undesirable and 
established a few principles or guidelines that need to be put into operation and 
some values that should be maximized. Before continuing the discussion of 
development strategy, I summarize these values and principles. 

A popular development strategy. The primary principle of development 
strategy in Africa is that the people have to be the agents, the means, and the 
end of development. This principle is the underpinning of all development 
policies; their mechanisms of implementation and the distribution of the 
benefits of development are fairly obvious. 

Self-reliance. To own their own development, people have to be selfreliant. 
As I have tried to show in the preceding pages, development cannot be 
received; it has to be experienced as participation in the process of bringing it 
about. In the past, self-reliance has been largely a posture against foreign 
domination, a protest against being dependent and in the control of foreigners. 
This concept is pertinent, but it misses the crucial point of self-reliance. 

Self-reliance is about responsibility: in the context of development, 
responsibility for producing a development project as well as providing the 
resources to carry it through. The embracing of self-reliance will be the real 
revolution of development in Africa. It is true that Africa's colonial history and 
its place in the world system have not been conducive to independence. But the 
other side of the coin is that, with minor exceptions, African leaders have 
preferred a cozy accommodation with dependence than the rigors of 
self-reliance, and they have usually accentuated dependence by their policies 
and behavior instead of reducing it. Breaking away from this colonial mentality 
and the lack of independence associated with it is as difficult as it is necessary. 

To realize development, self-reliance has to be practiced at all levels. 
Starting from the level of national policies and the relation between states, it 
must also spread to the level of regions, federal units (where they exist), 
communities, and households. At these local levels, too, the habit of 
dependence is very strong and somewhat contradicts the demand for local 
autonomy. And poverty and the weak sense of efficacy often associated  
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with it tend to compound the problem. But whatever the difficulties of 
self-reliance, it is nonetheless true that only when it is taken seriously at every 
level can development become feasible. 

Empowerment and confidence. Self-reliance requires much confidence. 
Lack of confidence is a serious problem; it may well be the greatest obstacle to 
the development of Africa. The problem is very deep and goes back a long 
way. To justify their barbaric assault on Africa, those who colonized it had to 
insist that Africans were less than human. They then proceeded to reduce 
Africans to a condition in which they would deserve to be colonized, deserve 
the dubious redemption of the civilizing mission. The humiliations of 
colonization in the colonial era, and the slavery before it, virtually destroyed 
the confidence of Africans, especially educated urban Africans. 

Matters have not been helped by the performance of most African leaders 
in three decades of independence. With few exceptions their rule has been 
notable for oppression, corruption, social disorganization, the demise of the 
development project, and growing poverty. The performance reinforces the 
negative view of Africa in a vicious circle of negativity and diminishing 
self-esteem. By all indications, despite the brave talk about forging ahead 
through a sea of problems, most African leaders are demoralized. But 
development is a historical enterprise that requires high seriousness and 
enormous self-confidence, qualities extremely difficult to attain in Africa's 
present circumstances. 

This confidence will not be created by posturing against former colonial 
masters or by verbal exhortations. It will require something more tangible, 
especially increasing capabilities and concrete achievement. It will have to be 
created on substantive success, in particular the success of selfreliant 
development projects at every level of the society. It is helpful if, initially, 
success is perceivable in the material improvement of the lot of people 
involved in the development project. The development strategy for Africa will 
also have to be a strategy for incremental improvement of capabilities and 
self-esteem at all levels of society. 

Self-realization rather than alienation. If the people possess their own 
development, the development process will not turn into an exercise in 
alienation, as has been the case in much of Africa. What is happening now is 
an attempt to develop against the people-a strategy characterized by 
appropriating the people's right to develop themselves. 

As noted, the old strategies assume all too readily that the people and their 
way of life is the problem, so that attacking the problem blends into attacking 
the people and their way of life. When the people themselves 
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are made the problem, rather than the process of development, development is 
derailed. At that point it becomes an exercise in alienation at best and a violent 
assault on people at worst. 

What is needed is to move away from the fixation on how Africa ought to 
be and how to force-feed Africa into that state of being. Development must 
take the people not as they ought to be but as they are and try to find how the 
people can move forward by their own efforts, in accordance with their own 
values. 
 

Agricultural Strategy 
If the people are the agents, the means and the end of development, then 

development has to be construed initially as rural development generally and 
more specifically as agricultural development. More than 70 percent of the 
peoples of Africa are rural dwellers who get their livelihood largely from 
agricultural activity. It is in agricultural activity that they can immediately 
participate in economic development; it is the sphere in which they have skills 
and experience to offer and in which they can most profit by enhancement. But 
there are other reasons for conceiving development initially as agricultural 
development, reasons clearly stated in a 1993 World Bank study: 
 

Other productive sectors are relatively small. Agriculture provided 32 
percent of Gross Domestic Product (GDP) on average in 1990. Without 
agricultural growth at 4 percent per annum, the generally most competitive 
industrial sector (agro-industry) will not be supplied with the raw material 
to permit it to grow by its target rate of 5 to 7 percent per annum. Analysis 
undertaken for Sub-Saharan Africa (SSA) found that agricultural growth is 
the most important contributor to the growth of manufacturing and 
services. Agriculture is the major source of raw material for industry, is a 
main purchaser of simple tools (farm implements), is a purchaser of 
services (farm mechanics, transport), and farmers are the main consumers 
of consumption goods produced locally. Agricultural production will 
remain the most important element for addressing food security and 
poverty, since most of the poor and the food-insecure are rural people. 
Agriculture is the largest private sector in Africa. Stimulating the private 
sector means stimulating agriculture and agriculturally-related industry. 
Improving the well-being of 
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women, whose principal economic acitivity remains farming, means in 
large part helping them to become better farmers.5 

 

The study then outlines a strategy of agricultural development. It says that 
"the pillar of a new strategy is to undertake policy change necessary to make 
agriculture, agro-industry and related services profitable. This profitability will 
be the main element to stimulate the private sector (including small farmers) to 
invest in agriculture, agro-industry, livestock, marketing, input supply, and 
credit."6 

What is needed is not a strategy whose overriding concern or thrust is to 
make agriculture profitable. Rather, what is needed is a strategy that 
encourages farmers to do what they are doing better, to be more efficient and 
more productive, a strategy that is conducive to the realization of those 
interests that led them to farming in the first place. Encouraging farmers to do 
better also entails empowering them, making them more skillful, more 
confident, giving them more access to the things they need to be more efficient. 
This can be done in several ways. 

Bringing the farmer to the center. The first element of this strategy is for 
the farmer to move to the center of agricultural policy. An essential preliminary 
is to initiate a policy dialogue among farmers, and between farmers and 
officials, on the need, the desirability, and means of improving the efficiency 
and productivity of farmers and increasing the benefits that accrue to them 
from farming. This dialogue could be held at all levels-groups of households, 
communities, villages, cooperatives, farmers, associations, rural improvement 
associations, and so forth. It should be open ended so that the farmers have a 
real opportunity to make decisions instead of participating only to legitimize 
the preconceptions of officials. If the dialogue proceeds in this way, the 
problem of agricultural development begins to be a problem of the farmers 
rather than that of ministry officials, and when solutions emerge, They will 
also be the farmers own solutions. They will be responsible for the succcess or 
failure of development; they will understand their risks and benefits and will be 
highly motivated to increase the latter. 

Bringing in the farmers to the center of policy will also remove the 
constraints that prevent them from taking charge or even participating 
effectively. These constraints include the regulation of what the farmers can 
produce, when and how they can produce it, what they can sell, where they 
may sell and for how much. These constraints have not only 
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marginalized farmers; they have proved to be a strong disincentive to 
agricultural productivity. 

Infrastructure support for farming activities. In Africa the ability of 
farmers to do what they are already doing more efficiently will require 
improving rural infrastructure, especially roads, water supply, electricity, 
markets, transportation, and energy. The history of agricultural development in 
every part of the world, including East Asia and India, underlines the special 
importance of rural infrastructure. Supporters of infrastructure improvement in 
rural Africa make the same point. A good example is the surge in agricultural 
growth in Nigeria in the late 1980s as a result of the creation of the Directorate 
of Food, Roads and Rural Infrastructure (DFRRI). 

Somehow rural infrastructure in Africa has continued to be grossly 
neglected despite wide knowledge of its impact on agricultural development. 
For instance, it is estimated that in West Africa rural road density is only about 
32 m/km2, and only 36 m/km2 in eastern and southern Africa. In contrast, parts 
of India with comparative population densities have a road density of about 
730 m/km2.7 Rural infrastructure was poor enough but has greatly deteriorated 
in the past decade as a result of the fiscal crisis of African states. 

One serious problem is that most rural families in Africa do not have easy 
access to safe water. The water provider of the family, usually a woman, could 
easily spend as many as two hours a day on the chore of fetching water. 
Fetching firewood, also usually done by a woman, takes about as much time. 
Therefore, just obtaining water and basic energy, which should be taken for 
granted, reduce a woman's farming activities and her productivity. 

It is necessary to acknowledge the serious resource constraints on the 
improvement of rural infrastructure in Africa. These constraints will not allow 
wholesale improvement in the short to medium term. Nonetheless, 
considerable improvement can be made by correcting the elite-urban bias in 
development expenditures. Also, the constraints can serve a positive function 
by compelling more imaginative thinking; for example, the use of community 
effort to provide infrastructure that expresses the people's self-reliance and 
possession of their own development. Self-reliant development of rural 
infrastructure will in turn enhance rural capabilities and confidence and 
improve the prospects of adequate maintenance of that infrastructure. 
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Technology. To do what they are already doing better, African agricultural 
producers need better technologies. The scope for improving farmers' 
productivity is enormous, since their level of technological backing is currently 
very low, often inappropriate, and made available in ways that are frequently 
counterproductive. 

Here again the critical factor is putting the farmer in charge. Everybody, 
including the World Bank and the IMF, recognizes the need to elicit the 
participation of farmers. This concern is evident in several World Bank 
publications.8 But this awareness has not had the policy impact that it might be 
expected to have. 

The concept of participation needs to be translated into that of "centering" 
the farmer. Current participative approaches are still limited to consulting, 
eliciting input, helping, and empowering. All these are desirable, but they need 
to go further, to centering. In the context of the issue under consideration here, 
namely, enhancing agricultural productivity by technology, the first point is for 
farmers to own their development, including the means by which it is pursued. 
As noted, the process of owning development is an important aspect of what it 
means to be developing. 

In the sphere of technology policy for agricultural development, it is easy 
to reduce the notion of "centering" the farmer to the formality of perfunctory 
consultation with or responsiveness to farmers, partly because of presumptions 
about technology's being a sphere of expertise and about the ignorance of 
farmers in this area. Because of these dispositions it is necessary to clarify 
what putting the farmers in charge entails. Doing so does not romanticize 
farmers; it does not assume that their knowledge and practices are always right. 
It assumes not only that their views will be decisive but also that any particular 
view will be tested and amended as desirable, if possible by interaction with 
the views of other farmers and specialists such as agronomists and extension 
workers. 

Taking farmers seriously must also mean assuming that, like everyone else, 
they are sometimes misguided, mistaken, confused, and self-defeating even in 
pursuing what they perceive to be their interests. The extension worker may 
well have better knowledge about certain aspects of farming, but it is the 
farmer who is doing the farming and whose development is at issue; it is up to 
the specialist to convince the farmer to adopt his or her idea. Ideas so adopted 
in open-ended equal exchange do not compromise the principle of centering 
the farmer. But they are not compatible 
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with extension service bureaucracies. Extension services need to be integrated 
into farmers' organizations as special units accountable to the organizations. 

The other side of possessing development is being responsible for its costs. 
This principle is incompatible with dependence on government handouts. Even 
in rural agriculture and among poor farmers who are barely surviving, the 
principle of self-reliance should be built into strategies for making the farmer 
more productive. Possessing development entails paying for it. Even poor 
farmers should "pay"; they should be self-reliant as much as possible even if it 
means paying in kind, labor, or services. They will take what they are paying 
for far more seriously; they will be motivated to greater productivity as they try 
to maximize returns on their investment. Paying enhances self-esteem and 
empowerment; it means possessing development and taking responsibility. 
Indeed, paying is an important aspect of what development is. Therefore, it 
cannot on principle be set aside even among the very poor. 

Human resources development. Helping farmers to do better involves more 
than anything else the continuous enhancement of their quality as a resource 
for development. That calls for a development strategy which invests in human 
resource development, especially in education, health, management 
capabilities, and skill development and improvement. Healthy, educated, and 
skillful farmers are more productive and are more likely to make income gains 
and to expand the range of options available to them. 

General national investment in social infrastructure, particularly basic 
services such as primary schools and primary health care, is an asset to 
agricultural development because the poor, who get a disproportionate share of 
those benefits, are largely subsistence farmers. 

Apart from such national catchall policies, it is also necessary to address 
the human development needs of groups with special needs, rather on the lines 
of the World Bank's Program of Targeted Interventions.9 For instance, most of 
Africa's farmers are women, but apart from being the farmer, the woman also 
has the enormous responsibilities of bearing children and managing the 
household with its time-consuming chores. Women need education relevant to 
their needs and a health system that addresses their reproductive needs and 
reproductive health. Given women's demanding multiple roles in Africa, a 
program of human resource development should also be concerned with saving 
time and making their 
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chores less onerous by simple technologies and better access to services and 
facilities such as water supply and cheap energy. 

Even in the area of social infrastructure, it is necessary to be sensitive to 
principles of possession and self-reliance. The expectation is not that farmers 
will on their own design and set up primary health care systems or educational 
systems and also finance them. If they could do so, it would of course be 
desirable. What can reasonably be expected is that the human resource units 
will be accountable to the people who will set their agendas. But the farming 
organizations and communities also have to be responsible for the successful 
operation of the human resource units and contribute to it even as they receive 
from it, as particular historical circumstance permit; for instance, for certain 
training programs a participant could pay by training another person. 

As much as possible, even in conditions of poverty, nothing should be free. 
To repeat, this principle derives not from attachment to market forces but from 
the idea that development is, among other things, paying one's way. There is 
also the practical consideration that paying sets a rigorous standard for social 
infrastructure projects that will probably eliminate weak projects likely to fail. 
The benefits of a project have to be clear, concrete, and relevant before 
ordinary people can bring themselves to pay for it. Needless to say, there are 
circumstances in which payment will not be feasible, and demand for payment 
inappropriate. 
 

Selection of Projects by Impact 
The breakthrough in development comes when ordinary people become 

confident that self-development is feasible. A well-conceived development 
strategy will strive to achieve this threshold as soon as possible. It is all the 
more important for the people to see the feasibility and fruits of 
self-development quickly, because they are paying for it. To achieve this 
threshold quickly, development strategy has to place special emphasis on 
projects that can have a clear, concrete, and positive impact in the short run; for 
instance, a macroeconomic framework that removes price distortions that 
penalize farmers, and supportive extension services, including supply of inputs 
and food security programs. 

However, strategy cannot simply be geared to the short run. The impor-
tance of quick results has to be balanced against projects that are critical for 
agricultural development but that produce benefits more slowly, in the medium 
term or even the long term. Medium-term projects of, say, one to five years, 
such as roads, irrigation, land tenure reform, and soil 
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conservation, are too important to be shelved just because their benefits will 
take longer to realize. Much the same thing might be said for long-term 
projects like educational and health projects. The need for an immediate impact 
must be reconciled with the need for longer-term projects. The mix of projects 
will vary from place to place, reflecting the needs, problems, and prospects of 
particular situations. 

The process of enabling the farmer to do better will also have to be given 
specificity in terms of the characteristics of the ecological zones that define, 
often definitively, the constraints on agricultural development and what might 
be done about it. According to a 1989 World Bank study, there are five broad 
ecological zones: the humid tropical zone of West and central Africa, where 
the main constraint on agriculture is soil fertility; the subhumid zone of West 
Africa, which is sparsely populated and where the major problem is labor 
supply; the sorghum and millet belt of West Africa, where lack of water is the 
principal constraint; the savannah zone of eastern and southern Africa, where 
there are labor-supply problems in the wetter regions and low-rainfall problems 
in other areas; and the Highlands of eastern Africa, which are very densely 
populated and suffer from a shortage of land. In the Highlands agricultural 
development greatly depends on finding and applying technologies that 
increase the intensity of land use.10 

 

The Smallholder Focus 
Development strategy cannot be effective unless its implications are 

worked through institutional settings, including production units, labor 
institutions, organizational structures, and social and cultural settings. Since 
most farmers in Africa are smallholder farmers, policy has to begin by focusing 
on this productive unit and the basic productive unit associated with it-namely, 
the household economy. The thrust of policy in Africa has been rather hostile 
to the household economy and smallholder farming, which are considered 
regressive forms whose disappearance is a necessary condition of economic 
growth. The household economy, in particular, has been attacked implicitly but 
determinedly for producing essentially use values rather than exchange values, 
for hindering the capitalization of agriculture, and for perpetuating a scale of 
operation and a technological level that are not conducive to high productivity. 
Whatever its limitations, as long as the household is the basic economic unit in 
rural 
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Africa and invariably the institutional basis of smallholder agriculture, 
development strategy has to accept its validity and build on it. 

Building on it will not be without problems. For instance, the extent to 
which productivity can be increased in the household economy is limited by 
the cellular structure of households, their independence from one another, their 
inward orientation, and their limited specialization. Building on that economy 
will entail dealing with its constraints and changing it. Such change will occur 
according to the democratic will of those whose life-style is at issue; it will 
mean not their alienation but their self-development. It will be change without 
trauma, without external coercion, and in accordance with the desires and 
interests of the people for whom the household economy is an important way 
of life. 

In the African context, the household economy, though it has not found 
favor among development managers, is an important indigenous institution that 
deserves special attention. The features of this economy are interesting. It is an 
economy concerned with reproduction rather than production, and it follows 
the law of subsistence rather than the law of value. Because the household 
economy is such an important part of what Africans are today, development 
strategies should have been building on it. Indeed, it offers good prospects for 
sustainable development. Failure to explore it along those lines is rather 
surprising. The household economy has the characteristics and values that 
development is supposed to realize for the African economy on the national 
level, especially self-reliance, internal balance, self-sufficiency, and autocentric 
dynamics. 

The model of the household economy might have helped to avoid one of 
the appalling disasters of the development experience in Africa; namely, the 
food dependence of an overwhelmingly rural population that has land of 
acceptable fertility and adequate grazing. Between 1971 and 1980 agricultural 
output grew 1.6 percent a year, while population grew 2.8 percent a year; the 
food self-sufficiency ratio dropped from 98 percent in the 1960s to 86 percent 
in the 1980s and continued to decline through 1984. Today, 20 percent of 
Africa's population depends on food imports, which increased at an average 
annual rate of 8.4 percent between 1970 and 1980. 

The African household economy forces attention on food self-sufficiency. 
That is its natural tendency, since it is concerned with reproduction rather than 
production and follows the law of subsistence. Given the constraints of the 
household economy, using the model of this economy on the national level 
would not have brought an impressive rate of growth. But it would have helped 
Africa to feed itself. It would have given African 
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economies some internal balance. If a national economy had been moved in 
these directions, its growth and development, modest as they might be, would 
at least have been decidedly sustainable, because they would have been largely 
internalized. 

It is important to emphasize that the internalization of growth dynamics is 
the hallmark of sustainable development, something that is often ignored in 
theory and practice. Thus prevailing definitions of sustainable development, 
especially those used by international development agencies, make no 
reference to autocentric dynamics. At the level of practice, development 
strategies in Africa display little or no interest in maximizing internal balance 
and autocentric dynamics. This attitude could be due to the tragic enormity of 
the African crisis, which has diverted attention to emergency measures for 
survival. But if the crisis explains emergency programs such as APPER and 
UNPAAERD, the commanding role of the International Monetary Fund, and 
structural adjustment programs, it hardly explains why, for instance, the 
structural adjustment programs are so rigidly bent on external balance instead 
of internal balance. 

Like the household economy, smallholder agriculture has often been 
regarded as an obstacle to progress, a prejudice heightened by the experience 
of many countries such as France, Great Britain, and Germany, where rapid 
economic growth was usually associated with moving away from smallholder 
farming. The traditional prejudice against smallholder farming and peasants is 
so strong that considerable violence has often been used to destroy this way of 
life, the most notable being the enclosure movement in Britain in the 
nineteenth century and the liquidation of the kulaks by Stalin. 

Some analysts believe that Africa cannot begin rapid economic growth 
until the small farmer is liquidated or "captured."11 The vast majority of 
smallholders would not wish their own violent liquidation on the presumed 
rationality of alien values, but rather would wish the improvement of their lot, 
taking themselves as they are, not as some development agent might want them 
to be. 

In any event, the case for a smallholder focus is not simply its inevitability 
as the choice of an essentially smallholder community but its validity as the 
way of proceeding with development. For if development must take people as 
they are and regard them as its end, then the smallholder strategy is the proper 
way to begin. 

It is interesting that the smallholder approach has been more successful 



in Africa than the much-favored commercial agriculture. African governments- 
for instance, Nigeria-are increasingly acknowledging the disastrous outcomes 
of their ventures into large-scale commercial farming, although the rising tide 
of self-criticism hardly leads to radical breaks from the old policies. To its 
credit, the World Bank has gone much further than most African governments 
in the adoption of a smallholder farm development policy. What is more, 
unlike most African governments, the Bank did not merely drift into that policy 
but accepted it as a well-reasoned conclusion. A 1988 study presents this 
argument: 
 

In most African countries where non-farm employment is still limited and 
the opportunity cost of labor is low, the economies of small farm size 
out-weigh the economies of scale. This is primarily because agricultural 
production is a biological process spread out in time and in space which 
gives rise to costly problems in recruiting and supervising a large work 
force. Furthermore, centralized decision-making and the exercise of 
initiative and judgment is especially important in farming in Africa 
because of the unpredictable variations in weather and other exogenous 
sources of uncertainty. Because family members have a claim on the 
production of the farm rather than receiving a fixed wage, they have strong 
incentives to work hard and exercise initiative and judgment. Finally, it 
needs to be stressed that a major advantage of pursuing a broad-based 
small farm development strategy is that it generates a pattern of growth of 
farm incomes and of effective demand for non-farm goods and services 
that stimulates more rapid growth of output and employment than would 
be obtained from a large farm strategy.12 

 

In practice, the World Bank is somewhat ambivalent, however. It dis-
courages very small farms and investment on farm holdings of the very poor 
that are considered "economically inefficient." Apparently what the Bank 
really wants are middle-level farms: "The growth of a class of medium-sized 
moderately well-off farms is to be encouraged particularly if they emerge from 
the smaller farming community, as opposed to absentee farmers working in 
urban areas who purchase medium-sized land holdings which they proceed to 
operate inefficiently."13 
 

Constraints of the Smallholder Approach 
The smallholder approach is by no means an ideal local unit for agricul-

tural development. It has some constraints. To begin with, it can be a 
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difficult, complex, and expensive approach in African conditions. For instance, 
it needs many supporting organizational structures: farmers' organizations at all 
levels, joint committees of farmers' groups and extension workers, 
cooperatives, self-help projects, and so on. Apart from that, a large number of 
institutions will be needed to service those structures, and this may mean a 
proliferation of agricultural development-related institutions of government, 
nongovernmental organizations, international development agencies, 
international financial institutions, and so forth. The complexity and 
multiplicity of such organizations and the slow pace of democratic 
arrangements cause some resistance to the strategy of this development policy 
option. Although these problems may be reduced, they cannot be eliminated, 
for they are inherent in the strategy of making development a living 
experience. 

The values of the agricultural strategy of the paradigm that have been 
outlined here assume the necessity and desirability of smallholder agriculture. 
That comes from the commitment of taking people as they are and not as they 
ought to be. To do so does not imply that smallholder agriculture will be 
sustainable in the future or even that it is desirable that it should be. The point 
is to recognize that some smallholder farming is the material base of the lives 
of most Africans and to build on it. The assumption is that development ought 
to be democratic and allow rural people to improve the situation they have 
instead of abolishing it for an uncertain alternative. Unlike a policy that tried to 
make agriculture profitable by unleashing market forces, the smallholder 
approach would be more tolerant of the inefficiencies caused by intervention 
against the market, as might be necessary from time to time. Those 
inefficiencies can be a serious problem, considering the meagerness of the 
resources of African countries. But the problem is mitigated to some degree by 
the fact that the strategy recommended here puts emphasis on paying, even by 
the poor-paying in spite of the strain of doing so, since the experience of 
self-reliance is part of what development is. 

Another problem is that the emphasis on the privileges of smallholder 
farming offers limited scope for the realization of economies of scale. Not only 
that, the scale of smallholder agriculture might discourage the use of certain 
useful technologies such as tractors. But this problem is not as serious as it 
seems. It can be reduced somewhat by aggregating people into bigger units 
such as cooperatives for the purpose of sharing technologies, extension serves, 
collecting centers, and physical infrastructure. 

Furthermore, the limitation of scale of smallholder farming and the land 
tenure systems associated with it could in one sense be an important 
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advantage. If improvements create a demand for more farmland that cannot be 
met, attention is likely to be directed to intensification. A prime cause of the 
Green Revolution in Asia was the need for intensity arising from a shortage of 
land. In Africa, land scarcity, with notable exceptions, was not a problem until 
the 1980s; the shifting of cultivation associated with land abundance has 
hitherto discouraged agricultural intensity. Now shifting cultivation is being 
rapidly abandoned, and the move to intensity has already begun, with some 
promising results in Kenya, Nigeria, and Zimbabwe, for instance. The scale 
constraints of the smallholder strategy and diminishing land availability are 
also opportunities for technological intensity, which has enormous potential for 
developing agriculture in Africa. 

Finally, small-scale farming is not advocated to the exclusion of everything 
else, especially large-scale commercial farming. What is important is that 
agricultural policy should generate the impetus to development by 
concentrating resources at the base, that is, on farmers who are, over-
whelmingly smallholder farmers. There is no objection to large-scale agri-
culture in principle. The practical objection to it is that, reflecting the elitist 
bent in African development strategies, large-scale farming and even 
large-scale agricultural parastatals have tended to attract a grossly dispro-
portionate share of the development budget going to agriculture, and they have 
usually been too inefficient to justify the resources going into them. If large 
private farmers could be efficient and profitable without requiring enormous 
public expenditure to create and maintain their "enabling environment," they 
would be very useful. 

Indeed, such commercial farms could be supportive of the smallholder 
farming community in important ways; for instance, intervening in national 
policy to ensure a macroeconomic framework favorable to agricultural 
development. They would open up national and international markets, develop 
the labor market, and stimulate the development of agricultural infrastructure, 
agricultural research, and agricultural technology; they would promote the 
linking of agricultural development and industrialization by their demand for 
technologies and their expansion into agro-based industries such as food 
processing. 
 

Rural Industrialization 
If, as suggested here, one assimilates the concept of development into the 

idea of rural development, the traditional dichotomy between agriculture and 
industrialization will tend to disappear. Industrialization 
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will then begin as rural industrialization, a part of the process of rural 
development. 

The failure to proceed in this manner has been a serious impediment to 
agricultural and industrial development in Africa. Prevailing strategies have 
been concerned with import substitution, export promotion, and huge basic 
industrial projects like iron and steel and petrochemicals. A policy of rural 
industrialization integrated with agricultural development as part of a strategy 
of rural development would be a better alternative. Industrialization would be 
pursued mainly on the basis of self-reliance, fueled primarily from the incomes 
of farmers and the multiplier effect of the linkages between farm and non-farm 
activities. 

Immense opportunities exist for improving agricultural technology to the 
benefit of both agriculture and industrialization. For centuries African 
agriculture has been dominated by hoes, wooden paddles for threshing, and 
machetes. New simple technologies such as seeders, ox-plows, and inter-row 
weeders could be introduced. Being scale neutral, they could be manufactured 
in small lots, locally, to the advantage of farmers and rural industrialization. 

There are forward linkages as well; for example, food processing, brewing, 
and packaging. The untapped potential here is enormous. Finally, there are 
large opportunities in consumer-demand linkages. Rises in farm incomes 
increase the demand for consumer goods such as shoes, clothes, furniture, 
building materials, and new kinds of food. This demand promotes 
industrialization, and the availability of the consumer goods provides a strong 
incentive for increased agricultural productivity. 

As these forward, backward, and consumer-demand linkages expand, there 
will be greater integration of rural and urban development. Urban development 
will at first be primarily about the informal sector, which employs the vast 
majority of urban dwellers in Africa. As with rural industrialization, the 
concern is to enable people to be more productive in what they are doing, to 
encourage movement to higher technological levels. The levels of education 
and technology are the same. Rural industries and the informal sector will be 
producing similar goods under roughly similar conditions for the same market. 

This approach to industrialization will markedly improve the possibility of 
development. It proceeds in daily response to the practical needs of the people; 
it is endogenous and self-reliant; it is not driven by foreign loans, foreign 
technology, foreign investment, or foreign trade; it relies on an assured and 
gradually expanding domestic market; it obliterates 
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the dichotomy between industry and agriculture, urban and rural, and promotes 
internal balance and autocentrism. 
 

Complementary Policies 
Clearly, by conventional standards, "inefficiencies" exist in this strategy: 

for instance, its call for participation could be time consuming and expensive. 
It could engender a multiplicity of institutions with complicated relations. At 
the level considered here, education is low, physical infrastructure is very poor 
or nonexistent, savings are low or nonexistent, and effective demand is low. 
Such are hardly the conditions that will lead to rapid economic growth in the 
short or medium term. 

However, these factors may be "inefficiencies" relative to the goal of 
economic growth but not relative to development. They are part of what it 
takes to put development into operation, a lived experience in which the people 
are the agents, the means, and the ends of social transformation for their greater 
well-being. Nonetheless, it is desirable that a clear commitment to 
development in that sense is, as much as possible, reconciled to more rapid 
economic growth. 

The sector of smallholder farms is usually marginal in African economies. 
Control of African economies tends to be vested in the urban enclaves, 
especially in the hands of government, a small private sector, and 
multinationals. The strategy advocated here presupposes democratization of 
sufficient depth to overcome not only the urban bias in African development 
strategies but also a drastic shift in development expenditures away from the 
urban enclaves to the rural areas. That will be difficult. The indications are that, 
although the rural share of development expenditures will increase, the bulk of 
the economic surplus will be in the control of the leaders of the urban enclaves. 

While the relationship between these enclaves might have been 
exploitative in the past, it need not be so. If the politics and economic policies 
are right, these enclaves will complement the rural sector and contribute to the 
acceleration of its economic growth. The management of the more powerful 
enclave economy has to be an important part of the strategy of the residual 
option. These will include: 

- Creating a stable macroeconomic framework that will provide positive 
incentives to farmers. 

- Attracting strategic foreign direct investment, which will give countries 
more access to capital, managerial know-how, and technology. This 
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is all the more necessary because large commercial borrowing is not a viable 
option for African countries in view of their indebtedness, debt crisis, and 
unstable macroeconomic framework. 

- Engineering competitiveness through better infrastructure and appropriate 
exchange rate, tariff regime, and labor market policies. 

- Providing carefully targeted government intervention to assist export 
industries. 

- Encouraging policies that reconcile growth with distribution, as was the 
case in East Asia. 

Such policies greatly contributed to the phenomenal growth of the East 
Asian countries, as the World Bank's The East Asian Miracle (1993) has 
shown. But Africa's conditions, especially political constraints on the adoption 
of these policies, underscore once more the political underpinnings of the 
persistence of underdevelopment in Africa. One remarkable feature of 
development in East Asia was a de facto social compact made among the elites 
and between the elites and the people: "First, leaders had to convince economic 
elites to support pro-growth policies. Then they had to persuade the elites to 
share the benefits of growth with the middle class and the poor. Finally, to win 
the cooperation of the middle class and the poor, the leaders had to show them 
that they would indeed benefit from future growth."14 

The political class had a clear development project and the discipline to 
carry out this elaborate social compact, achieving the best record ever of 
growth with distribution: "For the eight HPAEs [high-performing Asian 
economies], rapid growth and declining inequality have been shared virtues, as 
comparisons over time of equality and growth ... illustrate. The developing 
HPAEs clearly outperform other middle income economies in that they have 
both lower levels of inequality and higher levels of growth. Moreover 
improvements in income distribution generally coincided with periods of rapid 
growth."15 

The distributive growth was achieved by a mix of policies with varying 
emphasis in each country. All of them invested heavily in human capital, 
especially in education and health. For instance, in South Korea, expenditure 
per pupil in real terms rose by 355 per cent between 1970 and 1989. 
Investment is redistributive because the poor benefit disproportionally more 
from investment in basic social infrastructure, including benefits in upward 
mobility. Distribution was also pursued through land reform. In China and 
Taiwan land was taken from landlords with some compensation 
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and sold to the tillers on favorable terms such as easy credit. In South Korea, in 
1947 the government redistributed land originally held by the Japanese rulers 
of the country, and beginning in 1950 the government took over land from 
landlords and distributed it to 900,000 tenants. Redistribution also took the 
form of generous support for small-scale and medium-scale enterprises, 
support that was both distributive and productive. Some of the HPAEs 
redistributed through social welfare programs such as public housing, in 
particular Singapore and Hong Kong. By 1987 "more than 40 percent of the 
population in Hong Kong lived in public housing"; in Singapore, "today, 80 
percent of the population lives in public housing and more than 90 percent of 
the families in public housing own their units."16 

Distributive growth was only one aspect of the discipline of the political 
class in East Asia in pursuing the development project. Discipline was also 
evident in the creation of a class of highly competent technocrats to manage the 
project, insulating them politically, according them high social status, and 
giving them room to be creative in a strict meritocracy. It was evident even in 
the interventions of the political class in the economy; for instance, special 
incentives to business, especially in the export sector, were granted on a 
competitive basis and maintained on the basis of performance. 

These kinds of policies would not be possible under most governments in 
contemporary Africa, even with the best of intentions. The political class in 
Africa typically lacks coherence. More often than not, it is riddled with 
factionalism and strong centrifugal tendencies associated with the inculcation 
of parochial loyalties that are exploited for economic and political power. The 
public sphere is a battlefield where parochial groups and interest groups 
struggle for power relentlessly, and sometimes violently. In this context, the 
state is chronically unstable, usually privatized, corrupt, and inefficient, and 
largely incapable of carrying out a development project. 

So a huge political gap exists between the African and the East Asian 
experience. This difference says something about the importance of political 
variables, since, even within authoritarian political systems, political 
differences can make critical differences in the prospects for economic growth. 

In East Asia, political authoritarianism has been associated with a crystal-
lized political class that is highly disciplined and is in turn able to maintain 
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discipline in polity and economy. More important, this political class was 
highly committed to the development project and so disciplined that it was able 
to realize some of the economically functional values of democracy such as 
accountability, transparency, the rule of law, and negotiated consensus. For 
instance, the social compact that promoted growth with equity in this region 
was a product of negotiated consensus as well as a sense of accountability to 
the public interest. In all eight countries, economic incentives, such as special 
export credits, have been granted on markedly transparent and competitive 
procedures. The way in which all the countries have maintained financial 
discipline and a stable competition oriented macroeconomic framework attests 
to a basic commitment to the rule of law and the relative autonomy of the state. 

In Africa, political authoritarianism has been detrimental to economic 
growth and even political stability. It has been associated with arbitrariness, 
lack of transparency, rent seeking, and the dissociation of performance from 
reward. 

Appearances notwithstanding, however, the response to this situation 
should be not a more development-friendly authoritarianism in Africa but 
democratization. For if the rule of law, transparency, accountability, equity, 
and consensus building are desirable, they should not be contingent on the will 
of the elites, as was true in much of East Asia. It is better to have arrangements 
that render their realization objectively necessary. And that is what democracy 
does, albeit with limitations. Besides, democracy is part of what development 
is about, and as noted, it cannot wait. 
 

Conclusion 
Sub-Saharan Africa is mired in one of the deepest and most protracted 

crises of modem history. This crisis has been phenomenally harsh, tragic, and 
demoralizing. But it has also been an invaluable learning experience. It has 
taught Africa a great deal about how not to go about development and even a 
little about how to do it. Pushed to the brink, ordinary people in Africa have 
apparently realized that they must take their destiny into their own hands, and 
they are struggling for a "second independence." They have apparently 
recognized that they cannot escape from underdevelopment until public policy 
becomes an expression of their democratic will and connects again with social 
needs. 

Not many people view the development of Africa as a viable proposition. 
This is not surprising. The world has been mesmerized by the dismal statistics 
of declining productivity and growth rates, escalating indebtedness,  
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and chronic malnutrition, famine, and disease. The high incidence of political 
instability and violent conflict in some parts of Africa, such as Burundi, 
Rwanda, Liberia, Somalia, Sudan, and Sierra Leone, has not helped matters. 
Nevertheless, the development project has not failed in Africa, It just never 
started in the first place because of hostile political conditions. It can start and 
it can succeed. The disasters of the past have been useful lessons, awareness is 
developing, and objective conditions in the world now make self-reliance 
increasingly inevitable and desirable; ordinary people are in revolt and 
demanding a second independence. They are struggling to take control of their 
own lives from a leadership whose mismanagement has become life 
threatening for them. The struggle over the political framework that will enable 
the development project to finally take off is now in progress, and the 
prospects for development are promising. 
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